

INDEX NO.: GDC82	BID NO.: RS991029				OPENING DATE: 12/13/19				PRODUCT/SERVICE: AGGREGATE																																												
VENDOR NO.	ANNUAL				1				2				3				4				5				6				7				8				9				10												
VENDOR NAME	EST. R.L. Underwood				Tatum Landscaping				Fountain Management				Ebony Construction Co., Inc.				Approved Components & Systems, Inc.				Vanguard Systems				Salles Wholesale Construction Inc.				JEM Industrial Maint. Corp.				Gerken Materials, Inc.				The Custer Stone Co.																
DEL OFFERED	USAGE/				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest				FOB Dest																
LOC. BY STATE	UOM EA				OH				OH				OH				OH				OH				OH				OH				OH				OH																
ITEM/Description		Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price
DISTRICT 1																																																					
NATURAL SAND	TON	1,000	\$24.000	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$37,140.000	\$28.000	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$41,390.000	\$16.860	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$29,810.000	\$9.500	\$8.750	\$0.800	\$38,250.000	\$27.600	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$40,170.000	\$41.600	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$51,510.000	\$36.590	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$45,623.000	\$34.470	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$42,900.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!			
CONCRETE SAND	TON	700	\$24.000	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$25,998.000	\$25.000	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$26,873.000	\$16.860	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$20,867.000	\$9.500	\$8.750	\$0.800	\$26,775.000	\$27.600	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$28,119.000	\$41.600	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$36,957.000	\$36.590	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$31,936.100	\$34.470	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$30,030.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
#304 LIMESTONE	TON	20	\$16.600	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$874.800	\$18.600	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$939.800	\$18.480	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$628.800	\$16.350	\$6.600	\$0.400	\$899.000	\$31.020	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$28.710.000	\$31.900	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$636.200	\$28.070	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$742.060	\$26.450	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$697.600	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
#411 LIMESTONE	TON	450	\$16.600	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$12,933.000	\$18.600	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$14,385.000	\$18.480	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$14,148.000	\$16.350	\$6.600	\$0.400	\$14,827.500	\$31.020	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$19,915.500	\$28.700	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$17,374.500	\$21.960	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$13,960.350	\$20.710	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$13,113.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
#7 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	350	\$21.300	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$12,054.000	\$24.300	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$13,191.500	\$21.760	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$12,148.500	\$22.750	\$6.600	\$0.400	\$13,727.500	\$29.820	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$14,836.500	\$32.000	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$14,668.500	\$28.190	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$13,028.050	\$26.560	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$12,246.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
#2 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	150	\$17.350	\$6.890	\$0.250	\$4,573.500	\$20.350	\$7.890	\$0.220	\$5,061.000	\$18.490	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$4,718.000	\$18.310	\$6.600	\$0.400	\$5,236.500	\$31.020	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$6,538.500	\$27.750	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$5,649.000	\$24.410	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$5,166.450	\$23.000	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$4,714.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
#1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	20	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	\$24.750	\$3.000	\$0.200	\$695.000	\$32.800	\$8.750	\$0.800	\$1,231.000	\$33.000	\$7.070	\$0.220	\$911.400	\$27.750	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$753.200	\$24.410	\$3.383	\$0.228	\$668.860	\$23.000	\$3.180	\$0.210	\$628.600	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!								
ODOT TYPE D RIP RAP	TON	100	\$32.000	\$9.500	\$0.250	\$4,775.000	\$35.000	\$10.390	\$0.220	\$5,089.000	\$24.750	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$3,770.000	\$34.750	\$9.400	\$0.400	\$5,415.000	\$42.000	\$8.760	\$0.240	\$5,676.000	\$38.500	\$6.700	\$0.360	\$5,420.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$4,848.100	\$31.870	\$5.840	\$0.320	\$4,571.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
ODOT TYPE C RIP RAP	TON	200	\$32.000	\$9.500	\$0.250	\$9,550.000	\$35.000	\$10.390	\$0.220	\$10,178.000	\$36.170	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$9,824.000	\$34.750	\$9.400	\$0.400	\$10,830.000	\$42.000	\$8.760	\$0.240	\$11,352.000	\$38.500	\$6.700	\$0.360	\$10,840.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$9,696.200	\$31.870	\$5.840	\$0.320	\$9,142.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
ODOT TYPE B RIP RAP	TON	300	\$32.000	\$9.500	\$0.250	\$14,325.000	\$35.000	\$10.390	\$0.220	\$15,267.000	\$37.260	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$15,063.000	\$34.750	\$9.400	\$0.400	\$16,245.000	\$42.000	\$8.760	\$0.240	\$17,028.000	\$38.500	\$7.950	\$0.430	\$17,160.000	\$33.830	\$7.329	\$0.395	\$15,310.200	\$31.870	\$6.900	\$0.370	\$14,406.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
ODOT TYPE A RIP RAP	TON	400	\$32.000	\$9.500	\$0.250	\$18,700.000	\$35.000	\$10.390	\$0.220	\$20,356.000	\$47.660	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$24,220.000	\$34.750	\$9.400	\$0.400	\$27,660.000	\$42.000	\$8.760	\$0.240	\$22,704.000	\$38.500	\$10.300	\$0.430	\$23,820.000	\$33.830	\$8.584	\$0.395	\$21,315.600	\$31.870	\$9.030	\$0.370	\$20,060.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!							
Grand Total					\$141,023.300				\$152,440.800			AWARD	\$135,850.300				\$154,901.500				\$167,822.700				\$184,088.400				\$162,294.970				\$152,509.200				#VALUE!				#VALUE!												
CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low bid total by district. A bidder may receive an award for one or more districts.																																																					
EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the Price per Unit of each line item by the Estimated Usage and then add thirty (30) miles Delivery Fee (first 5 miles, plus price per mile) to arrive at a line item total. All line item totals per district will be added to arrive at a low bid total per district. Failure to bid all items per district may result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive for that district.																																																					
Delivery Fee Example: Forty (40) tons of aggregate delivered thirty (30) miles from aggregate quarry. (Freight charge for miles 1-5) + (freight charge for mile 5-30) = total freight charge. (40 tons x \$3.00 /ton) + (40 tons x \$25.00/ton mile x (25 miles)) = \$370.00																																																					

INDEX NO.: GDC082	BID NO.: RS901020	1 ANNUAL EST. USAGE/EA				2 R.L. Underwood FOB Dest OH				3 Tatum Landscaping FOB Dest OH				4 Fountain Management FOB Dest OH				5 Ebony Construction Co., Inc. FOB Dest OH				6 Approved Components & Systems, Inc. FOB Dest OH				7 Vanguard Systems FOB Dest OH				8 Sallies Wholesale Construction Inc. FOB Dest OH				9 JEM Industrial Maint. Corp. FOB Dest OH				10 Gerken Materials, Inc FOB Dest OH				11 The Custar Stone Co. FOB Dest OH															
VENDOR NAME	DEL. OFFERED	LOC. BY STATE																																																							
ITEM/Description	TON	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price												
NATURAL SAND	1,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$22.850	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$35,800.000	\$23.000	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$36,000.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$18.050	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$26,710.000	\$15.900	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$24,933.000	\$31.870	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$42,270.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000								
CONCRETE SAND	700	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$22.850	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$25,060.000	\$23.500	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$25,550.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$22.150	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$21,567.000	\$19.450	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$19,938.100	\$10.090	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$14,343.000	\$20.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$24,500.000	\$15.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$27,300.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$22,000.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$20,000.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$22,000.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$20,000.000
#304 LIMESTONE	20	\$13.750	\$6.000	\$0.790	\$790.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$10.880	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$476.600	\$12.500	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$510.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$19.200	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$557.200	\$16.910	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$518.860	\$10.350	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$415.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$700.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$270.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$270.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$270.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$270.000				
#411 LIMESTONE	450	\$12.750	\$6.000	\$0.790	\$17,325.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$10.880	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$10,723.500	\$12.500	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$11,475.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$23.400	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$14,427.000	\$16.910	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$11,674.360	\$10.890	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$9,580.500	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$16,875.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$16,200.000	\$12.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$16,200.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$16,200.000	\$11.250	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$16,200.000				
#57 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	350	\$16.000	\$6.000	\$0.790	\$14,612.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$11.420	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$8,529.500	\$15.250	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$9,887.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.200	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$10,451.000	\$20.580	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$10,364.550	\$14.870	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$8,844.500	\$13.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$13,125.000	\$15.000	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$13,562.500	\$15.000	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$13,562.500	\$15.000	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$13,562.500	\$15.000	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$13,562.500				
#2 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	150	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$11.960	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$3,736.500	\$15.250	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$4,237.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.200	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$4,479.000	\$18.600	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$4,144.950	\$13.810	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$3,631.500	\$13.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$5,625.000	\$14.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$5,775.000	\$14.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$5,775.000	\$14.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$5,775.000								
#1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	20	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$17.950	\$3.000	\$0.200	\$519.000	\$15.250	\$5.500	\$0.300	\$665.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.200	\$3.660	\$0.200	\$597.200	\$18.600	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$552.660	\$13.810	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$484.200	\$13.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$890.000	\$14.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$770.000	\$14.750	\$5.000	\$0.750	\$770.000												
ODOT TYPE D RIP RAP	100	\$24.000	\$9.500	\$0.790	\$5,325.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.210	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$3,416.000	\$23.000	\$6.000	\$0.600	\$4,400.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$6.700	\$0.360	\$5,420.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$4,848.100	\$23.370	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$3,377.000	\$20.750	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$4,750.000	\$21.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$4,650.000	\$21.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$4,650.000												
ODOT TYPE C RIP RAP	200	\$26.500	\$9.500	\$0.790	\$11,150.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$24.750	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$7,540.000	\$24.500	\$6.000	\$0.600	\$9,100.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$6.700	\$0.360	\$10,840.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$9,696.200	\$26.030	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$7,286.000	\$22.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$9,900.000	\$22.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$9,500.000	\$22.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$9,500.000												
ODOT TYPE B RIP RAP	300	\$28.500	\$9.500	\$0.790	\$17,325.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$26.650	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$11,860.000	\$26.750	\$10.000	\$0.600	\$15,525.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$7.930	\$0.430	\$17,154.000	\$33.830	\$7.329	\$0.395	\$15,310.200	\$28.150	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$11,565.000	\$24.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$14,850.000	\$24.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$14,850.000	\$24.000	\$6.000	\$0.780	\$14,850.000												
ODOT TYPE A RIP RAP	400	\$32.500	\$9.500	\$0.790	\$24,700.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$29.370	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$16,926.000	\$29.000	\$12.000	\$0.800	\$24,000.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$10.300	\$0.430	\$23,820.000	\$33.830	\$9.584	\$0.395	\$21,315.600	\$32.400	\$5.150	\$0.210	\$17,120.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0.000								
Grand Total				DO	\$91,227.500				#VALUE!				\$124,609.100				\$141,250.000				#VALUE!				\$136,022.400				\$123,296.570				AWARD	\$118,916.700				DO	\$91,215.000				DO	\$113,527.500													

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total by district. A bidder may receive an award for one or more districts.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the Price per Unit of each line item by the Estimated Usage and then add thirty (30) miles Delivery Fee (first 5 miles, plus price per mile) to arrive at a line item total. All line item totals per district will be added to arrive at a low lot total per district. Failure to bid all items per district may result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive for that district.

Delivery Fee Example: Forty (40) tons of aggregate delivered thirty (30) miles from aggregate quarry. (Freight charge for miles 1-5) + (freight charge for mile 5-30) = total freight charge. (40 tons x \$3.00 /ton) + (40 tons x \$.25/ton mile) x (25 miles) = \$370.00

INDEX NO. GDC082	BID NO. RS901020	OPENING DATE: 12/13/19				PRODUCT/SERVICE: AGGREGATE																																											
VENDOR NO.	ANNUAL EST. USAGE/EA	1 R.L. Underwood FOB Dest OH				2 Tatum Landscaping FOB Dest OH				3 Fountain Management FOB Dest OH				4 Ebony Construction Co., Inc. FOB Dest OH				5 Approved Components & Systems, Inc. FOB Dest OH				6 Vanguard Systems FOB Dest OH				7 Sallies Wholesale Construction Inc. FOB Dest OH				8 JEM Industrial Maint. Corp. FOB Dest OH				9 Gerken Materials, Inc. FOB Dest OH				10 The Custar Stone Co. FOB Dest OH											
DEL. OFFERED	UOM	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price								
NATURAL SAND	TON	1,000	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$8,700	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$21,650,000	\$42,000	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$56,750,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38,500	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$49,970,000	\$33,830	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$44,544,000	\$31,870	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$41,820,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
CONCRETE SAND	TON	700	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$8,700	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$15,155,000	\$42,000	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$39,725,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38,500	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$34,979,000	\$33,830	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$31,180,800	\$31,870	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$29,274,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#304 LIMESTONE	TON	20	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$20,120	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$661,400	\$36,200	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$1,019,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$33,550	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$900,400	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$800,680	\$27,620	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$751,400	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#411 LIMESTONE	TON	450	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$20,120	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$14,881,500	\$36,200	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$22,927,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$33,550	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$20,259,000	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$18,015,300	\$27,620	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$16,906,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#57 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	350	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$20,670	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$11,767,000	\$36,200	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$17,832,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$33,550	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$15,757,000	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$14,011,900	\$27,620	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$13,149,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#2 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	150	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21,760	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$5,206,500	\$36,200	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$7,842,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$33,550	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$6,753,000	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$6,005,100	\$27,620	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$5,535,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	20	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$28,290	\$3,250	\$0.250	\$755,800	\$36,200	\$6,000	\$0.350	\$1,019,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$33,550	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$900,400	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$800,680	\$27,620	\$3,450	\$0.260	\$751,400	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE D RIP RAP	TON	100	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$31,280	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$4,423,000	\$55,000	\$9,130	\$0.500	\$7,663,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$51,250	\$6,710	\$0.360	\$6,696,000	\$45,100	\$6,200	\$0.338	\$5,975,000	\$42,500	\$5,840	\$0.310	\$5,609,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE C RIP RAP	TON	200	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$49,780	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$12,546,000	\$55,000	\$9,130	\$0.500	\$15,326,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$51,250	\$6,710	\$0.360	\$13,392,000	\$45,100	\$6,200	\$0.338	\$11,950,000	\$42,500	\$5,840	\$0.310	\$11,218,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE B RIP RAP	TON	300	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$37,810	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$15,228,000	\$55,000	\$9,130	\$0.500	\$22,989,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$51,250	\$7,930	\$0.430	\$20,979,000	\$45,100	\$7,329	\$0.395	\$18,691,200	\$42,500	\$6,900	\$0.370	\$17,595,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE A RIP RAP	TON	400	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$49,500	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$24,980,000	\$55,000	\$9,130	\$0.500	\$30,652,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$51,250	\$10,730	\$0.430	\$29,092,000	\$45,100	\$9,584	\$0.395	\$25,823,600	\$42,500	\$9,030	\$0.370	\$24,312,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
Grand Total			#VALUE!		#VALUE!				AWARD	\$127,254,200			\$223,545,500				\$223,545,500				#VALUE!				\$199,677,800				\$177,798,260				\$167,022,300				#VALUE!				#VALUE!				#VALUE!				

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total by district. A bidder may receive an award for one or more districts.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the Price per Unit of each line item by the Estimated Usage and then add thirty (30) miles Delivery Fee (first 5 miles, plus price per mile) to arrive at a line item total. All line item totals per district will be added to arrive at a low lot total per district. Failure to bid all items per district may result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive for that district.

Delivery Fee Example: Forty (40) tons of aggregate delivered thirty (30) miles from aggregate quarry. (Freight charge for miles 1-5) + (freight charge for mile 5-30) = total freight charge. (40 tons x \$3.00 /ton) + (40 tons x \$.25/ton mile) x (25 miles) = \$370.00

INDEX NO.: GDC082	BID NO.: RS901020				OPENING DATE: 12/13/19				PRODUCT/SERVICE: AGGREGATE																																																				
VENDOR NO.	ANNUAL	1				2				3				4				5				6				7				8				9				10																							
VENDOR NAME	EST. USAGE/EA	R.L. Underwood FOB Dest OH				Tatum Landscaping FOB Dest OH				Fountain Management FOB Dest OH				Ebony Construction Co., Inc. FOB Dest OH				Approved Components & Systems, Inc. FOB Dest OH				Vanguard Systems FOB Dest OH				Sallies Wholesale Construction Inc. FOB Dest OH				JEM Industrial Maint. Corp. FOB Dest OH				Gerken Materials, Inc. FOB Dest OH				The Custar Stone Co. FOB Dest OH																							
DEL. OFFERED	UOM	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price												
ITEM/Description																																																													
DISTRICT 4																																																													
NATURAL SAND	TON	1,000	\$27,000	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$40,140,000	\$15,750	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$29,140,000	\$12,240	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$25,190,000	\$12,900	\$7,500	\$0.300	\$27,900,000	\$30,000	\$7,070	\$0.220	\$42,570,000	\$38,500	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$49,970,000	\$33,830	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$44,544,000	\$9,930	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$20,140,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
CONCRETE SAND	TON	700	\$27,000	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$28,098,000	\$15,750	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$20,398,000	\$12,240	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$17,633,000	\$12,900	\$7,500	\$0.300	\$19,530,000	\$30,000	\$7,070	\$0.220	\$29,799,000	\$38,500	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$34,979,000	\$33,830	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$31,180,800	\$9,930	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$14,098,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
#304 LIMESTONE	TON	20	\$19,750	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$657,800	\$30,250	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$872,800	\$18,490	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$628,800	\$19,400	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$748,000	\$19,400	\$8,400	\$0.360	\$1,068,000	\$36,000	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$949,400	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$800,680	\$11,310	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$430,400	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
#411 LIMESTONE	TON	450	\$19,750	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$14,800,500	\$30,250	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$19,638,000	\$18,490	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$14,148,000	\$19,400	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$16,830,000	\$36,000	\$8,400	\$0.360	\$24,030,000	\$36,000	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$21,361,500	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$18,015,300	\$12,000	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$9,994,500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
#57 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	350	\$22,000	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$12,239,000	\$30,250	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$15,274,000	\$21,760	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$12,148,500	\$23,500	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$14,525,000	\$36,000	\$8,400	\$0.360	\$18,690,000	\$36,000	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$16,614,500	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$14,011,900	\$13,330	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$8,239,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
#2 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	150	\$21,650	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$5,218,500	\$30,250	\$7,890	\$0.220	\$6,546,000	\$18,490	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$4,716,000	\$21,500	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$5,925,000	\$33,000	\$7,070	\$0.220	\$6,835,500	\$36,000	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$7,120,500	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.282	\$6,005,100	\$11,310	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$3,228,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
#1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	20	\$21,650	\$6,890	\$0.250	\$695,800	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0,000	\$29,370	\$3,250	\$0.250	\$777,400	\$21,500	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$790,000	\$33,000	\$7,070	\$0.220	\$911,400	\$36,000	\$3,970	\$0.300	\$949,400	\$29,320	\$3,664	\$0.338	\$828,680	\$13,250	\$3,710	\$0.260	\$469,200	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
ODOT TYPE D RIP RAP	TON	100	\$27,850	\$9,390	\$0.250	\$4,349,000	\$33,000	\$10,390	\$0.220	\$4,889,000	\$24,750	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$3,770,000	\$25,000	\$5,500	\$0.500	\$4,300,000	\$34,800	\$10,070	\$0.220	\$5,037,000	\$51,240	\$6,710	\$0.360	\$6,695,000	\$45,100	\$6,200	\$0.338	\$5,975,000	\$15,830	\$6,100	\$0.370	\$3,118,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
ODOT TYPE C RIP RAP	TON	200	\$27,850	\$9,390	\$0.250	\$8,698,000	\$37,000	\$10,390	\$0.220	\$10,578,000	\$36,170	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$9,824,000	\$27,600	\$9,400	\$0.850	\$11,650,000	\$39,600	\$10,070	\$0.220	\$11,034,000	\$51,240	\$6,710	\$0.360	\$13,390,000	\$45,100	\$6,200	\$0.338	\$11,950,000	\$19,680	\$6,100	\$0.370	\$7,006,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
ODOT TYPE B RIP RAP	TON	300	\$27,850	\$9,390	\$0.250	\$13,047,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0,000	\$37,260	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$15,963,000	\$30,000	\$9,400	\$0.850	\$18,195,000	\$31,020	\$10,070	\$0.220	\$13,977,000	\$51,240	\$7,930	\$0.430	\$20,978,000	\$45,100	\$7,329	\$0.395	\$18,691,200	\$19,070	\$6,100	\$0.370	\$10,326,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
ODOT TYPE A RIP RAP	TON	400	\$27,850	\$9,390	\$0.250	\$17,396,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	\$0,000	\$47,600	\$4,200	\$0.350	\$24,220,000	\$35,000	\$9,400	\$0.850	\$26,260,000	\$35,000	\$10,070	\$0.220	\$18,636,000	\$51,240	\$10,370	\$0.430	\$29,944,000	\$45,100	\$9,584	\$0.395	\$25,823,600	\$18,380	\$6,100	\$0.370	\$13,492,000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!															
Grand Total					\$145,399,600				\$107,335,800				\$128,118,700				\$146,653,000				\$172,587,900				\$201,949,300				\$177,826,260				AWARD \$90,541,100				#VALUE!				#VALUE!				#VALUE!																

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total by district. A bidder may receive an award for one or more districts.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the Price per Unit of each line item by the Estimated Usage and then add thirty (30) miles Delivery Fee (first 5 miles, plus price per mile) to arrive at a line item total. All line item totals per district will be added to arrive at a low lot total per district. Failure to bid all items per district may result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive for that district.

Delivery Fee Example: Forty (40) tons of aggregate delivered thirty (30) miles from aggregate quarry. (Freight charge for miles 1-5) + (freight charge for mile 5-30) = total freight charge. (40 tons x \$3.00/ton) + (40 tons x \$5.25/ton mile) x (25 miles) = \$370.00

INDEX NO.: GDC082	BID NO.: RS901020	OPENING DATE: 12/13/19				PRODUCT/SERVICE: AGGREGATE																																											
VENDOR NO.	ANNUAL EST. USAGE/EA	1 R.L. Underwood FOB Dest OH				2 Tatum Landscaping FOB Dest OH				3 Fountain Management FOB Dest OH				4 Ebony Construction Co., Inc. FOB Dest OH				5 Approved Components & Systems, Inc. FOB Dest OH				6 Vanguard Systems FOB Dest OH				7 Sallies Wholesale Construction Inc. FOB Dest OH				8 JEM Industrial Maint. Corp. FOB Dest OH				9 Gerken Materials, Inc FOB Dest OH				10 The Custer Stone Co. FOB Dest OH											
VENDOR NAME	UOM	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price	Bid Price Per Ton	Delivery Fee Per Ton (First 5 Miles)	Delivery Fee Per Mile (For Hauls Exceeding 5 Miles)	Extended Price								
NATURAL SAND DISTRICT 5	TON	1,000	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$16.860	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$29,810.000	\$10.200	\$7.500	\$0.300	\$25,200.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$48,410.000	\$36.590	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$45,623.000	\$9.930	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$20,140.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
CONCRETE SAND	TON	700	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$16.860	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$20,867.000	\$10.200	\$7.500	\$0.300	\$17,640.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$33,887.000	\$26.590	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$24,936.100	\$9.930	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$14,098.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#304 LIMESTONE	TON	20	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$18.490	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$628.800	\$13.750	\$5.500	\$0.500	\$635.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$19.200	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$582.200	\$16.910	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$518.860	\$11.310	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$430.400	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#411 LIMESTONE	TON	450	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$18.490	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$14,148.000	\$15.750	\$5.500	\$0.500	\$15,187.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$19.200	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$13,099.500	\$16.910	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$11,674.350	\$12.000	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$9,994.500	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#57 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	350	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.760	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$12,148.500	\$18.000	\$5.500	\$0.500	\$12,600.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$23.400	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$11,658.500	\$20.580	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$10,364.550	\$13.330	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$8,239.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#2 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	150	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$18.490	\$4.200	\$0.200	\$4,153.500	\$16.000	\$5.500	\$0.500	\$5,100.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.150	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$4,659.000	\$18.600	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$4,144.950	\$11.310	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$3,228.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
#1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE	TON	20	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$17.950	\$3.000	\$0.350	\$594.000	\$17.500	\$5.500	\$0.500	\$710.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$21.150	\$3.660	\$0.250	\$621.200	\$18.600	\$3.383	\$0.226	\$552.660	\$13.250	\$3.710	\$0.260	\$469.200	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE D RIP RAP	TON	100	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$24.750	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$3,770.000	\$21.100	\$8.000	\$0.500	\$4,160.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$6.710	\$0.360	\$5,421.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$4,848.100	\$15.530	\$6.100	\$0.370	\$3,118.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE C RIP RAP	TON	200	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$36.170	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$9,824.000	\$26.250	\$8.000	\$0.850	\$11,100.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$6.710	\$0.360	\$10,842.000	\$33.830	\$6.201	\$0.338	\$9,696.200	\$19.680	\$6.100	\$0.370	\$7,006.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE B RIP RAP	TON	300	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$37.260	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$15,063.000	\$30.000	\$8.000	\$0.850	\$17,775.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$7.930	\$0.360	\$16,629.000	\$33.830	\$7.329	\$0.395	\$15,310.200	\$19.070	\$6.100	\$0.370	\$10,326.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
ODOT TYPE A RIP RAP	TON	400	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$47.600	\$4.200	\$0.350	\$24,220.000	\$30.000	\$8.000	\$0.850	\$23,700.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	\$38.500	\$10.370	\$0.360	\$23,148.000	\$33.830	\$9.584	\$0.395	\$21,315.600	\$18.380	\$6.100	\$0.370	\$13,492.000	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!	no bid	no bid	no bid	#VALUE!
Grand Total					#VALUE!				#VALUE!				\$135,226.800				\$133,807.500				#VALUE!				\$168,957.400				\$148,984.570				AWARD	\$90,541.100				#VALUE!				#VALUE!							

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total by district. A bidder may receive an award for one or more districts.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the Price per Unit of each line item by the Estimated Usage and then add thirty (30) miles Delivery Fee (first 5 miles, plus price per mile) to arrive at a line item total. All line item totals per district will be added to arrive at a low lot total per district. Failure to bid all items per district may result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive for that district.

Delivery Fee Example: Forty (40) tons of aggregate delivered thirty (30) miles from aggregate quarry. (Freight charge for miles 1-5) + (freight charge for mile 5-30) = total freight charge. (40 tons x \$3.00 /ton) + (40 tons x \$.25/ton mile) x (25 miles) = \$370.00