

INDEX NO.: GDC054	BID NO: RS90919	OPENING DATE: 10/24/18 T-SHIRTS, UNDERGARMENTS, SOCKS AND THERMALS																																													
		VENDOR NO.	VENDOR NAME	DEL. OFFERED	LOC. BY STATE	UOM	ANNUAL EST. USAGE / EA	1				2				3				4				5				6				7				8				9				10			
								889 Global Solutions				Blue Rose Supply				Diversified Services Corp				Medic Safe				Net PAC International, LLC				Pyramid Enterprise Supplies				Roger Elliott Co.				Tran Products, LLC				Allstate Industrial, Inc. Bid 1				Allstate Industrial, Inc. Bid 2			
								21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO		21 Days ARO					
OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH		OH													
BRAND/ITEM		Description		Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price														
CATEGORY I. T-Shirts																																															
		DID NOT DECLARE		DOMINICAN REPUBLIC, HONDURAS, VIETNAM				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, EL SALVADOR, MEXICO, USA				HONDURAS				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, TAIWAN, USA				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, USA				HONDURAS, HAITI				HONDURAS, HAITI																			
1.1a.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size SM-XL Required Colors	Doz	400	\$41.300	\$16,520.000	\$22.600	\$9,040.000	\$33.220	\$13,288.000	\$28.360	\$11,344.000	\$28.000	\$11,200.000	\$31.050	\$12,420.000	\$30.500	\$12,200.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$23.520	\$9,408.000	\$23.520	\$9,408.000																							
1.1b.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 2XL - 4XL Required Colors	Doz	800	\$50.330	\$40,264.000	\$46.540	\$37,232.000	\$57.450	\$45,960.000	\$75.600	\$60,480.000	\$51.950	\$41,560.000	\$56.120	\$44,896.000	\$55.650	\$44,520.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$32.50 & \$52.75	\$0.000	\$42.600	\$34,080.000																							
1.1c.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 5XL - 6XL Required Colors	Doz	100	\$57.600	\$5,760.000	\$54.430	\$5,443.000	\$80.080	\$8,008.000	\$75.600	\$7,560.000	\$71.230	\$7,123.000	\$79.590	\$7,959.000	\$77.560	\$7,756.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$51.75 & \$58.50	\$0.000	\$59.500	\$5,950.000																							
1.1d.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 7XL - 9XL (Not Evaluated) Required Colors	Doz	Not Evaluated	\$59.200	\$0.000	\$54.430	\$0.000	\$155.320	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$138.700	\$0.000	\$156.370	\$0.000	\$150.000	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$95.000	\$0.000	\$95.000	\$0.000																							
1.2a.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size SM-XL, White Only	Doz	4,600	\$21.470	\$98,762.000	\$19.480	\$89,608.000	\$22.010	\$101,246.000	\$21.650	\$99,590.000	\$19.480	\$89,608.000	\$21.870	\$100,602.000	\$22.500	\$103,500.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$17.880	\$82,248.000	\$17.880	\$82,248.000																							
1.2b.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 2XL - 4XL, White Only	Doz	10,600	\$27.600	\$292,560.000	\$37.690	\$399,514.000	\$37.010	\$392,306.000	\$66.670	\$706,702.000	\$33.000	\$349,800.000	\$37.010	\$392,306.000	\$35.210	\$373,226.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$27.66 & \$40.32	\$0.000	\$29.500	\$312,700.000																							
1.2c.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 5XL - 6XL, White Only	Doz	450	\$36.030	\$16,213.500	\$47.930	\$21,568.500	\$39.920	\$17,964.000	\$66.670	\$30,001.500	\$35.700	\$16,065.000	\$39.950	\$17,977.500	\$38.890	\$17,500.500	NO BID	\$0.000	\$40.32 & 47.00	\$0.000	\$57.000	\$25,650.000																							
1.2d.		Men's Short Sleeve Crew Neck T-Shirts, 100% Cotton Jersey Knit, Size 7XL - 9XL, White Only	Doz	225	\$37.210	\$8,372.250	\$47.930	\$10,784.250	\$44.030	\$9,906.750	\$302.400	\$68,040.000	\$39.950	\$8,988.750	\$43.780	\$9,850.500	\$41.800	\$9,405.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$84.000	\$18,900.000	\$84.000	\$18,900.000																							
		Sub Total			\$478,451.750	\$573,189.750	\$588,678.750	\$983,717.500	\$524,344.750	\$586,011.000	\$568,107.500	\$35,160.660	\$34,086.450	\$602,193.990	\$602,193.990						\$110,556.000	\$488,936.000																									
		Buy America			\$28,707.105	\$34,391.385	\$35,320.725	\$59,023.050	\$31,460.685	\$35,160.660	\$602,193.990	\$602,193.990									\$6,633.360	\$29,336.160																									
		Total			\$507,158.855	\$607,581.135	\$623,999.475	\$1,042,740.550	\$555,805.435	\$621,171.660	\$602,193.990	\$602,193.990									\$117,189.360	\$518,272.160																									
					DISQUALIFY - NOT RESPONSIVE SPECIFICATIONS																DISQUALIFY - NOT RESPONSIVE				AWARD																						
CATEGORY II. UNDERGARMENTS																																															
		DOMINICAN REPUBLIC, HONDURAS, VIETNAM				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, EL SALVADOR, MEXICO, USA				HONDURAS				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, TAIWAN				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, USA				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, USA				PAKISTAN, CHINA, HONDURAS, MEXICO, BANGLADESH, ELSALVADOR, USA																					
11.1a.		Men's Bocer Shorts, Size SM - XL, White	Doz	1,200	NO BID	\$0.000	\$20.650	\$24,780.000	\$14.950	\$17,940.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$13.400	\$16,080.000	\$14.900	\$17,880.000	\$14.000	\$16,800.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$21.080	\$25,296.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.1b.		Men's Bocer Shorts, Size SM - XL, White	Doz	1,200	NO BID	\$0.000	\$20.030	\$28,836.000	\$18.450	\$22,140.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$16.650	\$19,980.000	\$18.370	\$22,044.000	\$17.160	\$20,592.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$26.020	\$31,224.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.1c.		Men's Bocer Shorts, Size SM - XL, White	Doz	400	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$18.450	\$7,380.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$17.990	\$7,196.000	\$18.370	\$7,348.000	\$17.160	\$6,864.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$10.408.000	\$10,408.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.1d.		Men's Bocer Shorts, Size SM - XL, White	Doz	25	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$22.760	\$569.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$22.950	\$573.750	\$22.650	\$566.250	\$22.000	\$550.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$32.100	\$802.500	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.2a.		Men's Briefs, Size SM -XL, White	Doz	8,000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$10.730	\$85,840.000	\$11.760	\$94,080.000	\$23.300	\$186,400.000	\$10.560	\$84,480.000	\$11.810	\$94,480.000	\$11.310	\$90,480.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$15.370	\$122,960.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.2b.		Men's Briefs, Size SM -XL, White	Doz	3,500	NO BID	\$0.000	\$13.380	\$46,830.000	\$14.120	\$49,420.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$12.900	\$45,150.000	\$14.180	\$49,630.000	\$13.820	\$48,370.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$18.450	\$64,575.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.2c.		Men's Briefs, Size SM -XL, White	Doz	700	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$16.260	\$11,382.000	\$82.440	\$57,708.000	\$14.600	\$10,220.000	\$16.250	\$11,375.000	\$16.100	\$11,270.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$14.714.000	\$14,714.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.2d.		Men's Briefs, Size SM -XL, White	Doz	50	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$18.650	\$932.500	NO BID	\$0.000	\$16.000	\$800.000	\$17.500	\$875.000	\$17.000	\$850.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$22.500	\$1,125.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.3a.		Women's Briefs, Size 5 - 10, White	Doz	3,600	NO BID	\$0.000	\$12.630	\$45,468.000	\$9.300	\$33,480.000	\$25.620	\$92,232.000	\$8.350	\$30,060.000	\$9.350	\$33,660.000	\$9.100	\$32,760.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$12.600	\$45,360.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.3b.		Women's Briefs, Size 11 - 16, White	Doz	1,000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$15.700	\$15,700.000	\$10.590	\$10,590.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$9.990	\$9,990.000	\$10.650	\$10,650.000	\$10.010	\$10,010.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$14.350	\$14,350.000	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.4a.		Women's Bras, Sizes 32 - 44 A Cup, 32 - 45 B Cup, 32 - 52 - C Cup, White	Doz	350	NO BID	\$0.000	\$52.400	\$18,340.000	\$23.690	\$8,291.500	NO BID	\$0.000	\$21.100	\$7,385.000	\$23.650	\$8,277.500	\$22.960	\$8,036.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$30.650	\$10,727.500	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.4b.		Women's Bras, Size 32 - 54 D Cup and DD Cup	Doz	90	NO BID	\$0.000	\$93.720	\$8,434.800	\$24.780	\$2,230.200	NO BID	\$0.000	\$22.000	\$1,980.000	\$24.680	\$2,221.200	\$23.100	\$2,079.000	NO BID	\$0.000	\$32.040	\$2,883.600	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.5a.		Women's Sports Bras, Sizes SM - XL, All Cup Sizes, White	Doz	125	NO BID	\$0.000	\$42.970	\$5,371.250	\$22.390	\$2,798.750	NO BID	\$0.000	\$19.990	\$2,498.750	\$22.280	\$2,785.000	\$21.930	\$2,741.250	NO BID	\$0.000	\$30.050	\$3,756.250	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
11.5b.		Women's Sports Bras, Sizes 2XL 0 5XL, All Cup Sizes, White	Doz	75	NO BID	\$0.000	\$43.500	\$3,262.500	\$22.390	\$1,679.250	NO BID	\$0.000	\$19.990	\$1,499.250	\$22.280	\$1,671.000	\$21.930	\$1,644.750	NO BID	\$0.000	\$30.050	\$2,253.750	NO BID	\$0.000	NO BID	\$0.000																					
		Sub Total				\$282,913.200	\$262,862.550	\$262,862.550	\$237,892.750	\$237,892.750	\$263,462.950	\$237,892.750	\$237,892.750	\$263,462.950	\$237,892.750	\$237,892.750	\$237,892.750	\$237,892.750			\$350,435.600	\$350,435.600																									
		Buy America				\$16,971.753	\$15,774.792	\$16,971.753	\$15,774.792	\$14,273.565	\$15,807.777	\$15,807.777	\$14,273.565	\$15,807.777	\$15,807.777	\$15,807.777	\$15,807.777	\$15,807.777			\$21,026.136	\$21,026.136																									
		Total				\$299,884.953	\$278,637.342	\$279,834.303	\$253,667.542	\$253,667.542	\$279,270.727	\$279,270.727	\$253,667.542	\$279,270.727	\$279,270.727	\$279,270.727	\$279,270.727	\$279,270.727			\$371,461.736	\$371,461.736																									
					DISQUALIFY																DISQUALIFY				AWARD																						
CATEGORY III. SOCKS																																															
		EI SALVADOR				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, EL SALVADOR, MEXICO, USA				HONDURAS				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, TAIWAN				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, USA				PAKISTAN, BANGLADESH, HONDURAS, MEXICO, EL SALVADOR, USA				PAKISTAN, CHINA, HONDURAS, MEXICO, BANGLADESH, ELSALVADOR, USA																					
11.1a.		C																																													

VENDOR NO.	VENDOR NAME	UOM	ANNUAL EST. USAGE / EA	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10
				889 Global Solutions	Blue Rose Supply	Diversified Services Corp	Medic Safe	Net PAC International, LLC	Pyramid Enterprise Supplies	Roger Elliott Co.	Tran Products, LLC	Allstate Industrial, Inc.Bid 1	Allstate Industrial, Inc.Bid 2
				21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO	21 Days ARO
				OH	OH	OH	OH	OH	OH	OH	OH	OH	OH
				EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the estimated annual usage for each item in each category by the price offered and then sum the resulting amount to determine the lowest cost responsive and responsible bidder by product category. The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by product category.									