

YOUR BID:									
BIDDER'S 24-HOUR TELEPHONE NO.:									
BIDDER NAME:									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE
866/968-8873 Advanced Turf Solutions									
CATEGORY 1: PESTICIDES Fungicides									
1	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	ArmorTech CLT 720	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$46.32000	\$9,264.000	\$231.600
2	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	ArmorTech CLT 720	250	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$46.32000	\$11,580.000	\$115.800
3	DOCKET 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	ArmorTech CLT 720	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$46.32000	\$9,264.000	\$231.600
4	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	ArmorTech CLT 720	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$46.32000	\$9,264.000	\$231.600
5	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	ArmorTech CLT 720	200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$46.32000	\$9,264.000	\$115.800
6	DACONIL ACTION	NO BID	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
7	DACONIL ACTION	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
8	CLEARY 3336 LIQUID	ArmorTech TM462	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$56.23000	\$1,124.600	\$281.150
9	DEFIANT THIRAM	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
10	SPOTRETE THIRAM	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
11	CHIPCO 26 GT IPRODIONE	ArmorTech IP 238	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$69.82000	\$1,196.400	\$299.100
12	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE	ArmorTech PPZ 143	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$64.30000	\$1,929.000	\$321.500
13	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE FITNESS CONCENTRATED	ArmorTech PPZ 143	130	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$64.30000	\$8,359.000	\$160.750
14	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Sharshield PPZ EC	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$69.48000	\$2,084.400	\$347.400
15	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Sharshield PPZ EC	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$69.48000	\$3,474.000	\$173.700
16	SPECTATOR CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Sharshield PPZ EC	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$69.48000	\$2,084.400	\$347.400
17	CITIVAS HARMONIZER TURF DEFENSE	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
18	CITIVAS READY ZMX	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
19	ARMOR TECH ROTATOR		15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	1	\$510.00000	\$7,650.000	\$510.000
20	TEBUCONAZOLE	ArmorTech TEB 360	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	1	\$67.42000	\$1,011.300	\$67.420
21	ZOXY 25C		5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$700.00000	\$3,500.000	\$700.000
22	SECURE FUNGICIDE	ArmorTech Rotator	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	1	\$510.00000	\$7,650.000	\$510.000
23	XZEMPLAR FUNGICIDE		136.8	OUNCE(S)	11.4 OZ	11.4	\$18.00000	\$2,462.400	\$205.200
24	MEDALLION FLUDOXINIL	NO BID	4	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
25	BANOL		6	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$395.25000	\$5,737.500	\$956.250
								Category Total	\$36,699.000

YOUR BID:									
BIDDER'S 24-HOUR TELEPHONE NO.:									
BIDDER NAME:									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATE D PRICE
616/6042854 HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN									
CATEGORY 1: PESTICIDES Fungicides									
1	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	OMNI CHLOROTHALONIL 720	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$36.80000	\$7,360.000	\$184.000
2	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	OMNI CHLOROTHALONIL 720	250	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$36.80000	\$9,200.000	\$92.000
3	DOCKET 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	OMNI CHLOROTHALONIL 720	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$36.80000	\$15,520.000	\$184.000
4	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL		200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$61.00000	\$15,520.000	\$305.000
5	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL		200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$61.00000	\$15,520.000	\$152.500
6	DACONIL ACTION		200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$77.60000	\$15,520.000	\$388.000
7	DACONIL ACTION		20	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$77.60000	\$1,552.000	\$194.000
8	CLEARY 3336 LIQUID	TMETHYL 4.5	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$52.00000	\$1,040.000	\$260.000
9	DEFIANT THIRAM		20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
10	SPOTRETE THIRAM		20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$34.41000	\$688.200	\$172.050
11	CHIPCO 26 GT IPRODIONE	I PRO 25C	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$38.90000	\$778.000	\$194.500
12	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE	PROPICONAZILE 14.3	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$43.00000	\$1,290.000	\$215.000
13	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE	PROPICONAZILE 14.3	130	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S) CASE	2.5	\$43.00000	\$5,590.000	\$107.500
14	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	PROPISTAR 3.6 EC	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$90.00000	\$2,700.000	\$450.000
15	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	OMNI PROPICONAZILE 41.8	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$90.00000	\$4,500.000	\$225.000
16	SPECTATOR CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	PROPISTAR 3.6 EC	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$90.00000	\$2,700.000	\$450.000
17	CITIVAS HARMONIZER TURF DEFENSE		20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
18	CITIVAS READY ZMX		20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				++ enter price per unit
19	ARMOR TECH ROTATOR	DETOUR	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$470.00000	\$7,050.000	\$1,175.000
20	TEBUCONAZOLE		15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$47.00000	\$705.000	\$117.500
21	ZOXY 25C	ARTAVA 25C	5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$480.00000	\$2,400.000	\$480.000
22	SECURE FUNGICIDE		15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$588.00000	\$8,820.000	\$1,470.000
23	XZEMPLAR FUNGICIDE		136.8	OUNCE(S)	11.4 OZ	11.4	\$18.00000	\$2,462.400	\$205.200
24	MEDALLION FLUDOXINIL		4	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$560.00000	\$2,240.000	\$560.000
25	BANOL	PROPLANT	6	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$305.00000	\$1,830.000	\$305.000
								Category Total	\$124,985.600

YOUR BID:									
BIDDER'S 24-HOUR TELEPHONE NO.:									
BIDDER NAME:									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE
216-404-0042 (NO 24 HOUR) ALSO 614-419-6141 Matt Marshall SiteOne Landscape Supply									
CATEGORY 1: PESTICIDES Fungicides									
1	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	Marioure 6 FL	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$36.74400	\$7,348.800	\$183.720
2	ADVANCED CLT 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	Marioure 6 FL	250	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$36.74400	\$9,186.000	\$91.860
3	DOCKET 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	Marioure 6 FL	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$36.74400	\$7,348.800	\$183.720
4	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	Marioure 6 FL	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S) CASE	5	\$36.74400	\$7,348.800	\$183.720
5	DACONIL 54% CHLOROTHALONIL	Marioure 6 FL	200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$36.74400	\$7,348.800	\$91.860
6	DACONIL ACTION	Daconil Action (Agency)	200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$77.60000	\$15,520.000	\$388.000
7	DACONIL ACTION	Daconil Action (Agency)	20	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$77.60000	\$1,552.000	\$194.000
8	CLEARY 3336 LIQUID	Lesco T-Storm	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$60.31200	\$1,206.240	\$301.560
9	DEFIANT THIRAM	Spotrete F	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$39.63200	\$792.640	\$198.160
10	SPOTRETE THIRAM	Spotrete F	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$39.63200	\$792.640	\$198.160
11	CHIPCO 26 GT IPRODIONE	Chipco 26GT	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$84.00000	\$1,681.840	\$420.460
12	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE	Lesco Spectator Ultra 1.3	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$55.14400	\$1,654.320	\$275.720
13	BANNER PROPICONAZOLE FITNESS CONCENTRATED	Lesco Spectator Ultra 1.3	130	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$55.14400	\$7,168.720	\$137.860
14	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Lesco Spectator T&O	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$85.10800	\$2,553.240	\$425.540
15	FITNESS CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Lesco Spectator T&O	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$85.10800	\$4,255.400	\$212.770
16	SPECTATOR CONCENTRATED PROPICONAZOLE	Lesco Spectator T&O	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$85.10800	\$2,553.240	\$425.540
17	CITIVAS HARMONIZER TURF DEFENSE	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000		++ enter price per unit
18	CITIVAS READY ZMX	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000		++ enter price per unit
19	ARMOR TECH ROTATOR	No Bid	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000		++ enter price per unit
20	TEBUCONAZOLE	Tebuconazole 3.6%	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	1	\$61.57700	\$923.655	\$61.577
21	ZOXY 25C	No Bid	5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000		++ enter price per unit
22	SECURE FUNGICIDE	Secure (Agency)	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$588.00000	\$8,820.000	\$1,470.000
23	XZEMPLAR FUNGICIDE	Xzemplar (Agency)	136.8	OUNCE(S)	11.4 OZ	11.4	\$18.00000	\$2,462.400	\$205.200
24	MEDALLION FLUDOXINIL	Medallion SC (Agency)	4	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$560.00000	\$2,240.000	\$560.000
25	BANOL	Banol	6	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$549.73000	\$3,298.380	\$549.730
								Category Total	\$96,055.915

Advanced Turf Solutions										HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN										SiteOne Landscape Supply									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATE D PRICE	BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE
78	SIMAZINE (Princep)	NO BID	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		78	SIMAZINE (Princep)		50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$17.00000	\$850.000	\$42.500	78	SIMAZINE (Princep)	No Bid	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
79	GRAZON NEXT HL HERBICIDE	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		79	GRAZON NEXT HL HERBICIDE		30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$48.00000	\$1,440.000	\$120.000	79	GRAZON NEXT HL HERBICIDE	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
80	POAST HERBICIDE	NO BID	13	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		80	POAST HERBICIDE		13	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$95.00000	\$1,235.000	\$237.500	80	POAST HERBICIDE	No Bid	13	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
81	BEYOND HERBICIDE	NO BID	8	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		81	BEYOND HERBICIDE		8	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5		-- enter price per unit		81	BEYOND HERBICIDE	No Bid	8	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
82	PROWL 2.2 EC HERBICIDE (NOTE: SAME CHEMICAL AS PENDULUM, BUT PENDULUM IS NOT ABBREVIATED FOR CROPS)	NO BID	40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		82	PROWL 2.2 EC HERBICIDE (NOTE: SAME CHEMICAL AS PENDULUM, BUT PENDULUM IS NOT ABBREVIATED FOR CROPS)	PROWL H2O	40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$44.00000	\$1,760.000	\$110.000	82	PROWL 2.2 EC HERBICIDE (NOTE: SAME CHEMICAL AS PENDULUM, BUT PENDULUM IS NOT ABBREVIATED FOR CROPS)	No Bid	40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
83	FREEHAND		500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$1.87000	\$935.000	\$93.500	83	FREEHAND		500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$1.87000	\$935.000	\$93.500	83	FREEHAND	No Bid	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
84	BARRICADE	ArmorTech Kade 65 WDG	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	5	\$11.59000	\$695.400	\$57.950	84	BARRICADE		60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	5	\$20.50000	\$1,230.000	\$102.500	84	BARRICADE	No Bid	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
85	CAVALCADE	ArmorTech Kade 65 WDG	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	5	\$11.59000	\$695.400	\$57.950	85	CAVALCADE	PRODIAMINE 65	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	5	\$9.50000	\$570.000	\$47.500	85	CAVALCADE	No Bid	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
86	DRIVE 75-DF	ArmorTech QuinPro 75 DF	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	1	\$41.98000	\$2,517.600	\$41.980	86	DRIVE 75-DF	QUINCHLORAC 75DF	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	1	\$28.00000	\$1,680.000	\$28.000	86	DRIVE 75-DF	No Bid	60	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
87	AIM EC HERBICIDE	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		87	AIM EC HERBICIDE		20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$650.00000	\$13,000.000	\$3,250.000	87	AIM EC HERBICIDE	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
88	SPYDER EXTRA (SIMILAR TO DUST) (SULFOMETURON METHYL AT 56.25% AND METSULFURON METHYL AT 15.00% ACTIVE INGREDIENT)	NO BID	50	POUND(S)	5 POUND(S)			-- enter price per unit		88	SPYDER EXTRA (SIMILAR TO DUST) (SULFOMETURON METHYL AT 56.25% AND METSULFURON METHYL AT 15.00% ACTIVE INGREDIENT)		50	POUND(S)	5 POUND(S)	3	\$39.00000	\$1,950.000	\$117.000	88	SPYDER EXTRA (SIMILAR TO DUST) (SULFOMETURON METHYL AT 56.25% AND METSULFURON METHYL AT 15.00% ACTIVE INGREDIENT)	No Bid	50	POUND(S)	5 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
89	CROSSBOW	NO BID	150	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		89	CROSSBOW		150	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$47.50000	\$7,125.000	\$118.750	89	CROSSBOW	No Bid	150	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
90	BANVEL	NO BID	2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		90	BANVEL		2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$82.00000	\$205.000	\$205.000	90	BANVEL	No Bid	2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
91	DUAL II MAGNUM	NO BID	40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		91	DUAL II MAGNUM		40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$99.00000	\$3,960.000	\$247.500	91	DUAL II MAGNUM	No Bid	40	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
92	HABITAT	NO BID	2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		92	HABITAT		2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5		-- enter price per unit		92	HABITAT	No Bid	2.5	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
93	OUST XP-DISPERSIBLE GRANULE	NO BID	10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)			-- enter price per unit		93	OUST XP-DISPERSIBLE GRANULE		10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)	3	\$39.00000	\$390.000	\$117.000	93	OUST XP-DISPERSIBLE GRANULE	No Bid	10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
94	STINGER	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		94	STINGER		30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	1	\$508.00000	\$15,240.000	\$508.000	94	STINGER	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
95	TORDON 22K SPECIALTY HERBICIDE	NO BID	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		95	TORDON 22K SPECIALTY HERBICIDE		15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$95.00000	\$1,425.000	\$237.500	95	TORDON 22K SPECIALTY HERBICIDE	No Bid	15	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
95	CAPRENO	NO BID	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		95	CAPRENO		2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)			-- enter price per unit		95	CAPRENO	No Bid	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
Category Total									\$52,289,580	Category Total									\$168,182,955	Category Total									\$25,693,564

Advanced Turf Solutions											HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN											SiteOne Landscape Supply										
BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.											BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.											BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE		BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATE D PRICE		BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
Insecticides											Insecticides											Insecticides										
96	MERIT GRANULAR	NO BID	300	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit	96	MERIT GRANULAR		300	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	30	\$0.92000	\$276.000	\$27.600		96	MERIT GRANULAR	Lesco Baricit 0.5G	300	POUND(S)	30 POUND(S)	30	\$0.82200	\$246.600	\$24.660	
97	MERIT GRANULAR	NO BID	5000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit	97	MERIT GRANULAR	CRITERION 5G	5000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	30	\$0.80000	\$4,000.000	\$24.000		97	MERIT GRANULAR	GrowSar Merit 2% 0-0-7	5000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$0.28000	\$1,400.000	\$14.000	
98	MERIT 75 WSPs	NO BID	40	POUND(S)	4 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit	98	MERIT 75 WSPs		40	POUND(S)	4 POUND(S)	4			-- enter price per unit		98	MERIT 75 WSPs	No Bid	40	POUND(S)	4 POUND(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
99	IMIDACLOPRID 2F T & O	ArmorTech IMD 2 SC	45	POUND(S)	4 GALLON(S)	4	\$54.67000	\$2,460.150	\$218.680		99	IMIDACLOPRID 2F T & O		45	POUND(S)	4 GALLON(S)	4	\$46.00000	\$2,070.000	\$184.000		99	IMIDACLOPRID 2F T & O	No Bid	45	POUND(S)	4 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
100	TREE-AGE INSECTICIDE	NO BID	0.53	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit	100	TREE-AGE INSECTICIDE		0.53	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit		100	TREE-AGE INSECTICIDE	Arborjet Tree-Age (1 liter)	0.53	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)	1	\$498.00000	\$263.940	\$498.000	
101	IMIDACLOPRID (MA-JET)	NO BID	2.08	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit	101	IMIDACLOPRID (MA-JET)		2.08	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit		101	IMIDACLOPRID (MA-JET)	Arborjet Ima-Jet (1 liter)	2.08	GALLON(S)	.26 GALLON(S)	1	\$275.00000	\$573.000	\$275.000	
102	IMIDACLOPRID (75WSP)	ArmorTech IMD 75 WSP	120	OUNCE(S)	1.6 oz PACKET	75.8	\$3.32000	\$398.400	\$254.976		102	IMIDACLOPRID (75WSP)	CRITERIO 75	120	OUNCE(S)	1.6 oz PACKET	1.6	\$4.45000	\$534.000	\$7.120		102	IMIDACLOPRID (75WSP)	No Bid	120	OUNCE(S)	1.6 oz PACKET				-- enter price per unit	
103	IMIDACLOPRID (BAYER CORETECT SOL TABLETS)	NO BID	2000	TABLET	250 TABLET BOTTLE					-- enter price per unit	103	IMIDACLOPRID (BAYER CORETECT SOL TABLETS)		2000	TABLET	250 TABLET BOTTLE	250	\$1.29000	\$2,580.000	\$322.500		103	IMIDACLOPRID (BAYER CORETECT SOL TABLETS)	Corectect	2000	TABLET	250 TABLET BOTTLE	250	\$0.32500	\$650.000	\$91.250	
104	SAFARI 20SG	NO BID	6	POUND(S)	3 POUND(S)	3	\$114.43000	\$686.580	\$343.290		104	SAFARI 20SG		6	POUND(S)	3 POUND(S)	3	\$111.13000	\$666.780	\$333.390		104	SAFARI 20SG	Safari 20 Sg	6	POUND(S)	3 POUND(S)	3	\$123.44000	\$740.640	\$370.320	
105	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN	Talstar Select	16	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)	4	\$48.00000	\$768.000	\$192.000		105	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN		16	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit		105	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN	Lesco Crosscheck Plus	16	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)	1	\$35.45000	\$567.200	\$35.450	
106	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN	Talstar Select	8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$48.00000	\$384.000	\$48.000		106	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN		8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$30.00000	\$240.000	\$30.000		106	WISDOM TC BIFENTHRIN	Lesco Crosscheck Plus	8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$35.45000	\$283.600	\$35.450	
107	NIBAN GRANULAR INSECTICIDE	NO BID	120	POUND(S)	40 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit	107	NIBAN GRANULAR INSECTICIDE		120	POUND(S)	40 POUND(S)				-- enter price per unit		107	NIBAN GRANULAR INSECTICIDE	No Bid	120	POUND(S)	40 POUND(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
108	MUSTANG MAX	NO BID	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit	108	MUSTANG MAX		2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	2	\$135.00000	\$270.000	\$270.000		108	MUSTANG MAX	No Bid	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit	
109	TORDON	NO BID	15	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit	109	TORDON		15	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit		109	TORDON	No Bid	15	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)			0	-- enter price per unit	
								Category Total	\$4,697.130									Category Total	\$10,636.790									Category Total	\$4,723.980			

BIDDER NAME: Advanced Turf Solutions										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 2: SPECIALTY CHEMICALS										
Fertilizers and Micronutrients										
110	AMMONIUM SULFATE 21-0-0 SOLUBLE	NO BID	700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
111	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE	NO BID	18700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
112	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE	NO BID	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
113	DIAMOND K SOLUBLE 0-0-50	NO BID	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
114	MILORGANIC 6-20-0	NO BID	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
115	SCU 50% + MERIT 32-3-8	NO BID	50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
116	0-50-30 PLANT MARVEL	NO BID	500	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
117	AWARD 14-14-14 CONTAINER & SHRUB FERTILIZER	NO BID	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
118	CITRAPLEX (LOVELAND) CHELATED IRON POWDER	NO BID	575	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
119	HAFA 12-61-00 (HAFA MONO AMMONIUM PHOSPHATE)	NO BID	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
120	PROFILE GREENSGRADE	NO BID	1000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
121	HOLGANIX 8-3-5 GREENSGRADE 90 SGN		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG	50	\$0.80000	\$3,200.000	\$40.000	
122	HOLGANIX PB1		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$75.00000	\$1,875.000	\$375.000	
123	HOLGANIX LAWN	Holganix PB-1 LTO	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$47.60000	\$2,856.000	\$238.000	
124	HOLGANIX Golf	NO BID	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
125	HOLGANIX AGRICULTURAL	NO BID	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
126	HOLGANIX BLOOM	NO BID	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
127	HOLGANIX TREE & SHRUB	NO BID	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
128	EARTHWORKS 3-4-3 IS 100% EGG LAYER POULTRY COMPOST	NO BID	6000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
129	UREA HUMIC COATED 44-0-0 (ANDERSONS)	NO BID	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
130	18-0-18 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER	NO BID	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
									Category Total	\$7,931.000

BIDDER NAME: HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 2: SPECIALTY CHEMICALS										
Fertilizers and Micronutrients										
110	AMMONIUM SULFATE 21-0-0 SOLUBLE		700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	51	\$0.27000	\$189.000	\$13.770	
111	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE		18700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$11.00000	\$205,700.000	\$550.000	
112	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$11.00000	\$44,000.000	\$550.000	
113	DIAMOND K SOLUBLE 0-0-50	SOM 0-0-52	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$28.00000	\$56,000.000	\$1,400.000	
114	MILORGANIC 6-20-0		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$14.25000	\$57,000.000	\$712.500	
115	SCU 50% + MERIT 32-3-8	21-0-4	50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$19.90000	\$995.000	\$995.000	
116	0-50-30 PLANT MARVEL		500	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
117	AWARD 14-14-14 CONTAINER & SHRUB FERTILIZER	CALBER COTE 14-14-14	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$55.00000	\$27,500.000	\$2,750.000	
118	CITRAPLEX (LOVELAND) CHELATED IRON POWDER		575	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
119	HAFA 12-61-00 (HAFA MONO AMMONIUM PHOSPHATE)		500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
120	PROFILE GREENSGRADE		1000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
121	HOLGANIX 8-3-5 GREENSGRADE 90 SGN		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
122	HOLGANIX PB1		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
123	HOLGANIX LAWN		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
124	HOLGANIX Golf		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
125	HOLGANIX AGRICULTURAL		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
126	HOLGANIX BLOOM		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
127	HOLGANIX TREE & SHRUB		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
128	EARTHWORKS 3-4-3 IS 100% EGG LAYER POULTRY COMPOST		6000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
129	UREA HUMIC COATED 44-0-0 (ANDERSONS)		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
130	18-0-18 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER		4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
									Category Total	\$391,384.000

BIDDER NAME: SiteOne Landscape Supply										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 2: SPECIALTY CHEMICALS										
Fertilizers and Micronutrients										
110	AMMONIUM SULFATE 21-0-0 SOLUBLE	21-0-0E As Solugreen	700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$0.21000	\$147.000	\$10.500	
111	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE	46-0-0 Urea Gran	18700	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$0.20500	\$3,833.500	\$10.250	
112	UREA 46-0-0 SOLUBLE	46-0-0 Urea Gran	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$0.20500	\$820.000	\$10.250	
113	DIAMOND K SOLUBLE 0-0-50	No Bid	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
114	MILORGANIC 6-20-0	Milorganite Classic 6-2-0	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	50	\$0.18200	\$728.000	\$9.100	
115	SCU 50% + MERIT 32-3-8	No Bid	50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
116	0-50-30 PLANT MARVEL	No Bid	500	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
117	AWARD 14-14-14 CONTAINER & SHRUB FERTILIZER	14-14-14 L&O Micro	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)	40	\$0.55000	\$275.000	\$22.000	
118	CITRAPLEX (LOVELAND) CHELATED IRON POWDER	No Bid	575	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
119	HAFA 12-61-00 (HAFA MONO AMMONIUM PHOSPHATE)	No Bid	500	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
120	PROFILE GREENSGRADE	No Bid	1000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
121	HOLGANIX 8-3-5 GREENSGRADE 90 SGN	No Bid	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
122	HOLGANIX PB1	No Bid	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
123	HOLGANIX LAWN	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
124	HOLGANIX Golf	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
125	HOLGANIX AGRICULTURAL	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
126	HOLGANIX BLOOM	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
127	HOLGANIX TREE & SHRUB	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
128	EARTHWORKS 3-4-3 IS 100% EGG LAYER POULTRY COMPOST	No Bid	6000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
129	UREA HUMIC COATED 44-0-0 (ANDERSONS)	No Bid	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG		-- enter price per unit			
130	18-0-18 GREENS GRADE FERTILIZER	Leisco 18-0-18E 100% Polyplus 3M SGP 1.2 Ft 0.6 Mn	4000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S) BAG	50	\$0.58100	\$2,324.000	\$29.050	
									Category Total	\$8,127.500

BIDDER NAME: Advanced Turf Solutions									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE
Growth Regulators									
131	LEGACY TURF		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$380.00000	\$9,500,000	\$1,900,000
132	PRIMO MAXX	ArmorTech PGR 113	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$138.75000	\$3,468,750	\$698,750
133	PODIUM	ArmorTech PGR 113	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$138.75000	\$3,468,750	\$698,750
134	T-NEX	ArmorTech PGR 113	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$138.75000	\$3,468,750	\$698,750
135	T-NEX	ArmorTech PGR 113	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$138.75000	\$6,987,500	\$349,375
136	T-NEX	ArmorTech PGR 113	12	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$160.10000	\$1,921,200	\$160,100
137	TIDE PACLO 25C	ArmorTech PAC 223	5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$188.33000	\$941,650	\$188,330
							Category Total	\$29,831,600	
Wetting Agents									
138	MIZER LOVELAND		65	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
139	E-Z MIX LOVELAND		20	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
140	CANISTER'S SOAP CARTRIDGES FOR USE WITH AQUA GRO GUN		120	CARTRIDGE	12 CARTRIDGES				-- enter price per unit
141	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT		35	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
142	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT		105	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	\$0.000	

BIDDER NAME: HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATE D ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATE D PRICE
Growth Regulators									
131	LEGACY TURF		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$380.00000	\$9,500,000	\$1,900,000
132	PRIMO MAXX		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$290.00000	\$7,250,000	\$1,450,000
133	PODIUM		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$125.00000	\$3,125,000	\$625,000
134	T-NEX		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$113.00000	\$2,825,000	\$565,000
135	T-NEX		50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$113.00000	\$5,650,000	\$282,500
136	T-NEX		12	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$115.00000	\$1,380,000	\$115,000
137	TIDE PACLO 25C		5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$160.00000	\$800,000	\$160,000
							Category Total	\$30,530,000	
Wetting Agents									
138	MIZER LOVELAND	INJECTOR	65	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$19.00000	\$1,235,000	\$95,000
139	E-Z MIX LOVELAND		20	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
140	CANISTER'S SOAP CARTRIDGES FOR USE WITH AQUA GRO GUN	INTEGRATE PELLETS	120	CARTRIDGE	12 CARTRIDGE S	12	\$12.75000	\$1,530,000	\$153,000
141	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT		35	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
142	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT		105	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	\$2,765,000	

BIDDER NAME: SiteOne Landscape Supply									
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.									
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE
Growth Regulators									
131	LEGACY TURF	Legacy	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$380.00000	\$9,500,000	\$1,900,000
132	PRIMO MAXX	Primo Maxx	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	10	\$290.00000	\$7,250,000	\$2,900,000
133	PODIUM		25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				-- enter price per unit
134	T-NEX	T-Nex	25	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$115.22000	\$2,880,500	\$576,100
135	T-NEX	T-Nex	50	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$115.22000	\$5,761,000	\$288,050
136	T-NEX	T-Nex	12	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$115.00000	\$1,380,000	\$115,000
137	TIDE PACLO 25C	No Bid	5	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	\$26,771,500	
Wetting Agents									
138	MIZER LOVELAND	Lesco Wet Plus	65	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$28.52000	\$1,723,800	\$132,600
139	E-Z MIX LOVELAND	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
140	CANISTER'S SOAP CARTRIDGES FOR USE WITH AQUA GRO GUN	No Bid	120	CARTRIDGE	12 CARTRIDGES			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
141	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT	No Bid	35	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
142	SOUTHER AG NON-ICNIC SURFACTANT	No Bid	105	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)			\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	\$1,723,800	

Advanced Turf Solutions										
BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 3: FISH AND HATCHERY										
143	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	NO BID	110	POUND(S)	10 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
144	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	NO BID	100	POUND(S)	20 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
145	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	NO BID	2400	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
146	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	NO BID	1200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
147	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% GRANULAR	NO BID	10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
148	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% LIQUID	NO BID	1200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
149	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)	NO BID	400	POUND(S)	8 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
150	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)	NO BID	200	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
151	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
152	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	NO BID	10	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
153	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (LIQUID-AGRI-DEX, OTHERS) (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	NO BID	10	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
154	FERTILIZER, NITROGEN-ALL (28-0-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	NO BID	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
155	FERTILIZER, PHOSPHORUS (ALL) (0-75-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	NO BID	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
156	AWARD FERTILIZER (ALL) (14-14-14, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	NO BID	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
157	PARASITE-S (FORMALIN) (AQUATIC) (FORMALDEHYDE (25-50%), METHANOL (10-25%))	NO BID	2000	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
158	PEROX-AID (35%) (AQUATIC), HYDROGEN PEROXIDE (LIQUID)	NO BID	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
159	PEROX-AID (35%) (LIQUID) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)	NO BID	110	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
160	PEROX-AID (35%) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)	NO BID	110	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
161	HALAMID AQUA (CHLORAMINE-T)	NO BID	7.5	GRAMS (GM)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
162	HALAMID AQUA (AQUATIC) (CHLORAMINE-T)	NO BID	64	OUNCE(S)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
163	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
164	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)	NO BID	10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
165	CUTRINE PLUS (COPPER ETHANOLAMINE COMPLEX, 27.9%)	NO BID	50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
166	AVASTSC (FLURIDONE 41.7%) SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	NO BID	20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
167	SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	5 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
168	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	8 OUNCE(S)		-- enter price per unit			
169	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	1 QUART		-- enter price per unit			
170	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
171	RANGER PRO TERRESTRIAL (GLYPHOSATE 41%)		30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$15,120.00	\$453,600	\$37,800	
172	AQUANEAT GRANULAR FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)	NO BID	54	POUND(S)	5.4 POUND(S)					
173	AQUANEAT LIQUID FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)		50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$18,720.00	\$936,000	\$46,800	
174	AQUASHADE	NO BID	50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)					
Category Total									\$1,399,600	

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN										
BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 3: FISH AND HATCHERY										
143	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)		110	POUND(S)	10 POUND(S)	10	\$23.00000	\$2,530.000	\$230.000	
144	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)		100	POUND(S)	20 POUND(S)	20	\$21.43000	\$2,143.000	\$428.600	
145	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)		2400	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
146	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)		1200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$75.86000	\$91,176.000	\$189,950	
147	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% GRANULAR		10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
148	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% LIQUID		1200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
149	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)		400	POUND(S)	8 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
150	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)		200	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)	50	\$2,820.000	\$564,000	\$141,000	
151	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)		30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$10.00000	\$300.000	\$50,000	
152	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)		10	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$12.00000	\$120.000	\$30,000	
153	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (LIQUID-AGRI-DEX, OTHERS) (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)		10	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
154	FERTILIZER, NITROGEN-ALL (28-0-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)		2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
155	FERTILIZER, PHOSPHORUS (ALL) (0-75-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)		2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
156	AWARD FERTILIZER (ALL) (14-14-14, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)		2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
157	PARASITE-S (FORMALIN) (AQUATIC) (FORMALDEHYDE (25-50%), METHANOL (10-25%))		2000	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
158	PEROX-AID (35%) (AQUATIC), HYDROGEN PEROXIDE (LIQUID)		60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
159	PEROX-AID (35%) (LIQUID) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)		110	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
160	PEROX-AID (35%) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)		110	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
161	HALAMID AQUA (CHLORAMINE-T)		7.5	GRAMS (GM)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
162	HALAMID AQUA (AQUATIC) (CHLORAMINE-T)		64	OUNCE(S)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
163	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)		20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
164	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)		10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
165	CUTRINE PLUS (COPPER ETHANOLAMINE COMPLEX, 27.9%)		50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$24.00000	\$1,200.000	\$24,000	
166	AVASTSC (FLURIDONE 41.7%) SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)		20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$1,879.00000	\$37,580.000	\$1,879,000	
167	SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)		30	GALLON(S)	5 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
168	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)		30	GALLON(S)	8 OUNCE(S)		-- enter price per unit			
169	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)		30	GALLON(S)	1 QUART	1	\$2,796.00000	\$83,880.000	\$2,796,000	
170	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)		30	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$1,979.22000	\$59,376.600	\$1,979,220	
171	RANGER PRO TERRESTRIAL (GLYPHOSATE 41%)		30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$11.25000	\$337.500	\$28,125	
172	AQUANEAT GRANULAR FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)		54	POUND(S)	5.4 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
173	AQUANEAT LIQUID FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)		50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
174	AQUASHADE		50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$38.00000	\$1,900.000	\$38,000	
Category Total									\$281,107.100	

SiteOne Landscape Supply										
BIDDER NAME: Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 3: FISH AND HATCHERY										
143	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	No Bid	110	POUND(S)	10 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
144	AQUATHOL (AQUATIC) GRANULAR (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	No Bid	100	POUND(S)	20 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
145	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	No Bid	2400	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
146	AQUATHOL K (AQUATIC) LIQUID (DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3%)	No Bid	1200	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
147	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% GRANULAR	No Bid	10	POUND(S)	1 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
148	DIPOTASSIUM SALT OF ENDOTHALL 40.3% LIQUID	No Bid	1200	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
149	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)	No Bid	400	POUND(S)	8 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
150	CASORON (DICHLOBENIL 2% - GRANULAR) TERRESTRIAL (DICHLOBENIL 2%)	No Bid	200	POUND(S)	25 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
151	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
152	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	No Bid	10	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
153	CROP OIL CONCENTRATE (LIQUID-AGRI-DEX, OTHERS) (AGRI-DEX, OTHER, PARAFFIN BASE PETROLEUM OIL, POLYOL FATTY ACID ESTERS, POLYETHOXYLATED DERIVATIVES)	No Bid	10	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
154	FERTILIZER, NITROGEN-ALL (28-0-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	No Bid	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
155	FERTILIZER, PHOSPHORUS (ALL) (0-75-0, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	No Bid	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
156	AWARD FERTILIZER (ALL) (14-14-14, GRANULAR, SOLUBLE)	No Bid	2000	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
157	PARASITE-S (FORMALIN) (AQUATIC) (FORMALDEHYDE (25-50%), METHANOL (10-25%))	No Bid	2000	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
158	PEROX-AID (35%) (AQUATIC), HYDROGEN PEROXIDE (LIQUID)	No Bid	60	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
159	PEROX-AID (35%) (LIQUID) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)	No Bid	110	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
160	PEROX-AID (35%) (HYDROGEN PEROXIDE)	No Bid	110	GALLON(S)	55 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
161	HALAMID AQUA (CHLORAMINE-T)	No Bid	7.5	GRAMS (GM)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
162	HALAMID AQUA (AQUATIC) (CHLORAMINE-T)	No Bid	64	OUNCE(S)	AS PRESCRIBED		-- enter price per unit			
163	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
164	OVADINE (AQUATIC) (PVP IODINE, BUFFERED)	No Bid	10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
165	CUTRINE PLUS (COPPER ETHANOLAMINE COMPLEX, 27.9%)	No Bid	50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
166	AVASTSC (FLURIDONE 41.7%) SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	No Bid	20	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
167	SONAR AQUATIC GRANULAR (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	5 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
168	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	8 OUNCE(S)		-- enter price per unit			
169	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	1 QUART		-- enter price per unit			
170	SONAR AQUATIC (FLURIDONE 41.7%)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
171	RANGER PRO TERRESTRIAL (GLYPHOSATE 41%)	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
172	AQUANEAT GRANULAR FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)	No Bid	54	POUND(S)	5.4 POUND(S)		-- enter price per unit			
173	AQUANEAT LIQUID FORM (GLYPHOSATE 53.8%)	No Bid	50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
174	AQUASHADE	No Bid	50	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)		-- enter price per unit			
Category Total									\$0.000	

Advanced Turf Solutions										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 4: MISCELLANEOUS CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES										
175	POLYMER PELLETS HYDROZONE	NO BID	50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit
176	ANTI-FOAMER TANK	NO BID	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
177	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	Precision Labs Knockdown Defoamer	24	QUART(S)	12 QUARTS	12	\$14.81000	\$355.440	\$177.720	
178	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	NO BID	256	OUNCE(S)	12 OUNCE(S)					-- enter price per unit
179	DISCLOSE TANK PH REDUCER	Precision Labs New Balance	12	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)	4	\$27.85000	\$334.200	\$111.400	
180	TREKKER TRAX LOVELAND BOOM FOAM MARKER AGENT	NO BID	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
181	TUFF TRAX FOAM CONCENTRATE	No BID	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
182	MONTERAY SPRAY TANK CLEANER	NO BID	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
183	BLAZON NO WATER SOLUBLE BAGS	NO BID	10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
184	LECI-TECH LI 700	NO BID	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
185	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	Precision Labs Erase Spray System Cleaner	82	OUNCE(S)	32 OZ	32	\$0.39000	\$31.980	\$12.480	
186	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	NO BID	8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
187	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	NO BID	160	OUNCE(S)	16 OUNCE(S)					-- enter price per unit
188	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV INJECTION PORTS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
189	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV DRILL BITS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
190	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV PRESSURE PUMPS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
191	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV LITER PLASTIC BOTTLES	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
192	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
193	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
194	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV FITTING	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
195	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV NEEDLES	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
196	HANDHELD PUMP	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
197	SPRAYERS	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
198	SMITH PREMIUM NL 400 BACKPACK SPRAYER	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
199	SMITH PREMIUM NL R300 BACKPACK SPRAYER	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
200	SMITH PREMIUM NL R200 BACKPACK SPRAYER	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
201	FLOW NOZZLES	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
202	PPE - SAFETY GLASSES	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
203	NITRILE GLOVES	NO BID	1							-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	721.62		
ALL CATEGORY TOTAL								\$193,759.53		

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY, CHAD ALLEN										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 4: MISCELLANEOUS CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES										
175	POLYMER PELLETS HYDROZONE		50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)					-- enter price per unit
176	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	FOAM BUSTER	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$32.00000	\$64.000	\$32.000	
177	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	FOAM BUSTER	24	QUART(S)	12 QUARTS	1	\$7.75000	\$186.000	\$7.750	
178	TANK ANTI-FOAMER		256	OUNCE(S)	12 OUNCE(S)					-- enter price per unit
179	DISCLOSE TANK PH REDUCER	BUFFER PS	12	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)	1	\$21.00000	\$252.000	\$21.000	
180	TREKKER TRAX LOVELAND BOOM FOAM MARKER AGENT		15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	1	\$26.00000	\$390.000	\$26.000	
181	TUFF TRAX FOAM CONCENTRATE	ALIGN	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	1	\$42.00000	\$630.000	\$42.000	
182	MONTERAY SPRAY TANK CLEANER	WIPE OUT	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	1	\$32.00000	\$480.000	\$32.000	
183	BLAZON NO WATER SOLUBLE BAGS		10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)					-- enter price per unit
184	LECI-TECH LI 700	INDUCE PH	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)	2.5	\$26.00000	\$780.000	\$65.000	
185	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	WIPE OUT	82	OUNCE(S)	32 OZ	32	\$0.44000	\$36.080	\$14.080	
186	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	WIPE OUT	8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$32.00000	\$256.000	\$32.000	
187	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER		160	OUNCE(S)	16 OUNCE(S)					-- enter price per unit
188	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV INJECTION PORTS		1							-- enter price per unit
189	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV DRILL BITS		1							-- enter price per unit
190	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV PRESSURE PUMPS		1							-- enter price per unit
191	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV LITER PLASTIC BOTTLES		1							-- enter price per unit
192	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS		1							-- enter price per unit
193	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS		1							-- enter price per unit
194	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV FITTING		1							-- enter price per unit
195	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV NEEDLES		1							-- enter price per unit
196	HANDHELD PUMP		1							-- enter price per unit
197	SPRAYERS		1							-- enter price per unit
198	SMITH PREMIUM NL 400 BACKPACK SPRAYER		1							-- enter price per unit
199	SMITH PREMIUM NL R300 BACKPACK SPRAYER		1							-- enter price per unit
200	SMITH PREMIUM NL R200 BACKPACK SPRAYER		1							-- enter price per unit
201	FLOW NOZZLES		1							-- enter price per unit
202	PPE - SAFETY GLASSES		1							-- enter price per unit
203	NITRILE GLOVES		1							-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	3974.68		
ALL CATEGORY TOTAL								\$1,012,665.52		

SiteOne Landscape Supply										
Bidder: Fill-in your Bid information in the green shaded areas of the table, below.										
BID ITEM NUMBER	ITEM DESCRIPTION	PROPOSED EQUIVALENT OR BRAND SUBSTITUTE	ESTIMATED ANNUAL USAGE	UNIT OF MEASURE	DESIRED PACKAGE SIZE	OFFERED PACKAGE SIZE	PRICE PER UNIT OF MEASURE	LINE ITEM TOTAL	CALCULATED PRICE	
CATEGORY 4: MISCELLANEOUS CHEMICALS AND SUPPLIES										
175	POLYMER PELLETS HYDROZONE	No Bid	50	POUND(S)	50 POUND(S)				\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
176	ANTI-FOAMER TANK	Recede	2	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$37.20000	\$74.400	\$297.600	
177	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	Recede	24	QUART(S)	12 QUARTS	2	\$9.30000	\$223.200	\$18.600	
178	TANK ANTI-FOAMER	Recede	256	OUNCE(S)	12 OUNCE(S)	16	\$0.29100	\$74.496	\$4.656	
179	DISCLOSE TANK PH REDUCER	Conform	12	GALLON(S)	4 GALLON(S)	1	\$27.55000	\$330.600	\$27.550	
180	TREKKER TRAX LOVELAND BOOM FOAM MARKER AGENT	No Bid	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
181	TUFF TRAX FOAM CONCENTRATE	No Bid	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
182	MONTERAY SPRAY TANK CLEANER	LescoSol	15	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)	5	\$24.60000	\$369.000	\$123.000	
183	BLAZON NO WATER SOLUBLE BAGS	No Bid	10	GALLON(S)	5 GALLON(S)				\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
184	LECI-TECH LI 700	No Bid	30	GALLON(S)	2.5 GALLON(S)				\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
185	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	LescoSol	82	OUNCE(S)	32 OZ	32	\$0.19200	\$15.744	\$6.144	
186	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	LescoSol (32 oz/cont.)	8	GALLON(S)	1 GALLON(S)	1	\$24.60000	\$196.800	\$24.600	
187	BLAZER SPRAY TANK CLEANER	LescoSol	160	OUNCE(S)	16 OUNCE(S)	32	\$0.19200	\$30.720	\$6.144	
188	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV INJECTION PORTS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
189	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV DRILL BITS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
190	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV PRESSURE PUMPS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
191	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV LITER PLASTIC BOTTLES	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
192	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
193	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV SYSTEM SEALS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
194	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV FITTING	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
195	ARBORJECTS F-SERIES TREE IV NEEDLES	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
196	HANDHELD PUMP	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
197	SPRAYERS	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
198	SMITH PREMIUM NL 400 BACKPACK SPRAYER	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
199	SMITH PREMIUM NL R300 BACKPACK SPRAYER	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
200	SMITH PREMIUM NL R200 BACKPACK SPRAYER	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
201	FLOW NOZZLES	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
202	PPE - SAFETY GLASSES	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
203	NITRILE GLOVES	No Bid	1						\$0.00000	-- enter price per unit
							Category Total	1314.96		
ALL CATEGORY TOTAL								\$164,411.22		