

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7				
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum				
DEL. OFFERED												
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH				
District 1												
District 1												
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane			NO BID		NO BID							
Tank Wagon Delivery	270,000	0.088	\$23,760.00		0.180	\$48,600.00	0.191	\$51,570.00	0.516	\$139,266.00	0.148	\$39,960.00
Transport Delivery	41,000	0.018	\$738.00		0.029	\$1,189.00	0.040	\$1,640.00	0.030	\$1,234.10	\$ (0.001)	\$ (41.00)
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000	0.138	\$138.00		0.180	\$180.00	0.191	\$191.00	0.516	\$515.80	0.148	\$148.00
Transport Delivery	1,000	0.038	\$38.00		0.029	\$29.00	0.040	\$40.00	0.029	\$28.50	\$ (0.001)	\$ (1.00)
# 2 Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	150,000	0.088	\$13,200.00		0.180	\$27,000.00	0.191	\$28,650.00	0.516	\$77,370.00	0.148	\$22,200.00
Transport Delivery	55,000	0.038	\$2,090.00		0.015	\$825.00	0.027	\$1,485.00	0.006	\$308.00	\$ (0.002)	\$ (110.00)
# 2 Dyed Fuel												
Tank Wagon Delivery	8,500	0.148	\$1,258.00		0.180	\$1,530.00	0.191	\$1,623.50	0.516	\$4,384.30	0.148	\$1,258.00
Transport Delivery	1,000	0.048	\$48.00		0.014	\$14.00	0.025	\$25.00	0.006	\$5.60	0.008	\$8.00
Premium Diesel Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	175,000	0.118	\$20,650.00		0.206	\$36,050.00	0.217	\$37,975.00	0.546	\$95,515.00	0.168	\$29,400.00
Transport Delivery	60,000	0.068	\$4,080.00		0.041	\$2,460.00	0.053	\$3,180.00	0.031	\$1,836.00	0.009	\$540.00
Premium Diesel Dyed												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000	0.178	\$178.00		0.206	\$206.00	0.217	\$217.00	0.546	\$545.80	0.168	\$168.00
Transport Delivery	1,000	0.078	\$78.00		0.040	\$40.00	0.051	\$51.00	0.031	\$30.60	0.009	\$9.00
#1 Fuel Oil												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000	0.400	\$400.00		0.180	\$180.00	0.191	\$191.00	0.486	\$485.80	0.185	\$185.00
Transport Delivery	1,000	0.050	\$50.00		\$ (0.057)	\$ (57.00)	\$ (0.047)	\$ (47.00)	0.034	\$34.30	0.049	\$49.00
District 1 Total Differential	Awardee	\$66,706.00				\$118,246.00		\$126,791.50		\$321,559.80		\$93,773.00
<p>EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will: multiply the estimated usage of each line item for State entities times the bid cost differential per gallon. These totals will then be added together to determine the lowest cost differential per district. Any item shown with an unknown quantity will be evaluated on the quantity of one (1). COOP usage is shown for informational purposes and will not be part of the evaluation.</p> <p style="text-align: right;"><u>CONTRACT</u></p> <p>AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by bid district. Failure to bid all items (tank wagon and transport) may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive.</p>												
District 2												
District 2												

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID				NO BID		
Tank Wagon Delivery	230,000		0.105 \$24,150.00	0.180 \$41,400.00		0.191 \$43,930.00	0.516 \$118,634.00	0.120 \$27,600.00
Transport Delivery	12,000		0.032 \$384.00	0.027 \$324.00		0.038 \$456.00	0.048 \$578.40	\$ (0.002) \$ (24.00)
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	100		0.105 \$10.50	0.180 \$18.00		0.191 \$19.10	0.516 \$51.58	0.120 \$12.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.032 \$32.00	0.026 \$26.00		0.038 \$38.00	0.039 \$39.10	\$ (0.002) \$ (2.00)
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	86,000		0.087 \$7,482.00	0.180 \$15,480.00		0.191 \$16,426.00	0.516 \$44,358.80	0.120 \$10,320.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.022 \$22.00	0.021 \$21.00		0.032 \$32.00	0.017 \$17.20	\$ (0.003) \$ (3.00)
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	55,000		0.087 \$4,785.00	0.180 \$9,900.00		0.191 \$10,505.00	0.516 \$28,369.00	0.120 \$6,600.00
Transport Delivery	32,000		0.022 \$704.00	0.020 \$640.00		0.032 \$1,024.00	0.017 \$550.40	\$ (0.003) \$ (96.00)
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	45,000		0.102 \$4,590.00	0.206 \$9,270.00		0.217 \$9,765.00	0.541 \$24,336.00	0.140 \$6,300.00
Transport Delivery	14,000		0.037 \$518.00	0.047 \$658.00		0.058 \$812.00	0.042 \$590.80	0.009 \$126.00
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	2,000		0.102 \$204.00	0.206 \$412.00		0.217 \$434.00	0.541 \$1,081.60	0.140 \$280.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.037 \$37.00	0.046 \$46.00		0.058 \$58.00	0.042 \$42.20	0.009 \$9.00
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	100		0.160 \$16.00	0.180 \$18.00		0.191 \$19.10	0.606 \$60.58	0.180 \$18.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.052 \$52.00	0.113 \$113.00		0.124 \$124.00	0.167 \$167.40	0.052 \$52.00
District 2 Total Differential			\$42,986.50	\$78,326.00		\$83,642.20	\$218,877.06	\$51,192.00
			Awardee					
District 3								
District 3								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID				NO BID		
Tank Wagon Delivery	178,000		0.085 \$15,130.00	0.065 \$11,570.00		0.076 \$13,528.00	0.516 \$91,812.40	0.090 \$16,020.00
Transport Delivery	164,000		0.030 \$4,920.00	0.022 \$3,608.00		0.033 \$5,412.00	0.107 \$17,564.40	0.000 0.00
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.085 \$85.00	0.055 \$55.00		0.067 \$67.00	0.516 \$515.80	0.090 \$90.00

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.030 \$30.00	0.013 \$13.00		0.024 \$24.00	0.082 \$81.70	0.000 0.00
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	48,000		0.075 \$3,600.00	0.057 \$2,736.00		0.069 \$3,312.00	0.516 \$24,758.40	0.090 \$4,320.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.018 \$18.00	0.020 \$20.00		0.032 \$32.00	0.043 \$43.00	0.000 0.00
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	16,000		0.075 \$1,200.00	0.049 \$784.00		0.061 \$976.00	0.516 \$8,252.80	0.090 \$1,440.00
Transport Delivery	29,000		0.018 \$522.00	0.012 \$348.00		0.024 \$696.00	0.043 \$1,247.00	0.000 0.00
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	62,000		0.090 \$5,580.00	0.077 \$4,774.00		0.089 \$5,518.00	0.541 \$33,529.60	0.110 \$6,820.00
Transport Delivery	21,000		0.033 \$693.00	0.040 \$840.00		0.052 \$1,092.00	0.068 \$1,428.00	0.004 \$84.00
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	6,000		0.090 \$540.00	0.069 \$414.00		0.081 \$486.00	0.541 \$3,244.80	0.110 \$660.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.033 \$33.00	0.032 \$32.00		0.044 \$44.00	0.068 \$68.00	0.004 \$4.00
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	100		0.160 \$16.00	0.000 \$0.00		0.012 \$1.20	0.516 \$51.58	0.180 \$18.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.055 \$55.00	0.000 \$0.00		0.020 \$20.00	0.105 \$104.80	0.028 \$28.00
District 3 Total Differential			\$32,422.00	\$25,194.00		\$31,208.20	\$182,702.28	\$29,484.00
				Awardee				
District 4								
District 4								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane	NO BID				NO BID			
Tank Wagon Delivery	392,000		0.125 \$49,000.00	0.062 \$24,304.00		0.073 \$28,616.00	0.516 \$202,193.60	0.090 \$35,280.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.032 \$32.00	0.022 \$22.00		0.033 \$33.00	0.036 \$35.80	\$ (0.002) \$ (2.000)
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.125 \$125.00	0.052 \$52.00		0.063 \$63.00	0.516 \$515.80	0.009 \$9.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.032 \$32.00	0.008 \$8.00		0.019 \$19.00	0.004 \$3.90	\$ (0.002) \$ (2.000)
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	7,000		0.122 \$854.00	0.052 \$364.00		0.063 \$441.00	0.516 \$3,610.60	0.009 \$63.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.030 \$30.00	0.018 \$18.00		0.029 \$29.00	0.030 \$30.20	\$ (0.002) \$ (2.000)
# 2 Dyed Fuel								

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1		2		3		4		5		6		7	
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop		Great Lakes Petroleum		Hightowers Petroleum Co.		JT Dillard, LLC.		Lykins Oil Company		Mansfield Oil Company		Ports Petroleum	
DEL. OFFERED															
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH		Cleveland, OH		Middletown, OH		Milford, OH		Milford, OH		Gainesville, GA		Wooster, OH	
Tank Wagon Delivery	10,000			0.122	\$1,220.00	0.047	\$470.00			0.058	\$580.00	0.516	\$5,158.00	0.009	\$90.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.030	\$30.00	0.008	\$8.00			0.020	\$20.00	0.030	\$30.20	\$ (0.002)	\$ (2.000)
Premium Diesel Clear															
Tank Wagon Delivery	330,000			0.137	\$45,210.00	0.068	\$22,440.00			0.079	\$26,070.00	0.541	\$178,464.00	0.110	\$36,300.00
Transport Delivery	5,100			0.045	\$229.50	0.038	\$193.80			0.049	\$249.90	0.055	\$281.52	0.005	\$25.50
Premium Diesel Dyed															
Tank Wagon Delivery	2,500			0.137	\$342.50	0.067	\$167.50			0.078	\$195.00	0.541	\$1,352.00	0.110	\$275.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.045	\$45.00	0.028	\$28.00			0.040	\$40.00	0.055	\$55.20	0.005	\$5.00
#1 Fuel Oil															
Tank Wagon Delivery	500			0.160	\$80.00	0.062	\$31.00			0.073	\$36.50	0.516	\$257.90	0.180	\$90.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.055	\$55.00	0.068	\$68.00			0.079	\$79.00	0.072	\$72.10	0.029	\$29.00
District 4 Total Differential					\$97,285.00		\$48,174.30				\$56,471.40		\$392,060.82		\$72,158.50
							Awardee								
District 5															
District 5															
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane															
				NO BID				NO BID							
Tank Wagon Delivery	272,000			0.145	\$39,440.00	0.130	\$35,360.00			0.141	\$38,352.00	0.516	\$140,297.60	0.100	\$27,200.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.080	\$80.00	\$ (0.006)	\$ (6.00)			0.005	\$5.00	0.079	\$78.90	\$ (0.004)	\$ (4.00)
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane															
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.145	\$145.00	0.130	\$130.00			0.141	\$141.00	0.516	\$515.80	0.100	\$100.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.080	\$80.00	\$ (0.016)	\$ (16.00)			\$ (0.005)	\$ (5.00)	0.095	\$94.90	\$ (0.004)	\$ (4.00)
# 2 Clear															
Tank Wagon Delivery	91,000			0.145	\$13,195.00	0.135	\$12,285.00			0.146	\$13,286.00	0.516	\$46,937.80	0.100	\$9,100.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.080	\$80.00	0.003	\$3.00			0.014	\$14.00	0.744	\$744.00	\$ (0.004)	\$ (4.00)
# 2 Dyed Fuel															
Tank Wagon Delivery	36,000			0.145	\$5,220.00	0.135	\$4,860.00			0.146	\$5,256.00	0.516	\$18,568.80	0.100	\$3,600.00
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.080	\$80.00	0.001	\$1.00			0.012	\$12.00	0.074	\$74.40	\$ (0.003)	\$ (3.00)
Premium Diesel Clear															
Tank Wagon Delivery	105,000			0.165	\$17,325.00	0.166	\$17,430.00			0.177	\$18,585.00	0.541	\$56,784.00	0.100	\$10,500.00

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7				
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum				
DEL. OFFERED												
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH				
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.100	\$100.00	0.034	\$34.00	0.045	\$45.00	0.102	\$101.80	\$ (0.003)	\$ (3.00)
Premium Diesel Dyed												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,300		0.165	\$214.50	0.166	\$215.80	0.177	\$230.10	0.541	\$703.04	0.125	\$162.50
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.100	\$100.00	0.032	\$32.00	0.043	\$43.00	0.102	\$101.80	0.004	\$4.00
#1 Fuel Oil												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.180	\$180.00	0.135	\$135.00	0.146	\$146.00	0.516	\$515.80	0.125	\$125.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080	\$80.00	0.038	\$38.00	0.049	\$49.00	0.128	\$128.40	0.029	\$29.00
District 5 Total Differential			\$76,319.50		\$70,501.80		\$76,159.10		\$265,647.04			\$50,802.50
												Awardee
District 6	MBE Set Aside											
District 6												
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID	NO BID					NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
Tank Wagon Delivery	775,000			0.094	\$72,850.00	0.095	\$73,625.00					
Transport Delivery	315,000			0.029	\$9,135.00	0.044	\$13,860.00					
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.089	\$89.00	0.095	\$95.00					
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.024	\$24.00	0.044	\$44.00					
# 2 Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	220,000			0.093	\$20,460.00	0.090	\$19,800.00					
Transport Delivery	20,000			0.028	\$560.00	0.042	\$840.00					
# 2 Dyed Fuel												
Tank Wagon Delivery	55,000			0.085	\$4,675.00	0.090	\$4,950.00					
Transport Delivery	25,000			0.020	\$500.00	0.042	\$1,050.00					
Premium Diesel Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	235,000			0.108	\$25,380.00	0.105	\$24,675.00					
Transport Delivery	7,500			0.043	\$322.50	0.057	\$427.50					
Premium Diesel Dyed												
Tank Wagon Delivery	45,000			0.100	\$4,500.00	0.105	\$4,725.00					
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.035	\$35.00	0.057	\$57.00					
#1 Fuel Oil												

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.068	\$68.00	0.160	\$160.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.003	\$3.00	0.050	\$50.00	
District 6 Total Differential				\$138,601.50		\$144,358.50		
				Awardee				
District 7	MBE Set Aside							
District 7								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID	NO BID				NO BID	NO BID
Tank Wagon Delivery	375,000			0.100	\$37,500.00	0.119	\$44,625.00	
Transport Delivery	7,000			0.050	\$350.00	0.066	\$462.00	
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.105	\$105.00	0.119	\$119.00	
Transport Delivery	40,000			0.056	\$2,240.00	0.066	\$2,640.00	
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	165,000			0.099	\$16,335.00	0.117	\$19,305.00	
Transport Delivery	260,000			0.057	\$14,820.00	0.056	\$14,560.00	
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	55,000			0.069	\$3,795.00	0.117	\$6,435.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.027	\$27.00	0.056	\$56.00	
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	235,000			0.119	\$27,965.00	0.132	\$31,020.00	
Transport Delivery	155,000			0.077	\$11,935.00	0.071	\$11,005.00	
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	15,000			0.089	\$1,335.00	0.132	\$1,980.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.047	\$47.00	0.071	\$71.00	
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.084	\$84.00	0.160	\$160.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.042	\$42.00	0.055	\$55.00	
District 7 Total Differential				\$116,580.00		\$132,493.00		
District 7 Preference Total								

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
				Awardee				
District 8	MBE Set Aside							
District 8								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID	NO BID			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
Tank Wagon Delivery	725,000			0.136	\$98,310.00	0.116	\$84,100.00	
Transport Delivery	345,000			0.072	\$24,943.50	0.063	\$21,735.00	
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	20,000			0.129	\$2,570.00	0.116	\$2,320.00	
Transport Delivery	85,000			0.065	\$5,542.00	0.063	\$5,355.00	
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	175,000			0.125	\$21,805.00	0.112	\$19,600.00	
Transport Delivery	45,000			0.062	\$2,776.50	0.056	\$2,520.00	
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	30,000			0.139	\$4,176.00	0.112	\$3,360.00	
Transport Delivery	7,500			0.076	\$572.25	0.056	\$420.00	
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	300,000			0.145	\$43,380.00	0.127	\$38,100.00	
Transport Delivery	30,000			0.082	\$2,451.00	0.071	\$2,130.00	
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	35,000			0.159	\$5,572.00	0.127	\$4,445.00	
Transport Delivery	7,000			0.096	\$674.10	0.071	\$497.00	
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.181	\$180.70	0.160	\$160.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.118	\$117.80	0.055	\$55.00	
District 8 Total Differential					\$213,070.85		\$184,797.00	
						Awardee		
District 9								
District 9								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID	NO BID			NO BID		

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7				
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum				
DEL. OFFERED												
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH				
Tank Wagon Delivery	245,900			0.114	\$28,032.60	0.125	\$30,737.50	0.516	\$126,835.22	0.130	\$31,967.00	
Transport Delivery	28,334			0.054	\$1,530.04	0.065	\$1,841.71	0.098	\$2,768.23	0.027	\$765.02	
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.051	\$51.10	0.062	\$62.00	0.516	\$515.80	0.130	\$130.00	
Transport Delivery	40,000			\$ (0.009)	\$ (360.00)	0.002	\$80.00	0.083	\$3,324.00	0.027	\$1,080.00	
# 2 Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	76,125			0.081	\$6,166.13	0.092	\$7,003.50	0.516	\$39,265.28	0.130	\$9,896.25	
Transport Delivery	26,160			0.025	\$654.00	0.036	\$941.76	0.093	\$2,443.34	0.022	\$575.52	
# 2 Dyed Fuel												
Tank Wagon Delivery	8,460			0.082	\$693.72	0.093	\$786.78	0.516	\$4,363.67	0.130	\$1,099.80	
Transport Delivery	2,906			0.026	\$75.56	0.038	\$110.43	0.093	\$271.42	0.022	\$63.93	
Premium Diesel Clear												
Tank Wagon Delivery	53,614			0.101	\$5,415.01	0.112	\$6,004.77	0.541	\$28,994.45	0.155	\$8,310.17	
Transport Delivery	39,867			0.045	\$1,794.02	0.056	\$2,232.55	0.118	\$4,720.25	0.027	\$1,076.41	
Premium Diesel Dyed												
Tank Wagon Delivery	5,957			0.102	\$607.61	0.113	\$673.14	0.541	\$3,221.55	0.155	\$923.34	
Transport Delivery	4,430			0.046	\$203.78	0.058	\$256.94	0.118	\$524.51	0.034	\$150.62	
#1 Fuel Oil												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000			0.156	\$156.00	0.167	\$167.00	0.556	\$555.80	0.175	\$175.00	
Transport Delivery	1,000			0.100	\$100.00	0.112	\$112.00	0.185	\$185.00	0.049	\$49.00	
District 9 Total Differential					\$45,119.56		\$51,010.08		\$217,988.52		\$56,262.05	
					Awardee							
District 10												
District 10												
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID				NO BID						
Tank Wagon Delivery	278,000		0.145	\$40,310.00	0.185	\$51,430.00	0.196	\$54,488.00	0.516	\$143,392.40	0.140	\$38,920.00
Transport Delivery	24,000		0.080	\$1,920.00	0.080	\$1,920.00	0.091	\$2,184.00	0.075	\$1,790.40	0.002	\$48.00
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane												
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.145	\$145.00	0.185	\$185.00	0.196	\$196.00	0.516	\$515.80	0.140	\$140.00

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.080 \$80.00		0.091 \$91.00	0.060 \$60.00	0.002 \$2.00
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	142,000		0.145 \$20,590.00	0.185 \$26,270.00		0.196 \$27,832.00	0.516 \$73,243.60	0.140 \$19,880.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.080 \$80.00		0.091 \$91.00	0.070 \$69.90	0.018 \$18.00
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	7,600		0.145 \$1,102.00	0.185 \$1,406.00		0.196 \$1,489.60	0.516 \$3,920.08	0.140 \$1,064.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.080 \$80.00		0.091 \$91.00	0.070 \$69.90	0.018 \$18.00
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	140,000		0.165 \$23,100.00	0.211 \$29,540.00		0.222 \$31,080.00	0.541 \$75,712.00	0.165 \$23,100.00
Transport Delivery	30,000		0.100 \$3,000.00	0.106 \$3,180.00		0.117 \$3,510.00	0.095 \$2,847.00	0.030 \$900.00
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.165 \$165.00	0.211 \$211.00		0.222 \$222.00	0.541 \$540.80	0.165 \$165.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.100 \$100.00	0.106 \$106.00		0.117 \$117.00	0.095 \$94.90	0.034 \$34.00
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.180 \$180.00	0.185 \$185.00		0.196 \$196.00	0.516 \$515.80	0.180 \$180.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.080 \$80.00		0.091 \$91.00	0.122 \$121.50	0.036 \$36.00
District 10 Total Differential			\$90,932.00	\$114,753.00		\$121,678.60	\$302,894.08	\$84,505.00
								Awardee
District 11								
District 11								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID			NO BID			
Tank Wagon Delivery	267,000		0.145 \$38,715.00	0.105 \$28,035.00		0.116 \$30,972.00	0.516 \$137,718.60	0.120 \$32,040.00
Transport Delivery	6,500		0.080 \$520.00	0.026 \$169.00		0.038 \$247.00	0.103 \$670.15	0.014 \$91.00
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.145 \$145.00	0.105 \$105.00		0.116 \$116.00	0.516 \$515.80	0.120 \$120.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	\$ (0.005) \$ (5.000)		0.005 \$5.00	0.077 \$76.70	0.014 \$14.00
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	66,000		0.145 \$9,570.00	0.105 \$6,930.00		0.116 \$7,656.00	0.516 \$34,042.80	0.120 \$7,920.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.017 \$17.00		0.028 \$28.00	0.039 \$39.40	0.009 \$9.00
# 2 Dyed Fuel								

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Tank Wagon Delivery	200		0.145 \$29.00	0.105 \$21.00		0.116 \$23.20	0.516 \$103.16	0.120 \$24.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.008 \$8.00		0.020 \$20.00	0.039 \$39.40	0.011 \$11.00
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	188,000		0.165 \$31,020.00	0.131 \$24,628.00		0.142 \$26,696.00	0.541 \$101,670.40	0.145 \$27,260.00
Transport Delivery	16,000		0.100 \$1,600.00	0.043 \$688.00		0.054 \$864.00	0.064 \$1,030.40	0.026 \$416.00
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.165 \$165.00	0.131 \$131.00		0.142 \$142.00	0.541 \$540.80	0.145 \$145.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.100 \$100.00	0.034 \$34.00		0.046 \$46.00	0.644 \$644.00	0.028 \$28.00
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	100		0.180 \$18.00	0.105 \$10.50		0.116 \$11.60	0.596 \$59.58	0.185 \$18.50
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.080 \$80.00	0.072 \$72.00		0.083 \$83.00	0.181 \$181.20	0.048 \$48.00
District 11 Total Differential			\$82,202.00	\$60,843.50		\$66,909.80	\$277,332.39	\$68,144.50
				Awardee				
District 12								
District 12								
Gasoline - Ethanol 87 Octane		NO BID			NO BID			
Tank Wagon Delivery	236,000		0.076 \$17,936.00	0.169 \$39,884.00		0.180 \$42,480.00	0.516 \$121,728.80	0.090 \$21,240.00
Transport Delivery	62,000		0.030 \$1,860.00	0.059 \$3,658.00		0.070 \$4,340.00	0.074 \$4,588.00	\$ (0.004) \$ (248.00)
Gasoline - Ethanol 89 Octane								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.076 \$76.00	0.169 \$169.00		0.180 \$180.00	0.516 \$515.80	0.090 \$90.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.030 \$30.00	0.059 \$59.00		0.070 \$70.00	0.048 \$47.60	\$ (0.004) \$ (4.00)
# 2 Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	39,000		0.072 \$2,808.00	0.169 \$6,591.00		0.180 \$7,020.00	0.516 \$20,116.20	0.090 \$3,510.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.021 \$21.00	0.059 \$59.00		0.070 \$70.00	0.010 \$9.50	\$ (0.004) \$ (4.00)
# 2 Dyed Fuel								
Tank Wagon Delivery	5,800		0.072 \$417.60	0.169 \$980.20		0.180 \$1,044.00	0.516 \$2,991.64	0.090 \$522.00
Transport Delivery	7,500		0.021 \$157.50	0.059 \$442.50		0.070 \$5,250.00	0.010 \$71.25	\$ (0.004) \$ (30.00)
Premium Diesel Clear								
Tank Wagon Delivery	87,000		0.087 \$7,569.00	0.169 \$14,703.00		0.180 \$15,660.00	0.541 \$47,049.60	0.110 \$9,570.00

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.	Usage	1	2	3	4	5	6	7
VENDOR NAME		Central Ohio Farmers Coop	Great Lakes Petroleum	Hightowers Petroleum Co.	JT Dillard, LLC.	Lykins Oil Company	Mansfield Oil Company	Ports Petroleum
DEL. OFFERED								
LOC. BY STATE		Marion, OH	Cleveland, OH	Middletown, OH	Milford, OH	Milford, OH	Gainesville, GA	Wooster, OH
Transport Delivery	40,000		0.036 \$1,440.00	0.059 \$2,360.00		0.070 \$2,800.00	0.035 \$1,380.00	0.004 \$160.00
Premium Diesel Dyed								
Tank Wagon Delivery	800		0.875 \$700.00	0.169 \$135.20		0.180 \$144.00	0.541 \$432.64	0.110 \$88.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.036 0.036	0.059 \$59.00		0.070 \$70.00	0.035 \$34.50	0.004 \$4.00
#1 Fuel Oil								
Tank Wagon Delivery	1,000		0.160 \$160.00	0.169 \$169.00		0.180 \$180.00	0.596 \$595.80	0.130 \$130.00
Transport Delivery	1,000		0.055 \$55.00	0.059 \$59.00		0.070 \$70.00	0.151 \$151.30	0.021 \$21.00
District 12 Total Differential			\$33,230.14	\$69,327.90		\$79,378.00	\$199,712.63	\$35,049.00
			Awardee					

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____