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INDEX NO.:   GDC054 BID NO.:  RS900514, UNDERGARMENTS, T-SHIRTS, THERMALS SOCKS AND RAINWEAR

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price

ITEM/Description &/or NIGP #

CATEGORY I. UNDERGARMENTS

I.1.a. Men's Boxers White Size SM - XL Doz 1,500 $15.650 $23,475.000 NO BID $0.000 $13.970 $20,955.000 $12.520

I.1.b. Men's Boxers White Size 2XL - 3XL Doz 900 $17.950 $16,155.000 NO BID $0.000 $17.350 $15,615.000 $12.530

I.1.c. Men's Boxers White Size 4XL - 7XL Doz 200 $198.250 $39,650.000 NO BID $0.000 $22.250 $4,450.000 $15.390

I.2.d. Men's Boxers White Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 10 $22.850 $228.500 NO BID $0.000 $22.250 $222.500 $22.750

I.2.a Men's Briefs White Size SM - XL Doz 7,900 $12.350 $97,565.000 NO BID $0.000 $9.700 $76,630.000 $11.050

I.2.b. Men's Briefs White Size 2XL - 3XL Doz 3,050 $13.650 $41,632.500 NO BID $0.000 $11.250 $34,312.500 $12.370

I.2.c. Men's Briefs White Size 4XL - 7XL Doz 650 $15.800 $10,270.000 NO BID $0.000 $12.950 $8,417.500 $14.160

I.2.d. Men's Briefs White Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 10 $18.750 $187.500 NO BID $0.000 $14.670 $146.700 $16.330

I.3.a. Women's Briefs White Size 5 - 10 Doz 3,600 $10.350 $37,260.000 NO BID $0.000 $7.990 $28,764.000 $8.810

I.3.b. Women's Briefs White Size 11 - 16 Doz 50 $11.400 $570.000 NO BID $0.000 $9.190 $459.500 $10.060

I.4.a. Women's Bras White, Sizes 32 - 38 A Cup, 32 - 42 B Cup, 34 - 

48 C Cup Doz 200 $24.100 $4,820.000 NO BID $0.000 $19.750 $3,950.000 $23.220

I.4.b Women's Bras White Size 34 - 38 D Cup Doz 75 $25.300 $1,897.500 NO BID $0.000 $20.870 $1,565.250 $24.470

I.5.a. Women's Sport Bras White Size 32 - 44 Doz 150 $25.750 $3,862.500 NO BID $0.000 $20.200 $3,030.000 $22.270

I.5.b. Women's Sport Bras White Size 46 - 54 Doz 10 $26.750 $267.500 NO BID $0.000 $20.200 $202.000 $25.050

SUBTOTAL $277,841.000 $0.000 $198,719.950

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY I. UNDERGARMENTS

CATEGORY II. T-SHIRTS

II.1.a. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size SM - XL Doz 4,900 $19.000 $93,100.000 $18.750 $91,875.000 $19.750 $96,775.000 $19.950

II.1.b. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 10,600 $35.850 $380,010.000 $31.950 $338,670.000 $31.500 $333,900.000 $33.340

II.1.c. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 450 $40.750 $18,337.500 $39.500 $17,775.000 $59.500 $26,775.000 $47.850

II.1.d. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 25 $49.950 $1,248.750 $64.500 $1,612.500 $71.990 $1,799.750 $84.750

II.2.a. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey SM - XL Doz 450 $24.600 $11,070.000 $24.950 $11,227.500 $25.950 $11,677.500 $28.000

II.2.b. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey 2XL - 3XL Doz 800 $48.700 $38,960.000 $39.500 $31,600.000 $42.600 $34,080.000 $51.190

II.2.c. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey 4XL - 5XL Doz 100 $50.750 $5,075.000 $45.950 $4,595.000 $43.900 $4,390.000 $51.190

II.2.d. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey Addl Sizes (Not Eval) Doz Not Eval NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $80.040

SUBTOTAL $547,801.250 $497,355.000 $509,397.250

BUY AMERICA

NO BID

2

Direct Resource, Inc.

21 Days ARO

OH

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, 

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

Diversified Services CorporationAllstate Industrial, Inc.

1

21 Days ARO

3

21 Days ARO

OH

4

Honduras & China

Honduras & China

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to Bengladesh and 

China

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to Bengladesh and 

ChinaVarious NOT USA

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________
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VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

2

Direct Resource, Inc.

21 Days ARO

OH

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, 

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

Diversified Services CorporationAllstate Industrial, Inc.

1

21 Days ARO

3

21 Days ARO

OH

4

TOTAL CATEGORY II. T-SHIRTS

CATEGORY III. SOCKS

III.1..a. Tube Socks White Sizes 10 - 13 Doz 5,000 $7.200 $36,000.000 $6.750 $33,750.000 $5.490 $27,450.000 $5.150

Pakistan

III.1.b. Tube Socks White Sizes 14 - 16 Doz 100 $7.750 $775.000 $6.950 $695.000 $5.790 $579.000 $6.550

Pakistan

III.2.a. Crew Socks White Sizes 10 - 13 Doz 12,200 $6.990 $85,278.000 $6.750 $82,350.000 $4.980 $60,756.000 $5.450

Pakistan

III.3.a. Sport Socks White One Size Fits All Doz 150 $6.990 $1,048.500 $6.750 $1,012.500 $4.620 $693.000 $5.450

Pakistan

III.4.a. Women's Double Roll Anlle Socks White, One Size Fits All Doz 600 $7.850 $4,710.000 $6.950 $4,170.000 $4.620 $2,772.000 $6.470

USA

SUBTOTAL $127,811.500 $121,977.500 $92,250.000

BUY AMERICA BuyAmerica

TOTAL CATEGORY III. SOCKS

CATEGORY IV. THERMALS

IV.1.a. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size SM - XL Doz 50 $39.750 $1,987.500 $27.500 $1,375.000 $27.600 $1,380.000 $33.890

IV.1.b. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 120 $41.950 $5,034.000 $36.000 $4,320.000 $34.150 $4,098.000 $38.110

IV.1.c. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 130 NO BID $0.000 $39.000 $5,070.000 $36.950 $4,803.500 $44.050

IV.1.d. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 9XL - 10XL Doz 10 NO BID $0.000 $42.500 $425.000 $60.250 $602.500 $64.890

IV.2.a. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size SM - XL Doz 50 $39.750 $1,987.500 $27.500 $1,375.000 $27.600 $1,380.000 $30.460

IV.2.b. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 140 $41.950 $5,873.000 $36.000 $5,040.000 $34.150 $4,781.000 $32.830

IV.2.c. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 150 NO BID $0.000 $39.000 $5,850.000 $36.750 $5,512.500 $39.430

IV.2.d. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 9XL - 10XL Doz 10 NO BID $0.000 $42.500 $425.000 $60.250 $602.500 $64.790

SUBTOTAL $14,882.000 $23,880.000 $23,160.000

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY IV. THERMALS

CATEGORY V. RAINWEAR

V.1.a. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg XS - XL Ea. 80 $46.850 $3,748.000 NO BID $0.000 $15.290 $1,223.200 $14.180

V.1.b. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg 2XL - 3XL Ea. 100 $50.950 $5,095.000 NO BID $0.000 $15.290 $1,529.000 $14.180

V.1.c. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg 4XL - 5XL Ea. 35 $53.500 $1,872.500 NO BID $0.000 $16.100 $563.500 $16.610

V.1.d. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Tall XL - 3XL Ea. 10 $52.850 $528.500 NO BID $0.000 $16.100 $161.000 $14.180

V.1.e. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Tall 4XL - 5XL Ea. 5 $55.950 $279.750 NO BID $0.000 $16.100 $80.500 $16.610

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to PakistanChina

Originally Certified  USA then 

corrected to China

Honduras & China

Originally Certfied USA then 

corrected to Pakistan

Mexico

Alabama USA

RE-BID Specifications

RE-BID Specifications

Honduras & China

RE-BID Specifications

RE-BID Excessive Price RE-BID Excessive Price

RE-BID Specifications

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________
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VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

2

Direct Resource, Inc.

21 Days ARO

OH

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, 

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

Diversified Services CorporationAllstate Industrial, Inc.

1

21 Days ARO

3

21 Days ARO

OH

4

V.1.f.  Raincoat, Hooded, Black Addl Reg Sizes (Not Eval) Ea. Not Eval $56.250 $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID

V.1.g. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Addl Tall Sizes (Not Eval) Ea. Not Eval $58.900 $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID

SUBTOTAL $11,523.750 $0.000 $3,557.200

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY V. RAINWEAR

 

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest cost responsive and responsible Ohio Certified Minority Business 

Enterprise Bidder by Category of product.  Failure to bid all items in a Category may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive for 

that Category.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”.  In addition, the state will: multiply the 

estimated annual usage for each item by the bid prices submitted and then total all individual items by Category to arrive at the lowest 

responsive and responsible cost by Category. 

RE-BID Excessive Price NO BID DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________
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INDEX NO.:   GDC054 BID NO.:  RS900514, UNDERGARMENTS, T-SHIRTS, THERMALS SOCKS AND RAINWEAR

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

ITEM/Description &/or NIGP #

CATEGORY I. UNDERGARMENTS

I.1.a. Men's Boxers White Size SM - XL Doz 1,500

I.1.b. Men's Boxers White Size 2XL - 3XL Doz 900

I.1.c. Men's Boxers White Size 4XL - 7XL Doz 200

I.2.d. Men's Boxers White Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 10

I.2.a Men's Briefs White Size SM - XL Doz 7,900

I.2.b. Men's Briefs White Size 2XL - 3XL Doz 3,050

I.2.c. Men's Briefs White Size 4XL - 7XL Doz 650

I.2.d. Men's Briefs White Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 10

I.3.a. Women's Briefs White Size 5 - 10 Doz 3,600

I.3.b. Women's Briefs White Size 11 - 16 Doz 50

I.4.a. Women's Bras White, Sizes 32 - 38 A Cup, 32 - 42 B Cup, 34 - 

48 C Cup Doz 200

I.4.b Women's Bras White Size 34 - 38 D Cup Doz 75

I.5.a. Women's Sport Bras White Size 32 - 44 Doz 150

I.5.b. Women's Sport Bras White Size 46 - 54 Doz 10

SUBTOTAL

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY I. UNDERGARMENTS

CATEGORY II. T-SHIRTS

II.1.a. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size SM - XL Doz 4,900

II.1.b. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 10,600

II.1.c. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 450

II.1.d. T-Shirts White 100% Cotton Ring Spun Size 8XL - 10XL Doz 25

II.2.a. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey SM - XL Doz 450

II.2.b. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey 2XL - 3XL Doz 800

II.2.c. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey 4XL - 5XL Doz 100

II.2.d. T-Shirts Active Wear Cotton Jersey Addl Sizes (Not Eval) Doz Not Eval

SUBTOTAL

BUY AMERICA

Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

$18,780.000 $14.280 $21,420.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$11,277.000 $18.900 $17,010.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$3,078.000 $23.840 $4,768.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$227.500 $27.000 $270.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$87,295.000 $9.800 $77,420.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$37,728.500 $11.000 $33,550.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$9,204.000 $12.100 $7,865.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$163.300 $14.200 $142.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$31,716.000 $7.960 $28,656.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$503.000 $10.000 $500.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$4,644.000 $21.100 $4,220.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$1,835.250 $21.850 $1,638.750 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$3,340.500 $21.900 $3,285.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$250.500 $22.000 $220.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$210,042.550 $200,964.750 $0.000 $0.000

$97,755.000 $19.950 $97,755.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$353,404.000 $35.800 $379,480.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$21,532.500 $60.000 $27,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$2,118.750 $75.000 $1,875.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$12,600.000 $38.000 $17,100.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$40,952.000 $59.950 $47,960.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$5,119.000 $65.000 $6,500.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$533,481.250 $577,670.000 $0.000 $0.000

 

6

 

5 7

  21 Days ARO

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, Roger Elliott Company

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

4

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to Bengladesh and 

China

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to Bengladesh and 

China

Honduras, China, Pakistan

Honduras, China, Pakistan

DISQUALIFY AWARD

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________
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VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

TOTAL CATEGORY II. T-SHIRTS

CATEGORY III. SOCKS

III.1..a. Tube Socks White Sizes 10 - 13 Doz 5,000

III.1.b. Tube Socks White Sizes 14 - 16 Doz 100

III.2.a. Crew Socks White Sizes 10 - 13 Doz 12,200

III.3.a. Sport Socks White One Size Fits All Doz 150

III.4.a. Women's Double Roll Anlle Socks White, One Size Fits All Doz 600

SUBTOTAL

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY III. SOCKS

CATEGORY IV. THERMALS

IV.1.a. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size SM - XL Doz 50

IV.1.b. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 120

IV.1.c. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 130

IV.1.d. Thermal Tops Unisex Natural Size 9XL - 10XL Doz 10

IV.2.a. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size SM - XL Doz 50

IV.2.b. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 2XL - 4XL Doz 140

IV.2.c. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 5XL - 8XL Doz 150

IV.2.d. Thermal Bottoms Unisex Natural Size 9XL - 10XL Doz 10

SUBTOTAL

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY IV. THERMALS

CATEGORY V. RAINWEAR

V.1.a. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg XS - XL Ea. 80

V.1.b. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg 2XL - 3XL Ea. 100

V.1.c. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Reg 4XL - 5XL Ea. 35

V.1.d. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Tall XL - 3XL Ea. 10

V.1.e. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Size Tall 4XL - 5XL Ea. 5

 

6

 

5 7

  21 Days ARO

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, Roger Elliott Company

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

4

$25,750.000 $5.600 $28,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$655.000 $6.000 $600.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$66,490.000 $5.100 $62,220.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$817.500 $4.800 $720.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$3,882.000 $5.100 $3,060.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$97,594.500 $94,600.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$5,622.75 BuyAmerica $5,676.00

$103,217.250 $100,276.000

$1,694.500 $33.600 $1,680.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$4,573.200 $38.600 $4,632.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$5,726.500 $41.000 $5,330.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$648.900 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$1,523.000 $28.800 $1,440.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$4,596.200 $31.100 $4,354.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$5,914.500 $36.000 $5,400.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$647.900 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$25,324.700 $22,836.000 $0.000 $0.000

$1,134.400 $13.500 $1,080.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$1,418.000 $13.500 $1,350.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$581.350 $16.000 $560.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$141.800 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$83.050 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Honduras, China, Pakistan

Honduras, China, Pakistan

Originally Certified USA then 

corrected to Pakistan

RE-BID Specifications

Originally Certified  USA then 

corrected to China

Originally Certfied USA then 

corrected to Pakistan

DISQUALIFY

DISQUALIFY

RE-BID Excessive Price

RE-BID SpecificationsDISQUALIFY

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________
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VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

V.1.f.  Raincoat, Hooded, Black Addl Reg Sizes (Not Eval) Ea. Not Eval

V.1.g. Raincoat, Hooded, Black Addl Tall Sizes (Not Eval) Ea. Not Eval

SUBTOTAL

BUY AMERICA

TOTAL CATEGORY V. RAINWEAR

 

 

6

 

5 7

  21 Days ARO

Pyramid Enterprise Supploies, Roger Elliott Company

OH

21 Days ARO

OH

4

$0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

$3,358.600 $2,990.000 $0.000 $0.000

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest cost responsive and responsible Ohio Certified Minority Business 

Enterprise Bidder by Category of product.  Failure to bid all items in a Category may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive for 

that Category.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”.  In addition, the state will: multiply the 

estimated annual usage for each item by the bid prices submitted and then total all individual items by Category to arrive at the lowest 

responsive and responsible cost by Category. 

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED 

BY:_____________________


