

INDEX NO.: GDC002		BID NO: RS900220		OPENING DATE: May 29, 2019											
VENDOR NO.		ANNUAL	1	2		3		4		5		6			
VENDOR NAME		EST.	Benchmark Biodiesel, Inc.	Petroleum Traders		Central Ohio Farmers Co-op		Lykins Energy Solution		KGN Global LLC dba KGN Petroleum		Mansfield Oil Co. of Gainesville, Inc.			
DEL. OFFERED		USAGE/													
LOC. BY STATE	UOM	EA	Ohio		Indiana		Ohio		Ohio		Ohio		GA		
BRAND/ITEM	Description			Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price	Bid Price	Extended Price
District 1															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.274	\$0.274	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.176	\$0.176	\$0.139	\$0.139	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 1 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.450		\$0.676		\$0.630						
District 2															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.286	\$0.286	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.179	\$0.179	\$0.209	\$0.209	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 2 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.465		\$0.746		\$0.630						
District 3															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.288	\$0.288	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.147	\$0.147	\$0.252	\$0.252	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 3 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.435		\$0.789		\$0.630						
District 4															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.286	\$0.286	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.490	\$0.490	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.179	\$0.179	\$0.240	\$0.240	\$0.290	\$0.290	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 4 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.465		\$0.777		\$0.780						

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.			ANNUAL	1		2		3		4		5		6	
VENDOR NAME			EST.	Benchmark Biodiesel, Inc.		Petroleum Traders		Central Ohio Farmers Co-op		Lykins Energy Solution		KGN Global LLC dba KGN Petroleum		Mansfield Oil Co. of Gainesville, Inc.	
DEL. OFFERED			USAGE/												
LOC. BY STATE		UOM	EA	Ohio		Indiana		Ohio		Ohio		Ohio		GA	
District 5															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.249	\$0.249	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.131	\$0.131	\$0.258	\$0.258	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 5 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.380		\$0.795		\$0.630						
District 6															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	40,000	\$0.179	\$7,160.000	\$0.537	\$21,480.000	\$0.250	\$10,000.000	\$0.362	\$14,480.000	\$0.372	\$14,880.000	\$0.581	\$23,224.000
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	200,000	\$0.129	\$25,800.000	\$0.233	\$46,600.000	\$0.150	\$30,000.000	\$0.214	\$42,800.000	\$0.224	\$44,800.000	\$0.061	\$12,120.000
District 6 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$32,960.000		\$68,080.000		\$40,000.000		\$57,280.000		\$59,680.000		\$35,344.000
District 7															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	4,000	\$0.263	\$1,052.000	\$0.537	\$2,148.000	\$0.390	\$1,560.000	\$0.362	\$1,448.000	\$0.372	\$1,488.000	\$0.581	\$2,322.400
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	30,000	\$0.185	\$5,550.000	\$0.262	\$7,860.000	\$0.240	\$7,200.000	\$0.239	\$7,170.000	\$0.249	\$7,470.000	\$0.092	\$2,760.000
District 7 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$6,602.000		\$10,008.000		\$8,760.000		\$8,618.000		\$8,958.000		\$5,082.400
District 8															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.249	\$0.249	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.490	\$0.490	No Bid		\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.171	\$0.171	\$0.269	\$0.269	\$0.290	\$0.290	No Bid		\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000
District 8 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.420		\$0.806		\$0.780				\$0.000		\$0.000

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____

VENDOR NO.			ANNUAL	1		2		3		4		5		6	
VENDOR NAME			EST.	Benchmark Biodiesel, Inc.		Petroleum Traders		Central Ohio Farmers Co-op		Lykins Energy Solution		KGN Global LLC dba KGN Petroleum		Mansfield Oil Co. of Gainesville, Inc.	
DEL. OFFERED			USAGE/												
LOC. BY STATE		UOM	EA	Ohio		Indiana		Ohio		Ohio		Ohio		GA	
District 9															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.288	\$0.288	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.161	\$0.161	\$0.271	\$0.271	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 9 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.449		\$0.808		\$0.630						
District 10															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.298	\$0.298	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.740	\$0.740	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.209	\$0.209	\$0.282	\$0.282	\$0.290	\$0.290	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 10 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.507		\$0.819		\$1.030						
District 11															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.299	\$0.299	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.196	\$0.196	\$0.243	\$0.243	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 11 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.495		\$0.780		\$0.630						
District 12															
Tank Wagon Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.288	\$0.288	\$0.537	\$0.537	\$0.390	\$0.390	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
Transport Delivery	B20 Biodiesel	Gal.	1	\$0.196	\$0.196	\$0.268	\$0.268	\$0.240	\$0.240	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
District 12 Total															
Differential				AWARD	\$0.484		\$0.805		\$0.630						
				\$0.000		\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000
				\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000	\$0.000
Sub Total					\$39,566.550		\$78,095.801		\$48,767.000		\$65,898.000		\$68,638.000		\$40,426.400
Buy Ohio							\$82,000.591								\$42,447.720
Grand Total				AWARD	\$39,566.550		\$78,095.801		\$48,767.000		\$65,898.000		\$68,638.000		\$40,426.400

Award: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by bid district. Failure to bid all items (tank wagon and transport) may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive. Bids should be submitted only for those districts that the bidder/contractor can support. See Attachment One for Bid District Map.

Evaluation: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the estimated usage of each line item for the estimated annual usage times the bid cost differential per gallon. These totals will be added together to determine the lowest cost differential per district. Any item shown with an unknown quantity will be evaluated on the quantity of one (1).

BIDS TABULATED BY: _____ REVIEWED BY: _____ REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: _____ APPROVED BY: _____