STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING Page 1

INDEX NO.: GDCO01 |BID NO: RS900116 Institutional Footwear OPENING DATE: 03/23/15 \ \
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
Linda Colson dba Pyramid
Enterprise Supplies_(1 TaiParker Consulting, LLC (3
VENDOR NAME EST. 889 Global Solutions Astra Engineering Co. Bretsherm Products, Inc. Diversified Services Corp Correcton) Roger Elliortt Corrections)
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/ 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 30 Days ARO
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA OH OH OH OH OH OH OH
Bid Item Number Description Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price
Country of Manufacture => China China China China China China Did not Provide Pg #2
Men's and Women's Leather Velcro Boot, Unisex Sizes as Specified,
Al Regular and Wide Widths Pair 8,000 $17.940 $143,520.000 $42.760 $342,080.000 $19.390 $155,120.000 $16.690 $133,520.000 $17.320 $138,560.000 $17.820 $142,560.000 $16.870 $134,960.000
AWARD
Men's and Women's Leather and Fabric Clear Sole Athletic Shoe in
B.1. Size and Width Combinations Per Specifications Pair 35,000 $16.540 $578,900.000 $38.450,  $1,345,750.000) $17.490 $612,150.000 $13.940‘ $487,900.000 $14.850 $519,750.000 $16.200 $567,000.000 $15.710 $549,850.000
AWARD
Men's and Women's Solid Sole Leather Velcro Athletic Shoe in Size
C.1. and Width Combinations Per Specifications Pair 5,000 $15.010 $75,050.000 $40.050 $200,250.000 $16.900 $84,500.000 $13.800‘ $69,000.000 $15.900 $79,500.000 $17.250 $86,250.000 $16.330 $81,650.000
AWARD
Unisex Ethyl Vinyl Acetate (EVA) Clog-Type Sandal, Colors Orange,
D.1. Black, Navy, Sizes Per Specifications Pair 1,000 $3.960 $3,960.000, $16.720 $16,720.000| $5.450 $5,450.000, $3.390 $3,390.000, $3.550 $3,550.000, $3.720 $3,720.000, $2.770 $2,770.000,
AWARD
Unisex V-Strap Thong Type Shower Sandal, Color and Sizes as Dozen
E.1. Specified Pairs 150 No Bid No Bid $16.680 $2,502.000 $8.890 $1,333.500 $6.300 $945.000 $6.930 $1,039.500] $7.970 $1,195.500 $7.580 $1,137.000|
AWARD
F1 Men's and Wome_n's P\(C Slip-On Inside/Outside Sandal, Sizes Men's Doz_en ‘
o and Women's Unisex Sizes as Offered Pairs 1,700 $23.210 $39,457.000 $16.700 $28,390.000 $37.440 $63,648.000 $18.600 $31,620.000 $20.880 $35,496.000 $19.970 $33,949.000 $24.720 $42,024.000
Disqualify AWARD
G1 Men's and Wome_n's EVA Slip-On Inside/Outside Sandal, Sizes: Men's Doz_en ) ) ‘
and Women's Unisex as Offered, Colors: As Offered Pairs 1,400 $34.450 $48,230.000 $17.700 $24,780.000 No Bid No Bid $33.360 $46,704.000 $33.600 $47,040.000 $31.310 $43,834.000 $35.760 $50,064.000
Disqualify AWARD Disqualify
Total $889,117.000, $1,960,472.000, $922,201.500 ‘ $773,079.000 $824,935.500, $878,508.500 $862,455.000
\ \
EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article 1-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, DAS will
multiply the estimated annual usage times the quoted price per item offered to arrive at a per item total per bidder. A
contract will be awarded to the lowest cost responsive and responsible bidder by item.
CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by item.
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