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INDEX NO.: OPI60 BID NO.: OT906915 | |
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3
VENDOR NAME EST. NetPAC International LLC TrueChoicePack Tradex International
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/ As Required As Required As Required
LOC. BY STATE UoM LF Pickerington, OH Dayton, OH Cleveland, OH

Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price Bid Price | Extended Price
ITEM/Description &/or NIGP # |
Item 1, Star HD/LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .5 MIL, Film Width 24", Roll Width 6", Clear/Natural EA 2,300,000 $0.021 $0.00 $0.015 $34,500.00 0.011 $25,300.000
Item 2, Star HD/LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .7 MIL, Film Width 33", Roll Width 8.25", Clear/Natural EA 1,200,000 $0.040 $0.00| $0.021 $25,320.00 0.019 $22,800.000
Item 3, Star HD/LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge 1.5MIL, Film Width 38", Roll Width 9.5”, Clear/Natural EA 1,100,000 $0.059 $64,900.00 $0.045 $49,940.00 0.044 $48,400.000
Item 4, Star HD/LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .9 MIL, Film Width 38", Roll Width 9.5, Clear/Natural EA 4,500,000 $0.035 $157,500.00 $0.027 $122,400.00 0.027 $121,500.000
Item 5, Star HD/LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .9 MIL, Film Width 44", Roll Width 11", Clear/Natural EA 2,500,000 $0.041 $102,500.00, $0.027 $68,000.00 0.032 $80,000.000
Item 6, Gusset, Clear, Tubular Polyethylene HD/LLDPE, .5 MIL, 19" W x 8" Gusset, for Milk Crate Liner EA 500,000 $0.013 $6,500.00 $0.015 $7,500.00| 0.012 $6,000.000|
Item 7, Gusset, Clear, Tubular Polyethylene LLDPE, 2.0 MIL, 9" W x 5" Gusset, FDA Approved w/Certificate EA 175,000 $0.044 $7,700.00| $0.061 $10,622.50 0.025 $4,375.000
Item 8, Gusset, Clear, Tubular Polyethylene LLDPE, 1.5 MIL, 22" W x 14" Gusset, FDA Approved w/Certificate EA 175,000 $0.058 $10,150.00| $0.045 $7,945.00| 0.042 $7,350.000
Item 9, Star HDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .23 MIL, Film Width 24", Roll Width 6", Clear/Natural EA 3,200,000 No Bid #VALUE! $0.007 $22,720.00 0.006 $19,200.000
Item 10, Star HDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .31 MIL(8 Microns), Film Width 33"(+-1/2"), Roll Width 8.25",
Clear/Natural EA 2,500,000 No Bid #VALUE! $0.009 $23,250.00 0.011 $27,500.000
Item 11, Star Tubular Biodegradable Material, Actual Gauge .5MIL, Film Width 24", Roll Width 6” EA 100,000 $0.031 $3,100.00| $0.015 $1,500.00| 0.011 $1,100.000|
Item 12, Gusset Tubular Biodegradeable Material, FDA Approved, Actual Gauge .5 MIL, Film Width 19", Roll
Width 19", Gusset 8" EA 100,000 $0.017 $1,700.00| $0.015 $1,500.00| 0.011 $1,100.000|
Item 13, Star Seal Tubular Colored (All Primary Colors),HD/LLDPE Material, Actual Gauge .5 MIL, Film Width
24", Roll Width 6” EA 100,000 $0.031 $3,100.00| $0.015 $1,510.00| 0.011 $1,100.000|
Item 14, Star Seal Tubular Colored (All Primary Colors), HD/LLDPE Material, Actual Gauge 1.5 MIL, Film Width
38", Roll Width 6" EA 100,000 $0.059 $5,900.00 $0.045 $4,540.00| 0.044 $4,400.000
Item 15, Star Tubular Biodegradable Material, Actual Guage .7 MIL, Film Width 33", Roll Width 8.25" EA 100,000 $0.039 $3,900.00 $0.022 $2,210.00| 0.020 $2,000.000
Item 16, Gusset Tubular Biodegradable Material, FDA Approved, Actual Guage 2.0 MIL, Film Width 9", Roll
Width 9", Gusset 5" EA 100,000 $0.053 $5,300.00) $0.063 $6,300.00) 0.025 $2,500.000
Item 17, Star Tubular Biodegradable Material, Actual Gauge 1.5 MIL, Film Width 38", Roll Width 9.5" EA 100,000 $0.104 $10,400.00 $0.047 $4,700.00| 0.044 $4,400.000
Item 18, Gusset Tubular Biodegradable Material, FDA Approved, Actual Gauge 1.5 MIL, Film Width 22", Roll
Width 22", Gusset 14" EA 100,000 $0.069 $6,900.00 $0.047 $4,700.00| 0.046 $4,600.000
Item 19, Star Seal Tubular Colored (All Primary Colors) HD/LLDPE Material Biodegradable, Actual Gauge .7
MIL, Film Width 33", Roll Width 8.25" EA 100,000 $0.043 $4,300.00| $0.023 $2,300.00) 0.021 $2,100.000]
Item 20, Star LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .23 MIL (6 Microns), Film Width 24"(+/-1/2"), Roll Width 6",
Clear/Natural EA 100,000 No Bid #VALUE! $0.007 $710.00 0.006 $600.000
Item 21, Star LLDPE Tubular, Actual Gauge .31 MIL(8 Microns), Film Width 33"(+/-1/2"), Roll Width 8.25",
Clear/Natural EA 100,000 No Bid #VALUE! $0.009 $930.00 0.010 $1,000.000]
Item 22, Flat Black Seal Tubular, Actual Gauge 2.0 MIL, Film Width 34" (+/- 1/2"), Roll Width 34", Black EA 100,000 $0.057 $5,700.00| $0.090 $9,000.00| 0.052 $5,200.000
Item 23, Flat Black Seal Tubular, Actual Gauge 2.0 MIL, Film Width 34" (+/- 1/2"), Roll Width 34", Black EA 100,000 $0.086 $8,600.00| $0.090 $9,000.00| 0.077 $7,700.000|
Grand Total #VALUE! $421,097.50 $400,225.00
Analyst: Senthan Mahendrarasa
EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article 1-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the State will Multiply the Unit Price per Linear Foot by the Estimated Annual Usage listed in the Bid and then add each of the Totals together to arrive at the
Annual Total for all items. In the case where Estimated Annual Usage is unknown, the State will substitute 100,000 Linear Feet as the Multiplier. Failure to Bid all items will result in the Bidder being deemed not responsive.
CONTRACT AWARD: The Contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible Bidder by low lot total.
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