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BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL
VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA NC

Per ITB
NY

ChemTick Coated FabricsChestnut Ridge Foam, Inc.
1

Per ITB

5
MTJ American, LLC

4

Per ITB

32

Per ITB
Spec-Tex, Inc.

PA
Per ITB

FL

berdeen Road Co. dba Hercu

PA
Category I: Urethane Foam Sheets
½”x82”x100” sheet 25 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1”x82”x100” sheet 10 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2”x82”x100” sheet 10 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
3”x82”x100” sheet 40 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Category I Total
NO AWARD

Category J: Thermally Bonded Fiber Cushioning
Mattress Core, 28.5" x 73" x 4.5" BF 1 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Mattress Core, 28.5" x 77" x 4.5" BF 1200 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Mattress Core, 30" x 72" x 4.5" BF 40 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Mattress Core, 34.5" x 73" x 4.5" BF 40 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Mattress Core, 34.5" x 77" x 4.5" BF 700 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Mattress Core, Other Sizes BF 1 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Category J Total
NO AWARD

Category K: Hospital Fabric and Adhesive
Bacteriostatic Hospital Fabric, 14oz per square yard.  39 
1/2” width, Fawn or equivalent Sq Yd 7,500 $0.000 $0.000 $2.780 $20,850.000 $1.550 $11,625.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000
Bacteriostatic Hospital Fabric, 14oz per square yard. 
54" width, Fawn or equivalent Sq Yd 7,500 $0.000 $0.000 $3.820 $28,650.000 $2.130 $15,975.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000
Bacteriostatic Hospital Fabric, 14 oz. per square yard. 
39 1/2”  width, Blue or equivalent Sq Yd 24,000 $0.000 $0.000 $2.780 $66,720.000 $1.550 $37,200.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000
Bacteriostatic Hospital Fabric, 14 oz. per square yard. 
54  width, Blue or equivalent Sq Yd 24,000 $0.000 $0.000 $3.820 $91,680.000 $2.130 $51,120.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000
Adhesive compatible to the 14 oz vinyl bind QTS 124 $0.000 $0.000 $7.500 $930.000 $11.350 $1,407.400 NO BID $0.000 $0.000

Clear Mattress Vinyl, 11oz. 39 ½” width, Glass Clear Sq Yd 1 $0.000 $0.000 $2.120 $2.120 $1.600 $1.600 $2.390 $2.390 $0.000 $0.000

Clear Mattress Vinyl, 11oz. 54” width, Glass Clear Sq Yd 1 $0.000 $0.000 $3.280 $3.280 $2.130 $2.130 $3.260 $3.260 $0.000 $0.000
Category K Total $208,835.400 $117,331.130 $5.650

RANK 2 1 DQ

Yellow Highlight denotes bid award recommendation.

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded by category to the lowest 
responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total.  Low lot total will be determined 
by multiplying the unit cost by the estimated usage listed in the bid and then adding 
each of the totals together to arrive at a total for all items. Failure to bid all items in a 
category may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive.
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