
STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 1

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

CHILLICOTHE CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION
Warehouse: 16054 MO 12 $211.650 $2,539.80 $275.000 $3,300.000 $141.100 $1,693.200 $499.000 $5,988.000

CHILLICOTHE CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION, OPI
Factory:  16051 MO 12 $211.650 $2,539.80 $275.000 $3,300.000 $141.100 $1,693.200 $498.000 $5,976.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $9,279.600 $11,000.000 AWARD $6,386.400 $18,714.000

Evaluation:  Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders".  In addition, the state will add the following:

1.  The product of the monthly, annual and quarterly cost for scheduled  service for each unit times the the number of months needed to arrive at an annual total.
2.  The sum of the cost of ten (10) hours of Straight-Time and ten (10) hours of Overtime for each contract year.
3.  The cost of the Five Year Full Load Test
Failure to bid all items for a facility may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive for that facility.

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

FRANKLIN MEDICAL CENTER
B Building: 31266 MO 12 $160.650 $1,927.80 $115.000 $1,380.000 $107.100 $1,285.200 $266.000 $3,192.000

B Building:  31267 MO 12 $160.650 $1,927.80 $115.000 $1,380.000 $107.100 $1,285.20 $265.000 $3,180.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $8,055.600 $7,160.000 AWARD $5,570.400 $13,122.000

NO BIDNO BID

NO BID NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB

6

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

ThyssenKrupp Elevator

6

Award:  The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by facility.

OH OH OH OH OH

Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp.
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

OH

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 2

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

DAYTON CORRECTIONAL FACILITY
B Building:  2884 MO 12 $214.200 $2,570.40 $162.500 $1,950.000 $142.800 $1,713.60 $232.000 $2,784.000 $100.00 $1,200.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $190.000 $1,900.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $324.000 $3,240.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $6,770.400 $6,350.000 AWARD $4,713.600 $9,074.000 $5,450.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

LONDON CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION
Main Building Front Lobby: 44582 MO 12 $189.000 $2,268.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $126.000 $1,512.000 $275.000 $3,300.000

LONDON CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION, OPI
Factory: 16051 MO 12 $212.000 $2,544.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $141.750 $1,701.000 $495.000 $5,940.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $9,012.000 $9,080.000 AWARD $6,213.000 $15,990.000

NO BID
NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

5 6

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 64 5



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 3

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

MARION CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION
Medical: 02236 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $105.000 $1,260.000 $250.000 $3,000.000

Back Dock: 87223 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $105.000 $1,260.000 $337.000 $4,044.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $7,980.000 $7,160.000 AWARD $5,520.000 $13,794.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

OAKWOOD CORRECTIONAL FACILITY
North Wing: 28084 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.08 $124.000 $1,488.000 $182.00 $2,184.000

North Wing: 28083 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $182.00 $2,184.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $94.000 $940.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $94.000 $940.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $8,664.000 $7,216.160 AWARD $6,056.000 $10,208.000

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

1 2 3 4 5 6

NO BID

BID NO.:  OT905013

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

6

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 4

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

OHIO REFORMATORY FOR WOMEN
Laundry: 25482 MO 12 $170.100 $2,041.20 $115.000 $1,380.000 $113.400 $1,360.800 $265.000 $3,180.000

Food Service:13645 MO 12 $170.100 $2,041.20 $115.000 $1,380.000 $113.400 $1,360.800 $264.000 $3,168.000

Kennedy Dorm: 40419 MO 12 $170.100 $2,041.20 $115.000 $1,380.000 $113.400 $1,360.800 $264.000 $3,168.000

Day Room: 51097 MO 12 $170.100 $2,041.20 $115.000 $1,380.000 $96.000 $1,152.000 $264.000 $3,168.000

Day Room: 51098 MO 12 $170.100 $2,041.20 $115.000 $1,380.000 $96.000 $1,152.000 $264.000 $3,168.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $14,406.000 $11,300.000 AWARD $9,386.400 $22,602.000

NO BID
NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

1 2 3 4 5 6

BID NO.:  OT905013



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 5

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

OHIO STATE PENITENTIARY
Main Building: 36001 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 36068 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 35997 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 35998 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 35999 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 36000 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46118 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46119 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46120 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46121 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46122 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46123 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building: 46124 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

Main Building:46125 MO 12 $157.500 $1,890.00 $98.000 $1,176.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $170.00 $2,040.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $30,660.000 AWARD $20,864.000 $34,470.000 $34,400.000

NO BID
NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

1 2 3 4 5 6

BID NO.:  OT905013



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 6

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

PICKAWAY CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION
Med/Seg Bldg: 51884 MO 12 $194.400 $2,332.80 $115.000 $1,380.000 $100.000 $1,200.000 $256.000 $3,072.000

Med/Seg Bldg: 51913 MO 12 $194.400 $2,332.80 $115.000 $1,380.000 $100.000 $1,200.000 $256.000 $3,072.000

A Dorm: 46592
B Dorm: 46593
LABOR RATES

Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $8,865.600 $7,160.000 AWARD $5,400.000 $12,894.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

SOUTHERN OHIO CORRECTIONAL FACILITY
B Building: 20692 MO 12 $198.750 $2,385.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $132.500 $1,590.000

Infirmary: 20693 MO 12 $198.750 $2,385.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $132.500 $1,590.000

Laundry: 20694 MO 12 $198.750 $2,385.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $132.500 $1,590.000

A Building Security Tower 20695 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

Tower 3: 20696 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

Library: 33825 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

L-1 Cell Block: 33826 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

Library: 33827 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

Chapel: 34452 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

K-1: 34453 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

K-8: 34454 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

J-3: 35298 MO 12 $75.000 $900.00 $65.000 $780.000 $50.000 $600.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $19,455.000 $15,560.000 AWARD $13,170.000

NO BID

NO BID

Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH

NO BID

OH
Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

3 4 5 6

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2

REPAIR ONLY
REPAIR ONLY

NO BID

OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

OH OH

Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

1 2 3 4 5 6

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 7

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

TOLEDO CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION
A Block: 41774 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

B Block: 41775 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

C Block: 41776 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

D Block: 41777 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

Admin N: 41761 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

Admin S: 41762 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

Master: 41895 MO 12 $57.000 $684.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $34.000 $408.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

A Block: 41774 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.08 $124.000 $1,488.000 $137.00 $1,644.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $94.000 $940.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $94.000 $940.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $20,508.000 $15,664.640 AWARD $13,904.000 $18,992.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

CAMBRIDGE PATROL POST
Main: 45800 MO 12 $120.000 $1,440.00 $150.000 $1,800.000 $80.000 $960.000 $120.000 $1,440.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $5,640.000 $6,200.000 AWARD $3,960.000 $8,190.000

NO BID

NO BID

1 2

OH OH

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator

3 4

OH OH

1 2 3 4

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

5 6

BID NO.:  OT905013

NO BID

OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

5 6

BID NO.:  OT905013



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 8

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

FINDLAY PATROL POST
Main: 44136 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.340 $1,408.080 $124.000 $1,488.000 $142.00 $1,704.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $94.000 $940.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $94.000 $940.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $6,432.000 $5,808.080 AWARD $4,568.000 $7,544.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

WILMINGTON PATROL POST
Main: 40422 MO 12 $217.500 $2,610.00 $152.500 $1,830.000 $145.800 $1,749.600 $170.000 $2,040.000 $100.00 $1,200.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $190.000 $1,900.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $323.000 $3,230.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $6,810.000 $6,230.000 AWARD $4,749.600 $8,320.000 $5,450.000

NO BID

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

OH

6

NO BID

BID NO.:  OT905013

OH OH OH OH OH OH

1 2 3 4 5

Per ITB
Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

1 2 3 4 5 6

Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

BID NO.:  OT905013



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 9

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

APPALACHIAN BEHAVIORAL HEALTHCARE (Athens)
Main: 32302 MO 12 $187.500 $2,250.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $130.000 $1,560.000 $352.000 $4,224.000 $115.00 $1,380.000

Main: 32303 MO 12 $187.500 $2,250.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $130.000 $1,560.000 $351.000 $4,212.000 $115.00 $1,380.000

Main: 32304 MO 12 $187.500 $2,250.00 $115.000 $1,380.000 $130.000 $1,560.000 $351.000 $4,212.000 $115.00 $1,380.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 10.000% $1,100.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $10,950.000 $8,540.000 AWARD $7,680.000 $19,398.000 $7,840.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

HEARTLAND BEHAVIORAL HEALTHCARE (Massillon)
Rehab: 21237 MO 12 $202.500 $2,430.00 $145.000 $1,740.000 $135.000 $1,620.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $184.00 $2,208.000

Rehab: 21238 MO 12 $202.500 $2,430.00 $145.000 $1,740.000 $135.000 $1,620.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $184.00 $2,208.000

Rehab: 21239 MO 12 $202.500 $2,430.00 $145.000 $1,740.000 $135.000 $1,620.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $184.00 $2,208.000

Admin: 43055 MO 12 $202.500 $2,430.00 $145.000 $1,740.000 $135.000 $1,620.000 $165.000 $1,980.000 $184.00 $2,208.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $13,920.000 $11,360.000 AWARD $9,480.000 $14,670.000 $14,672.000

6

6

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 10

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

NORTHWEST OHIO PSYCHIATRIC HOSPITAL
Geriatrics: 20647 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $123.940 $1,487.280 $124.000 $1,488.000 $167.00 $2,004.000

Geriatrics: 20648 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $123.940 $1,487.280 $124.000 $1,488.000 $167.00 $2,004.000

Geriatrics: 20649 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $123.940 $1,487.28 $124.000 $1,488.000 $167.00 $2,004.000

Geriatrics: 20650 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $123.940 $1,487.280 $124.000 $1,488.000 $167.00 $2,004.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $94.000 $940.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $94.000 $940.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $13,128.000 $10,349.120 AWARD $9,032.000 $13,856.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

SUMMIT BEHAVIORAL HEALTHCARE
Main: 47160 MO 12 $180.000 $2,160.00 $100.000 $1,200.00 $127.500 $1,530.000 $120.000 $1,440.000 $220.000 $2,640.000 $100.00 $1,200.000

Main: 47161 MO 12 $180.000 $2,160.00 $100.000 $1,200.00 $127.500 $1,530.000 $120.000 $1,440.000 $220.000 $2,640.000 $100.00 $1,200.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $100.000 $1,000.00 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $190.000 $1,900.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $100.000 $1,000.00 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $323.000 $3,230.000 $150.00 $1,500.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 0.00% $0.00 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $8,520.000 AWARD $4,400.000 $7,460.000 AWARD $5,880.000 $11,560.000 $6,650.000

NO BID

6

6

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 11

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

OHIO VETERANS HOME – SANDUSKY
Giffin Care: 9245 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $150.000 $1,800.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Giffin Care: 27974 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Secrest Nursing: 25138 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Secrest Nursing: 25137 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Secrest Nursing: 25136 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Secrest Receiving Dock: 25135 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Veterans Hall: 31522 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $177.000 $2,124.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Veterans Hall: 31523 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $177.000 $2,124.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Veterans Hall: 31524 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Veterans Hall: 31524 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

Veterans Hall: 31521 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

IF Mack Building: 34359 MO 12 $186.000 $2,232.00 $117.000 $1,404.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $180.00 $2,160.000

O Cottage MO 12 $31.500 $378.00 $20.000 $240.000 $124.000 $1,488.000 $100.00 $1,200.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $94.000 $940.000 $170.00 $1,700.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $94.000 $940.000 $289.00 $2,890.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 25.000% $1,250.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage

Grand Total $31,362.000 $23,324.000 AWARD $22,424.000 $32,960.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

ODPS, SHIPLEY BUILDING
ODPS Building: 35545 MO 12 $205.000 $2,460.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $175.000 $2,100.000 $385.000 $4,620.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

ODPS Building: 35546 MO 12 $200.000 $2,400.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $170.000 $2,040.000 $366.000 $4,392.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

ODPS Building: 35547 MO 12 $200.000 $2,400.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $170.000 $2,040.000 $366.000 $4,392.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

ODPS Building: 35548 MO 12 $200.000 $2,400.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $170.000 $2,040.000 $366.000 $4,392.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

ODPS Building: 35549 MO 12 $200.000 $2,400.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $170.000 $2,040.000 $366.000 $4,392.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

ODPS Building: 35550 MO 12 $200.000 $2,400.00 $275.000 $3,300.000 $170.000 $2,040.000 $366.000 $4,392.000 $227.00 $2,724.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 10.000% $1,100.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage
5 YEAR FULL LOAD TEST EA 6 $1,350.000 $8,100.000 $2,000.000 $12,000.000 $460.000 $2,760.000 $2,960.000 $17,760.000 $0.00 $0.00

Grand Total $26,760.000 $36,200.000 AWARD $18,060.000 $51,090.000 $20,044.000

NO BID

6

6

NO BID

NO BID

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

OH OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING 12

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

ODPS, ALUM CREEK FACILITY
Warehouse East Side: 40402 YR 1 $375.000 $375.00 $1,800.000 $1,800.000 $500.000 $500.000 $107.000 $107.000 $750.00 $750.000

Warehouse West Side: 40401 YR 1 $375.000 $375.00 $1,800.000 $1,800.000 $500.000 $500.000 $106.000 $106.000 $750.00 $750.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $80.000 $800.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $105.000 $1,050.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 10.000% $1,100.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage
5 YEAR FULL LOAD TEST EA 2 $1,350.000 $2,700.000 $2,000.000 $4,000.000 $350.000 $700.000 $2,960.000 $5,920.000 $500.00 $1,000.00

Grand Total $7,650.000 $12,000.000 AWARD $4,700.000 $12,883.000 $6,200.000

INDEX NO.:   LDC023 OPENING DATE: May 22, 2013
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price
Extended 

Price Bid Price Extended Price

PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE

ODPS, EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY
Main Front: 33753 QTR 4 $165.000 $660.00 $345.000 $1,380.000 $110.000 $440.000 $208.000 $832.000 $345.00 $1,380.000

Main Rear: 33752 QTR 4 $165.000 $660.00 $345.000 $1,380.000 $110.000 $440.000 $207.000 $828.000 $345.00 $1,380.000

LABOR RATES
Straight Time HR 10 $140.000 $1,400.000 $125.000 $1,250.000 $160.000 $1,600.000 $185.000 $1,850.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

Overtime HR 10 $180.000 $1,800.000 $200.000 $2,000.000 $240.000 $2,400.000 $370.000 $3,700.000 $130.00 $1,300.000

COST-PLUS MARKUP PCT 1,000 0.00% $1,000.000 15.000% $1,150.000 15.000% $1,150.000 20.000% $1,200.000 10.000% $1,100.000

Replacement Parts/Components Mark-up Percentage
5 YEAR FULL LOAD TEST EA 2 $1,350.000 $2,700.000 $2,000.000 $4,000.000 $600.000 $1,200.000 $2,960.000 $5,920.000 $0.00 $0.00

Grand Total $8,220.000 $11,160.000 $7,230.000 $14,330.000 AWARD $6,460.000

NO BID

OH
Per ITB

6

ThyssenKrupp Elevator

6

OH OH OH OH OH

Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp.

NO BID

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5

OH

OH OH OH OH OH
Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB

Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB Per ITB
Abell Elevator International, Inc Advanced Elevator Kone Elevator Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Corp. ThyssenKrupp Elevator

BID NO.:  OT905013
1 2 3 4 5
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