STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING Page 1
INDEXNO.: DPS012 BID NO: OT903716 OPENING DATE: 11/13/15 |Firearms for the Ohio State Highway Patrol and the Ohio Investigative Unit
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3 4 5 6 7
VENDOR NAME EST. Kiesler Police Supply, Inc Vance Outdoors
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/ 60 Days ARO 90 - 120 Days ARO
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA IN OH
Extended Extended Extended Extended
BRAND/ITEM Description Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Price Bid Price Price Bid Price Price Bid Price Price Bid Price
Category 1
P226, 40 Caliber Two-Tone Non Railed Frame,
DAK Pistol w/Sig Lite Night Sights Engraved
W/OSHP Flying Wheel, 3 12-round magazines
Sig Sauer W226-40-SP w/rubber base plates Ea 75 NO BID $0.000 $611.000 $45,825.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
P239, 40 Caliber, Non Railed, DAK Pistol
Sig Sauer W239-40-BSS- |w/Nitron Finish Sig Lite Night Sights w/3 7-round
DAK magazines Ea 10 NO BID $0.000 $538.100 $5,381.000]| $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
870 Police 12 Gauge Shotgun w/14 inch Barrel
and modified choke, XS low profile rifle sights,
Knoxx Special Ops recoil reducing adjustable
stock, Speed Feed fore end, Parkerized,
including Mesa Tactical 4-round side saddle,
Remington 82718 OSHP Logo Engraved on reciever. Ea $564.800 $0.000 $640.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Remington Trade In for Remington 870 Police Shotguns Ea No Bid $0.000 -$155.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
870 Police 12 Gauge Shotgun w/14 inch Barrel
and modified choke, XS low profile rifle sights,
Knoxx Special Ops recoil reducing adjustable
stock, Speed Feed fore end, Parkerized,
including Mesa Tactical 4-round side saddle,
Remington 82718 OSHP Logo Engraved on reciever. NET PRICE 5 $564.800 $2,824.000 $485.000 $2,425.000]| $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Sig Sauer Sig RM400-16B-S Carbine Rifle,
including 3-thrity round aluminum magazines,
four (4) low profile ladder rail covers (black in
color) and one (1) adjustable Savvy Sniper nylon
. . sling w/dual point, single/two point mountable
Sig Sauer Sig RM400-16B- |\t oversized quick detach connections
S Ea 300 $0.000 $0.000 $858.250 $257,475.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Optional Engraving Sig Optional Engraving for Sig Sauer Sig RM400-
Sauer RM400-16B-S 16B-S Carbine Rifle Reciever Ea 300 NO BID $0.000 $33.000 $9,900.000]| $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Total Category 1 $2,824.000 $321,006.000
DISQUALIFY AWARD
Category 2
Sig Sauer P229 40 Caliber, Nitron Finish, Sig
Sig Sauer P229 40 Caliber |Lite Night Sights, inclduing three (3) seven (7)
Pistol round magazines Ea. 5 NO BID $0.000 $629.050 $3,145.250 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Sig Sauer P239, 40 Caliber, Nitron Finish, Sig
Sig Sauer P239, 40 Caliber |Lite Night Sights, including three (3) seven (7)
Pistol round magazines Ea. 5 NO BID $0.000 $561.800 $2,809.000]| $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Remington 870P 12 Gauge Shotgun,
Parkerized, 14 inch barrel with modified choke,
ghost ring sights, Knoxx Special OPS Il recoil
collapsable stock, Surefire DSF870 integrated
fore end and LED light. One round magazine
tube extension, Mesa Tactical 4-round side
saddle. Ohio Invesitgatvie Unit Logo engraved
Remington 82759 on the right side of the receiver. Ea. $987.440 $0.000 $1,118.900 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Remington Trade In for Remington 870 Police Shotguns Ea 1 $0.000 $0.000 -$175.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
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Remington 870P 12 Gauge Shotgun,

Parkerized, 14 inch barrel with modified choke,

ghost ring sights, Knoxx Special OPS Il recoil

collapsable stock, Surefire DSF870 integrated

fore end and LED light. One round magazine

tube extension, Mesa Tactical 4-round side

saddle. Ohio Invesitgatvie Unit Logo engraved
Remington 82759 on the right side of the receiver.NET PRICE Ea 5 $947.440 $4,737.200) $943.900 $4,719.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total Category 2 $4,737.200 $10,673.750
DISQUALIFY AWARD

Grand Total } $7,561.200 } $331,679.750

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by product category.
Failure to bid all items within a product category, may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive for that category.

EVALUATION: To determine the low lot total price of each category, the state will multiply the estimated annual usage of
each item in the category by its corresponding unit price and then add these totals together. Although there will be separate
category awards made, bidders are eligible to receive award of both categories providing he/she is the lowest responsive
and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed within the categories. Failure to bid all items
within a category may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive. For Categories 1 and 2 items 3, Remington Model
870 Police and 870 P Shotguns, the trade-in allowance offered will be deducted from the unit price to determine the net
price for each item.
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