STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

Page 1 of 7

INVITATION TO BID NO.: OT901916 INDEX NO.: DMH019 OPENING DATE: 12/18/15 PRODUCT/SERVICE: Medication Cup Supplies
VENDOR NO. 1 2 3
VENDOR NAME Green Office Furniture Solutions, LLC Tran Products Direct Resource, Inc.
LOC. BY STATE Hilliard, OH New Albany, OH Columbus, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.021 $96,471.360 $0.024 $111,694.464 $0.022 $100,338.240
CS Price|Qty. $105.780]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $122.472]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $110.020]5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.011 $13,584.000 $0.007 $8,744.160 $0.007 $8,275.200
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $28.300]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $36.43415,000 CS Price|Qty. $34.480(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.007 $24,750.000 $0.008 $29,369.250 $0.007 $24,667.500

CS Price|Qty. $33.00015,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.159(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $32.890(5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE Foreign $0.0070 $26,147.550

EA | 3,750,000 $0.006 $20,850.000 $0.008 $29,261.250 $0.007 $24,667.500
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $27.800]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.015|5,000 CS Price|Qty. $32.890(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.012 $45,675.000 $0.009 $33,714.000 $0.008 $29,775.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $30.450]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $22.476]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $19.850/2,500
CUP Foreign $0.0084 $31,561.500

EA | 3,750,000 #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! #VALUE! $0.008 $29,775.000
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. NO BID CS Price|Qty. NO BID CS Price|Qty. $19.850(2,500
MEDICINE CUP Foreign $0.0084 $31,561.500
Total $201,330.360 $212,783.124 $217,498.440
Buy America $222,551.490

DQ DQ DQ
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:




STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: OT901916 INDEX NO.: DMH019

VENDOR NO. 4 5 6
VENDOR NAME Allstate Industrial, Inc. (Bid #1) P and C Supplies Bertsherm Products, Inc.
LOC. BY STATE Cleveland, OH Cleveland, OH Cleveland, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.022 $100,320.000 $0.036 $164,150.880 $0.033 $151,492.320
CS Price|Qty. $52.800(2,400 CS Price|Qty. $179.990(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $166.110(5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES Not Equivalent

EA | 1,200,000 $0.008 $9,036.000 $0.011 $13,183.200 $0.010 $11,486.400
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $37.650(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $54.930(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $23.930(2,500
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $33,562.500 $0.008 $29,992.500 $0.009 $35,437.500

CS Price|Qty. $44.750]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.9905,000 CS Price|Qty. $47.250]5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.008 $31,837.500 $0.010 $37,492.500 $0.009 $34,687.500
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $42.450(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $49.990(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $46.250(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $32,475.000 #VALUE! #VALUE! $0.008 $31,095.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $21.650]2,500 CS Price|Qty. NO BID CS Price|Qty. $20.730]2,500
CUP

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $32,475.000 #VALUE! #VALUE! $0.008 $31,095.000
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. $21.650(2,500 CS Price|Qty. NO BID CS Price|Qty. $20.730(2,500
MEDICINE CUP
Total $239,706.000 $244,819.080 $264,198.720
Buy America

DQ DQ DQ
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: 0T901916 INDEX NO.: DMHO019
VENDOR NO. 7 8 9
VENDOR NAME Amerisochi, Inc. 889 Global Solutions International Transaction Inc.
LOC. BY STATE Mentor, OH Columbus, OH Xenia, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.027 $121,113.600 $0.030 $138,012.960 $0.030 $138,824.640
CS Price|Qty. $132.800]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $151.330]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $152.220]5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.008 $9,996.000 $0.008 $9,938.400 $0.008 $9,996.000
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $41.650(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $41.410(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $41.650(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $37,500.000 $0.009 $34,507.500 $0.009 $34,710.000

CS Price|Qty. $50.0001]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $46.010]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $46.280(5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $39,062.500 $0.009 $34,507.500 $0.009 $34,710.000
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $50.000(4,800 CS Price|Qty. $46.010(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $46.280(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $36,000.000 $0.009 $33,885.000 $0.009 $34,095.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $24.000]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $22.590|2,500 CS Price|Qty. $22.730]2,500
CUP

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $36,000.000 $0.009 $33,885.000 $0.009 $34,095.000
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. $24.000/2,500 CS Price|Qty. $22.590(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $22.730(2,500
MEDICINE CUP
Total $279,672.100 $284,736.360 $286,430.640
Buy America

DQ DQ DQ
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: 0T901916 INDEX NO.: DMHO019
VENDOR NO. 10 11 12
VENDOR NAME Diversified Services Corp. Allstate Industrial, Inc. (Bid #2) Roby Services, Ltd (dba) Roby Supply
LOC. BY STATE Cleveland, OH Cleveland, OH Dayton, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.035 $158,788.320 $0.035 $157,912.800 $0.032 $144,643.200
CS Price|Qty. $174.110]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $173.150]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $158.6005,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.009 $10,526.400 $0.008 $9,036.000 $0.012 $14,088.000
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $21.930(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $37.650(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $58.700(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $33,780.000 $0.009 $35,212.500 $0.010 $37,725.000

CS Price|Qty. $22.520]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $46.950(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $50.300]5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $33,780.000 $0.008 $31,837.500 $0.010 $35,925.000
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $22.520(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $42.450(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $47.900(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.007 $27,105.000 $0.009 $32,475.000 $0.009 $33,437.500
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $18.070]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $21.650]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $26.750]3,000
CUP

EA | 3,750,000 $0.007 $27,105.000 $0.009 $32,475.000 $0.009 $33,437.500
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. $18.070[2,500 CS Price|Qty. $21.650(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $26.750(3,000
MEDICINE CUP
Total $291,084.720 $298,948.800 $299,256.200
Buy America

DQ AWARD
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: OT901916 INDEX NO.: DMH019
VENDOR NO. 13 14 15
VENDOR NAME D.C. Edwards & Associates, LLC Net Pac International LLC Glovon & Clovon Engineering Consulting
LOC. BY STATE Bedford Heights, OH Pickerington, OH Cincinnati, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.037 $168,975.360 $0.034 $154,283.040 $0.041 $188,683.680
CS Price|Qty. $185.280]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $169.170(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $206.890(5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.009 $11,001.600 $0.008 $10,046.400 $0.010 $11,582.400
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $22.920(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $20.930(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $48.260(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $35,910.000 $0.006 $23,550.000 $0.008 $29,917.500

CS Price|Qty. $23.940]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $31.400]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.890(5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE Foreign $0.0067 $24,963.000 Foreign $0.0085 $31,712.550

EA | 3,750,000 $0.010 $35,910.000 $0.006 $23,550.000 $0.008 $29,917.500
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $23.940(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $31.400(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.890(5,000
MILLILITER Foreign $0.0085 $31,712.550

EA | 3,750,000 $0.008 $28,860.000 $0.013 $49,620.000 $0.009 $32,865.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $19.240]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $33.080/2,500 CS Price|Qty. $21.910)2,500
CUP Foreign $0.0140 $52,597.200

EA | 3,750,000 $0.008 $28,860.000 $0.013 $49,620.000 $0.009 $32,865.000
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. $19.240(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $33.080(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $21.910(2,500
MEDICINE CUP
Total $309,516.960 $310,669.440 $325,831.080
Buy America $315,059.640 $329,421.180

BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: 0T901916 INDEX NO.: DMHO019
VENDOR NO. 16 17 18
VENDOR NAME Stick Products MediGreen Medical Supplies & Services, llc. AmedEquip LLC
LOC. BY STATE Springfield, OH Vandalia, OH Centerville, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.037 $167,817.120 $0.038 $171,638.400 $0.039 $178,232.160
CS Price|Qty. $184.010]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $188.200]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $195.430]5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.008 $10,010.400 $0.008 $9,597.600 $0.009 $11,227.200
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $41.710(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $39.990(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $46.780(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $34,290.000 $0.009 $34,492.500 $0.009 $33,465.000

CS Price|Qty. $45.720(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $45.990(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $44.620(5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.004 $16,762.500 $0.009 $34,492.500 $0.009 $32,880.000
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $22.350(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $45.990(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $43.840(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.018 $68,580.000 $0.013 $48,495.000 $0.014 $51,870.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $45.720]2,500 CS Price|Qty. $32.330(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $34.580(2,500
CUP

EA | 3,750,000 $0.009 $33,525.000 $0.013 $48,495.000 $0.014 $51,870.000
6. LID FOR 30 MILLILITER GRADUATED CS Price|Qty. $22.350(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $32.330(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $34.580(2,500
MEDICINE CUP
Total $330,985.020 $347,211.000 $359,544.360
Buy America

BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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INVITATION TO BID NO.: 0T901916 INDEX NO.: DMHO019
VENDOR NO. 19 20 21
VENDOR NAME VDP Safety & Uniforms Ltd. J.T. Dillard, LLC dba Zaymat Distributors Dove Building Services
LOC. BY STATE Cleveland, OH Cleveland, OH Columbus, OH
ESTIMATE
D ANNUAL
USAGE | Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part Mfg. and Part
Bid Item No., Item ID No., and Description UOM (EA) No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price No. Price / EA | Extended Price
CATEGORY | ITEMS:
EA | 4,560,000 $0.077 $352,032.000 $0.021 $98,012.640
CS Price|Qty. $386.000|5,000 CS Price|Qty. $107.470]5,000

1. CUP, WAX COATED PAPER COLD DRINK,
3 OUNCES

EA | 1,200,000 $0.031 $37,248.000 $0.011 $12,955.200
2. CUP, PAPER SOUFFLE PORTION, 1 CS Price|Qty. $155.200]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $53.980(5,000
OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.018 $68,430.000 $0.010 $36,300.000

CS Price|Qty. $91.240]5,000 CS Price|Qty. $48.400(5,000

3. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 1 OUNCE

EA | 3,750,000 $0.017 $62,625.000 $0.010 $37,080.000
4. MEDICINE CUP, GRADUATED, 30 CS Price|Qty. $83.500(5,000 CS Price|Qty. $49.440(5,000
MILLILITER

EA | 3,750,000 $0.017 $62,790.000 $0.012 $46,485.000
5. LID FOR 1 OUNCE GRADUATED MEDICINE CS Price|Qty. $41.860(2,500 CS Price|Qty. $30.990(2,500
CUP

EA | 3,750,000 $0.034 $128,812.500 $0.155 $581,062.500
MEDICINE CUP
Total $711,937.500 $811,895.340
Buy America Required Price Pages were not submitted.

BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:




