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BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

INDEX NO.:    OPI019 BID NO.:  OT901515 MATERIALS FOR MIXING CATTLE FEED RATIONS
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL
VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price
BID ITEM# / Description

1a. Soybean Meal Chillicothe (CCI) Ton 120 $491.000 $58,920.000 $50.000 $6,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1b. Soybean Meal Lancaster (SCI) Ton 10 $491.000 $4,910.000 $43.000 $430.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1c. Soybean Meal Lebanon (LeCI) Ton 260 $491.000 $127,660.000 $50.000 $13,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1d. Soybean Meal Lima (AOCI) Ton 10 $491.000 $4,910.000 $66.000 $660.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1e. Soybean Meal London (LoCI) Ton 330 $491.000 $162,030.000 $55.000 $18,150.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1f. Soybean Meal Mansfield (ManCI) Ton 50 $491.000 $24,550.000 $36.000 $1,800.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1g. Soybean Meal Marion (MCI) Ton 30 $491.000 $14,730.000 $38.000 $1,140.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
1h. Soybean Meal Orient (PCI) Ton 200 $491.000 $98,200.000 $41.000 $8,200.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $495,910.000 $49,380.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

2a. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Chillicothe (CCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2b. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Lancaster (SCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2c. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Lebanon (LeCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2d. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Lima (AOCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2e. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets London (LoCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2f. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Mansfield (ManCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2g. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Marion (MCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
2f. Corn Gluten Feed Pellets Orient (PCI) Ton 20 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

3a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Protein Blend Bulk Chillicothe (CCI) Ton 180 $551.000 $99,180.000 $60.000 $10,800.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
3b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Protein Blend Bulk Lebanon (LeCI) Ton 130 $551.000 $71,630.000 $60.000 $7,800.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
3c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Protein Blend Bulk London (LoCI) Ton 260 $551.000 $143,260.000 $65.000 $16,900.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
3d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Protein Blend Bulk Marion (MCI) Ton 10 $551.000 $5,510.000 $48.000 $480.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
3e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Protein Blend Bulk Orient (PCI) Ton 30 $551.000 $16,530.000 $51.000 $1,530.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $336,110.000 $37,510.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

4a. London Protein Blend #2 Bulk Chillicothe (CCI) Ton 160 $555.000 $88,800.000 $54.000 $8,640.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
4b. London Protein Blend #2 Bulk Lebanon (LeCI) Ton 20 $555.000 $11,100.000 $54.000 $1,080.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
4c. London Protein Blend #2 Bulk London (LoCI) Ton 20 $555.000 $11,100.000 $59.000 $1,180.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
4d. London Protein Blend #2 Bulk Marion (MCI) Ton 190 $555.000 $105,450.000 $42.000 $7,980.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
4e London Protein Blend #2 Bulk Orient (PCI) Ton 20 $555.000 $11,100.000 $45.000 $900.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $227,550.000 $19,780.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

5a. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.248 $124.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5b. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Lancaster (SCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.244 $122.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5c. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.248 $124.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5d. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Lima (AOCI Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.256 $128.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5e. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags  London (LoCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.250 $125.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5f.  OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Mansfiled (ManCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.241 $120.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5g. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.242 $121.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
5h. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.243 $121.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $986.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

6a. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 90,000 $0.270 $24,300.000 $0.231 $20,790.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6b. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Lancaster (SCI) Lb. 200,000 $0.270 $54,000.000 $0.228 $45,600.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6c. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 5,000 $0.270 $1,350.000 $0.231 $1,155.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6d. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Lima (AOCI Lb. 5,000 $0.270 $1,350.000 $0.239 $1,195.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6e. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags  London (LoCI) Lb. 160,000 $0.270 $43,200.000 $0.234 $37,440.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6f.  OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Mansfiled (ManCI) Lb. 105,000 $0.270 $28,350.000 $0.224 $23,520.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
6g. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 5,000 $0.270 $1,350.000 $0.225 $1,125.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
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6h. OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 15,000 $0.270 $4,050.000 $0.227 $3,405.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Total $157,950.000 $134,230.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

7a. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags Lancaster (SCI) Lb. 5,000 $0.378 $1,890.000 $0.401 $2,005.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
7b. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.378 $9,450.000 $0.404 $10,100.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
7c. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags Mansfield (ManCI) Lb. 60,000 $0.378 $22,680.000 $0.397 $23,820.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $34,020.000 $35,925.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

8a. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Lancaster (SCI) Lb. 5,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.384 $1,920.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
8b. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.388 $9,700.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
8c. OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Mansfield (ManCI) Lb. 60,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.381 $22,860.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $34,480.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

9a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CC() Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.468 $234.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
9b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.468 $234.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
9c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $231.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
9d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.470 $235.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
9e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.463 $231.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $1,165.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

10a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $0.397 $198.500 $0.451 $225.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
10b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.397 $198.500 $0.451 $225.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
10c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.397 $198.500 $0.445 $222.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
10d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 $0.397 $198.500 $0.454 $227.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
10e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 70,000 $0.397 $27,790.000 $0.447 $31,290.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $28,584.000 $32,190.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

11a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $0.414 $207.000 $0.424 $212.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
11b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.414 $207.000 $0.424 $212.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
11c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.414 $207.000 $0.418 $209.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
11d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 $0.414 $207.000 $0.427 $213.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
11e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 15,000 $0.414 $6,210.000 $0.420 $6,300.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $7,038.000 $7,146.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

12a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $0.523 $261.500 $0.408 $204.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
12b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.523 $261.500 $0.408 $204.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
12c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.523 $261.500 $0.402 $201.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
12d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 $0.523 $261.500 $0.410 $205.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
12e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 15,000 $0.523 $7,845.000 $0.403 $6,045.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $8,891.000 $6,859.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

13a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.570 $285.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
13b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.570 $285.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
13c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.564 $282.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
13d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.573 $286.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
13e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.566 $283.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $1,421.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

14a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI)0 Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.554 $277.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
14b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.554 $277.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
14c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.548 $274.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
14d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.556 $278.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
14e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 15,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.549 $8,235.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total  $9,341.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
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15a. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 50,000 $0.534 $26,700.000 $0.470 $23,500.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
15b. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 60,000 $0.534 $32,040.000 $0.470 $28,200.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
15c. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 8,000 $0.534 $4,272.000 $0.464 $3,712.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
15d. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 105,000 $0.534 $56,070.000 $0.473 $49,665.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
15e. OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 80,000 $0.534 $42,720.000 $0.466 $37,280.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $161,802.000 $142,357.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

16a. OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 By-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 2,500 $0.718 $1,795.000 $0.751 $1,877.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
16b. OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 By-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 10,000 $0.718 $7,180.000 $0.751 $7,510.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
16c. OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 By-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.718 $359.000 $0.745 $372.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
16d. OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 By-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags London (LoCI) Lb. 8,000 $0.718 $5,744.000 $0.753 $6,024.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
16e. OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 By-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 50,000 $0.718 $35,900.000 $0.746 $37,300.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $50,978.000 $53,084.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

17a. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.258 $129.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17b. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Lancaster (SC() Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.255 $127.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17c. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.258 $129.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17d. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Lima (AOCI) Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.266 $133.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17e. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags London (LeCI) Lb. 10,000 $0.253 $2,530.000 $0.261 $2,610.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17f. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Mansfield (ManCI) Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.251 $125.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17g. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.253 $126.500 $0.252 $126.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
17h. Sodium Bicarbonate 50 Lb. Bags Orient (PCI) Lb. 30,000 $0.253 $7,590.000 $0.254 $7,620.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $10,879.000 $11,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

18a. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.190 $95.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18b. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Lancaster (SCI) Lb. 1,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.186 $186.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18c. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.190 $95.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18d. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Lima (AOCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.198 $99.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18e. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block London (LoCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.192 $96.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18f. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Mansfield (ManCI) Lb. 2,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.183 $457.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18g. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.184 $92.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
18h. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb. Block Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 NO BID $0.000 $0.185 $92.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total  $1,213.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

19a.  Dried Molasses Supplement 50 Lb. Bag Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $0.400 $200.000 $0.316 $158.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
19b.  Dried Molasses Supplement 50 Lb. Bag Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.400 $200.000 $0.316 $158.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
19c.  Dried Molasses Supplement 50 Lb. Bag London (LoCI) Lb. 500 $0.400 $200.000 $0.318 $159.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
19d.  Dried Molasses Supplement 50 Lb. Bag Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.400 $200.000 $0.310 $155.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
19e.  Dried Molasses Supplement 50 Lb. Bag Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 $0.400 $200.000 $0.311 $155.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $1,000.000 $785.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

20a. Milk Replacer 50 Lb. Bag Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 500 $1.581 $790.500 $1.602 $801.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
20b. Milk Replacer 50 Lb. Bag Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $1.581 $790.500 $1.596 $798.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
20c. Milk Replacer 50 Lb. Bag Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 $1.581 $790.500 $1.597 $798.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $2,371.500 $2,397.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

21a. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf 50 Lb. Bag Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 7,500 $0.311 $2,332.500 $0.233 $1,747.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
21b. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf 50 Lb. Bag Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 30,000 $0.311 $9,330.000 $0.233 $6,990.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
21c. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf 50 Lb. Bag London (LoCI) Lb. 30,000 $0.311 $9,330.000 $0.236 $7,080.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
21d. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf 50 Lb. Bag Marion (MCI) Lb. 1,000 $0.311 $311.000 $0.227 $227.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
21e. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf 50 Lb. Bag Orient (PCI) Lb. 45,000 $0.311 $13,995.000 $0.229 $10,305.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total  $35,298.500 $26,349.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

22a. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 111913 50 Lb. Bag Chillicothe (CCI) Lb. 14,000 $0.461 $6,454.000 $0.395 $5,530.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
22b. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 111913 50 Lb. Bag Lebanon (LeCI) Lb. 24,000 $0.461 $11,064.000 $0.395 $9,480.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

AWARD

DISQUALIFY

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING Page 4
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VENDOR NO. ANNUAL
VENDOR NAME EST.
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LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

  
  

62
Kalmbach Feeds, Inc.
5 Working Days ARO

Ohio  Ohio

 
4 7

  

5
Cargill Animal Nutrition

1

5 Working Days ARO

3

 
 
 

22c. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 111913 50 Lb. Bag London (LoCI) Lb. 40,000 $0.461 $18,440.000 $0.398 $15,920.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
22d. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 111913 50 Lb. Bag Marion (MCI) Lb. 500 $0.461 $230.500 $0.389 $194.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
22e. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 111913 50 Lb. Bag Orient (PCI) Lb. 500 $0.461 $230.500 $0.391 $195.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $36,419.000 $31,320.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

23a. OPI/ODRC London Dry 111813 50 Lb. Bag Chillicothe (CCI) EA 16,000 $0.454 $7,264.000 $0.386 $6,176.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
23b. OPI/ODRC London Dry 111813 50 Lb. Bag Lebanon (LeCI) EA 18,000 $0.454 $8,172.000 $0.386 $6,948.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
23c. OPI/ODRC London Dry 111813 50 Lb. Bag London (LoCI) EA 45,000 $0.454 $20,430.000 $0.389 $17,505.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
23d. OPI/ODRC London Dry 111813 50 Lb. Bag Marion (MCI) EA 85,000 $0.454 $38,590.000 $0.380 $32,300.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
23e. OPI/ODRC London Dry 111813 50 Lb. Bag Orient (PCI) EA 500 $0.454 $227.000 $0.382 $191.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Total $74,683.000 $63,120.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

GRAND TOTAL(S) $124,461.000 $562,695.500

AWARD

AWARD

EVALUATION:  Each Bid item (1. through 23.) will be evaluated using the annual usage provided for each location, multiplied by Bid 
Markup Price per ton or Bid Price per pound as applicable for each location and then summed to determine the lowest total responsive 
and responsible cost for each Bid item.  Allowance prices, if requested for customer pick-up of individual items will not be a part of the bid 
evaluation. 
CONTRACT AWARD:  A Contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for each Bid item.  
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