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Mechanically Separated Turkey, Frozen, as 

specified $0.180 Lb. 220,000 $0.057 $0.237 $52,140.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.120 $0.300 $66,000.000

BuyOhio $2,607.000 AWARD

Total $54,747.000

DISQUALIFY

Mechancially Separated Chicken, Frozen, as 

specified $0.280 Lb. 530,000 $0.052 $0.332 $175,960.000 $0.080 $0.360 $190,800.000 NO BID $0.280 $0.000

BuyOhio $8,798.000

Total $184,758.000

AWARD
Turkey Trim Thigh Meat, Boneless, Skinless, 

Frozen, as specified $1.050 Lb. 200,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.120 $1.170 $234,000.000

AWARD

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, DAS will evaluate the bid 

prices by determining the lowest estimated annual total cost to the state.  DAS will begin with a base price of $ .18 per pound. for 

mechanically separated turkey, frozen. $ .28 per pound for mechanically separated chicken and $ 1.05 per pound for turkey trim thigh 

meat, boneless, skinless, frozen which are the Urner-Barry Current Prices as of March 15, 2016. DAS will add or subtract each Bidder’s 

mark-up or mark-down from the base price and multiply the result by the state’s estimated annual usage for each item to arrive at the 

lowest estimated annual cost for each item. 

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest cost responsive and 

responsible bidder by item.

OPENING DATE: April 11, 2016

MI

1

Chicago Meat Group, Inc.

2

National Food Group, Inc.

VENDOR NO.

VENDOR NAME

DEL. OFFERED 14 Days ARO

ILLOC. BY STATE

BID NO.:  OT900417

3

Stellar Marketing, Inc

14 Days ARO

OH

14 Days ARO
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