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INDEX NO.:   DPS042

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

 USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA
Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

CATEGORY/Description 

CATEGORY #1 / Yamaha TW200 EA 1 $3,950.000 $3,950.000 $3,996.000 $3,996.000 $0.000 NO BID

Buy American $4,235.76

Setup Charge N/C

Model: ATK 

GV250 $40.000 $0.000

Parts Manual $0.000 N/C Electronic $0.000

Service Manual $0.000 $58.500

Paper / N/C 

Elec. $0.000

CATEGORY #2 / Honda CMX 250 Rebel EA 1 $0.000 NO BID $4,341.000 $4,341.000 $4,386.000 $4,386.000

Buy American $4,601.46 $4,649.16

Setup Charge $0.000 $72.000 $0.000

Parts Manual $0.000 N/C Electronic $40.000 Paper

Service Manual $0.000 $35.040 Paper $40.000 Paper

CATEGORY #3 / Suzuki TU 250X EA 1 $0.000 NO BID $4,588.000 $4,588.000 $0.000 NO BID

Buy American $4,863.28

Setup Charge $0.000 $50.000 $0.000

Parts Manual $0.000 N/C Electronic $0.000

Service Manual $0.000 $71.500 Paper $0.000

CATEGORY #4 / Yamaha TW200 (MY2015) EA 1 $0.000 No Award $0.000 No Award $0.000 No Award

CATEGORY #5 / Honda CMX 250 Rebel EA 1 $0.000 No Award $0.000 No Award $4,386.000 No Award
Buy American
Setup Charge $0.000
Parts Manual $40.000 Paper
Service Manual $40.000 Paper

CATEGORY #6 / Suzuki TU 250X (MY2015) EA 1 $0.000 No Award $0.000 No Award $0.000 No Award

   

DQ AWARD

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by category.  Multiple awards may result from this bid. The state makes no representation or guarantee as to the actual amount of units to 

be purchased by the participating agency.

BID NO.:  OT900217 OPENING DATE: 04/22/16COMPLETED BY: K. Murphy

2

Powersports Plus

 

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by category. Bidders are eligible to receive awards of

multiple categories providing he/she is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed herein. The state will evaluate bids based upon the unit price of the motorcycles with all equipment

installed, operational and adjusted to factory specifications.  

Global Enforcement Motors
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Sill's Motor Sales Co. 
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(EDGE??) 

OHIO

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________


