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INDEX NO.:    

DPS013 BID NO: OT900216

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.
 

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA  

BRAND/ITEM Description Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price

Extended 

Price Bid Price

Extended 

Price Bid Price

Extended 

Price Bid Price

Extended 

Price

Category A.

1a. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 295-177-91 Ea. 600 NO BID $0.000 $134.500 $80,700.000 $136.410 $81,846.000 $126.800 $76,080.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1b. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 295-177-92 Ea. 70 NO BID $0.000 $134.500 $9,415.000 $136.410 $9,548.700 $126.800 $8,876.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1c. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 6280-277-131 Ea. 10 NO BID $0.000 $77.000 $770.000 $75.320 $753.200 $70.330 $703.300 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1d. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 6280-277-132 Ea. 2 NO BID $0.000 $77.000 $154.000 $75.320 $150.640 $70.330 $140.660 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1e. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 6280-277-91 Ea. 20 NO BID $0.000 $140.000 $2,800.000 $113.300 $2,266.000 $105.440 $2,108.800 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1f. Sidearm Duty Holster Safariland 295-277-92 Ea. 4 NO BID $0.000 $140.000 $560.000 $113.300 $453.200 $105.440 $421.760 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

2a. Sam Browne Belt Ea. 575 NO BID $0.000 $64.500 $37,087.500 $55.990 $32,194.250 $51.700 $29,727.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

2b. Sam Browne Shoulder Strap Ea. 145 NO BID $0.000 $39.850 $5,778.250 $37.710 $5,467.950 $34.500 $5,002.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

2c Duty Belt Ea. 500 NO BID $0.000 $38.000 $19,000.000 $36.880 $18,440.000 $34.950 $17,475.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

3a. Handcuff Case, High Gloss Ea. 400 NO BID $0.000 $28.500 $11,400.000 $19.940 $7,976.000 $25.700 $10,280.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

3b. Handcuff Case, Hardshell Ea. 150 NO BID $0.000 $20.600 $3,090.000 $23.500 $3,525.000 $16.400 $2,460.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

4a. Double Magazine Pouch, High Gloss Ea. 400 NO BID $0.000 $26.650 $10,660.000 $25.780 $10,312.000 $20.950 $8,380.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

4b. Double Magazine Pouch, Hardshell Ea. 120 NO BID $0.000 $26.650 $3,198.000 $22.930 $2,751.600 $18.750 $2,250.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

5a. Chemical Mace Holder, High Gloss Ea. 250 NO BID $0.000 $20.600 $5,150.000 $19.940 $4,985.000 $16.250 $4,062.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

5b. Chemical Mace Holder, Hardshell Ea. 100 NO BID $0.000 $20.600 $2,060.000 $17.080 $1,708.000 $14.050 $1,405.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

6a. Belt Keeper, 2 Snap Ea. 550 NO BID $0.000 $8.500 $4,675.000 $8.260 $4,543.000 $1.740 $957.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

6b. Belt Keeper, 2 Snap High Gloss Ea. 250 NO BID $0.000 $2.250 $562.500 $10.100 $2,525.000 $6.600 $1,650.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

7 Leather Trouser Belt Ea. 800 NO BID $0.000 $21.000 $16,800.000 $27.680 $22,144.000 $36.800 $29,440.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Category B.

1a. Rain Jacket, Size XS - XL, Blauer GTX 9691 OSP Ea. 275 $239.900 $65,972.500 $244.000 $67,100.000 $367.310 $101,010.250 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1b. Rain Jacket, Size 2XL - 3XL Blauer GTX 9691 OSP Ea. 5 $239.900 $1,199.500 $244.000 $1,220.000 $367.300 $1,836.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1c. Rain Pants, Size XS - XL, Blauer 9972 Ea. 130 $194.500 $25,285.000 $176.790 $22,982.700 $125.930 $16,370.900 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

1d. Rain Pants, Size 2XL - 3XL, Blauer 9972 Ea. 2 $194.500 $389.000 $176.790 $353.580 $125.930 $251.860 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

2 High Visibility Safety Vest, Blauer 339 Ea. 360 $54.900 $19,764.000 $52.000 $18,720.000 $47.220 $16,999.200 NO BID $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Grand Total $324,236.530 $348,058.250 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

AWARD

CONTRACT AWARD: The contract will be awarded to one lowest responsive and responsible bidder by low lot total. 

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”.  In addition, the 

state will multiply the bid unit price per item times the estimated annual usage per item and sum the totals for all items to 

arrive at the lowest overall cost for all items. Failure to bid all items may result in the bidder being deemed not 

responsive. 

DISQUALIFY DISQUALIFY

UNIFORM ACCESSORIES FOR THE OHIO HIGHWAY PATROL; SIDEARM DUTY 
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Vance Outdoors

OPENING DATE: May 29, 2015
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