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INDEX NO.:    DNR018 BID NO.:   OT900014; Law Enforcement Uniforms for the Ohio Department of Natural Resources

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM EA

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

ITEM/Description

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 319X6604, Size 

13" through 18 1/2" EA 90 NO BID $0.000 $52.000 $4,680.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 319X6604, Size 

19" & Up" EA 10 NO BID $0.000 $55.000 $550.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
Men's Long Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

319X6604Z, Size 13" through 18 1/2" EA 199 NO BID $0.000 $55.000 $10,945.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Long Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

319X6604Z, Size 19" & Up EA 20 NO BID $0.000 $58.000 $1,160.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 203X6604, 

Size 30 through 46 EA 24 NO BID $0.000 $52.000 $1,248.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 203X6604, 

Size 48 & Up EA 1 NO BID $0.000 $55.000 $55.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, 

Style 203X6604Z, Size 30 through 46 EA 60 NO BID $0.000 $55.000 $3,300.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Long Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, 

Style 203X6604Z, Size 30 through 46 EA 2 NO BID $0.000 $58.000 $116.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 669X6604, Size 

13" through 18 1/2" EA 105 NO BID $0.000 $48.000 $5,040.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 669X6604, Size 

19" & Up EA 15 NO BID $0.000 $51.000 $765.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

669X6604Z, Size 13" through 18 1/2" EA 290 NO BID $0.000 $51.000 $14,790.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Short Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

669X6604Z, Size 19" & Up EA 19 NO BID $0.000 $54.000 $1,026.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 253X6604, 

Size 20 through 46 EA 20 NO BID $0.000 $48.000 $960.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 253X6604, 

Size 48 & Up EA 5 NO BID $0.000 $51.000 $255.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, 

Style 253X6604Z, Size 20 through 46 EA 69 NO BID $0.000 $51.000 $3,519.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt w/Zipper Front, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, 

Style 253X6604Z, Size 48 & Up EA 8 NO BID $0.000 $54.000 $432.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Class A Trouser With Leg Stripe, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

47285DNR Short Rise 28 - 40 (even only) EA 10 NO BID $0.000 $69.000 $690.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Class A Trouser With Leg Stripe, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

47285DNR Reg Rise 28 - 60 (even only over 38) EA 119 NO BID $0.000 $69.000 $8,211.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Class A Trouser With Leg Stripe, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, Style 

47285DNR Long Rise 32 0 42 (even only) EA 20 NO BID $0.000 $69.000 $1,380.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Class A Trouser With Leg Stripe, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, 

Style 47295DNR, Size 4 - 24 EA 20 NO BID $0.000 $69.000 $1,380.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Brush Pants, Flying Cross by Fechheimer, style ODNRTRS01, Size 

Reg Rise 29 - 50 (even only over 40) EA 73 NO BID $0.000 $128.000 $9,344.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Brush Pants, Flying Cross by Fechhemer, Style ODNRTRSW01, 

Size 2 - 22 (even sizes only) EA 17 NO BID $0.000 $128.000 $2,176.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Duty Uniform Pants by Blauer, Style 8830, Sizes Regular Rise 28 - 54 

(even sizes only) EA 229 NO BID $0.000 $64.000 $14,656.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Duty Uniform Pants by Blauer, Style 8830W, Sizes Regular Rise 2 - 

22 (even sizes only) EA 67 NO BID $0.000 $64.000 $4,288.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

ODNR Men's and Women's Dress Blouse, Fechheimer Brothers Dress Coat 

(Made-to-Measure) EA 2 NO BID $0.000 $339.000 $678.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Tacshell Jacket 4-in-1, Jacket and Softshell Liner by Blauer, Style 9820Z, 

Sizes XS - XL EA 45 NO BID $0.000 $340.000 $15,300.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000
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Tacshell Jacket 4-in-1, Jacket and Softshell Liner by Blauer, Style 9820Z, 

Sizes 2XL - 3XL EA 26 NO BID $0.000 $40.000 $1,040.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Tacshell Jacket Only by Blauer, Style 9820, Size XS - XL EA 12 NO BID $0.000 $214.000 $2,568.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Tacshell Jacket Only by Blauer, Style 9820, Size 2XL - 3XL EA 8 NO BID $0.000 $214.000 $1,712.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Softshell Liner Only by Blauer, Style 4660, Size XS - XL EA 56 NO BID $0.000 $126.000 $7,056.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Softshell Liner Only by Blauer, Style 4660, Size 2XL - 3XL EA 26 NO BID $0.000 $126.000 $3,276.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's 3-Eye Padded Collar Leather Chukka Boot by Bates, Style 78 PR 40 $114.950 $4,598.000 $98.000 $3,920.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Academy Oxford by Thorogood, Style 834-6041 PR 57 $61.000 $3,477.000 $48.000 $2,736.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Uninsulated Acadia Boot by Danner, Style 21210 PR 90 $209.950 $18,895.500 $215.000 $19,350.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Insulated Acadia 400 Boot by Danner, Style 22600 PR 75 $218.950 $16,421.250 $225.000 $16,875.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Kinetic 6" Boot, Gore Tex by Danner, Style 28015 PR 23 $121.000 $2,783.000 $115.000 $2,645.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Men's Kinetic 8" Boot, Gore Tex by Danner, Style 28010 PR 75 $126.000 $9,450.000 $120.000 $9,000.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Dura Shock Oxford by Bates, Style 752 PR 11 $103.950 $1,143.450 $90.000 $990.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Uninsulated Acadia Boot by Danner, Style 21210W PR 14 $209.950 $2,939.300 $215.000 $3,010.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Insulated Acadia 400 Boot by Danner, Style 22600W PR 12 $218.000 $2,616.000 $225.000 $2,700.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Women's Kinetic 6" Boot, Gore Tex by Danner, Style 28080 PR 9 $120.000 $1,080.000 $115.000 $1,035.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Mock Turtleneck, Men's and Women's Unisex Sizes, Ufx by Elbeco, Size XS 

- 5XL, Style 8920 EA 231 NO BID $0.000 $38.000 $8,778.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Hat, Straw, Campaign, Double Brim by Stratton, Style S-40DB EA 62 NO BID $0.000 $75.000 $4,650.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Hat, Flet, Campaign by Stratton, Style F-40 EA 62 NO BID $0.000 $103.000 $6,386.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Rain Cover for Campaign Hat by Stratton, Style RC-MP EA 77 NO BID $0.000 $6.000 $462.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Three Piece Black Hat Strap by Stratton, Style ST-3P-BK EA 27 NO BID $0.000 $6.000 $162.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Hat Cord, Silver With Silver Acorns by Stratton, Style CD-SR EA 27 NO BID $0.000 $7.000 $189.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Hat Cord, Gold with Gold Acorns by Stratton, Style CD-GD EA 4 NO BID $0.000 $7.000 $28.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Hat Trap by Stratton EA 10 NO BID $0.000 $72.000 $720.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Stratton Factory Renovation for Stratton Felt and Straw Campaign Style 

Hats EA 7 NO BID $0.000 $49.000 $343.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Inner Duty Belt, Ultra, Black by Uncle Mike's, Style # 87811, 21, 31, 41, 42 EA 18 NO BID $0.000 $20.000 $360.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Broome Necktie Clip-On, Polyester/Wool 3", 14 1/2" Style 45055 EA 1 NO BID $0.000 $5.000 $5.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Broome Necktie Clip-On, Polyester/Wool 3", 18" Style 45015 EA 1 NO BID $0.000 $5.000 $5.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Broome Necktie Clip-On, Polyester/Wool 3", 20" Style 45045 EA 1 NO BID $0.000 $6.000 $6.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Broome Necktie Clip-On, Polyester/Wool 3", 22" Style 45954 EA 1 NO BID $0.000 $6.000 $6.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

OPTIONAL Discount Off Vendor's Retail Price List for Items Not Listed (This 

item is not subject to evaluation) PCT N/A NO BID N/A 15.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0% 0.0%

Grand Total $63,403.500 $206,957.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

EVALUATION:  Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-5 of the “Instructions to Bidders”.  In addition the 

agency’s estimated annual usage will be multiplied by the Bidder’s offered prices and summed for all items to 

determine the lowest responsive and responsible bidder.  ODNR may evaluate samples as required to determine the 

items conform to the stated specifications.  Bidders should confirm that all pricing lines have been completed.

CONTRACT AWARD:  The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder capable of 

providing a turn-key uniform delivery and alteration service and an online, secure, custom catalog for ordering as 

described on page 5 of the bid by low lot total. Low lot total will be determined by multiplying the unit cost by the 

estimated usage listed of each item in the bid and then adding each of the item totals together to arrive at a total for all 

items. Failure to bid all items may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive.

DISQUALIFY AWARD
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