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INDEX NO.:   LDC006

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM Each Dose

Bid Price Buy America Extended Price Bid Price Buy America Extended Price Bid Price Buy America Extended Price Bid Price Buy America Extended Price Bid Price Buy America Extended Price

ITEM/Description 

$15.400 $15.40

$16.484 $369,406.44 $16.600 $372,006.00

$15.285 $15.285 $16.600 $16.60

$15.455 $15.455 $15.400 $15.400

$21.400 $107,000.00

$23.70 $119,922.00

$29.564 $31.34 $2,365.12 $36.400 $2,912.000

$16.200 $486.00

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Trivalent, Adult Formulation, Cell-Based 

ccIIV3, licensed for administration to ages 

18 years and over EA 1

$16.484 $16.484 $16.600 $16.600

Grand Total $491,740.784 $482,468.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

 

Sanofi Pasteur, Inc. Smith Kline Beecham

Withdrew Withdrew

Withdrew

2

Henry Schein, Inc.

PER ITB

 

5

 

PER ITB

  

PER ITB

Award:  The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by line item. 

Evaluation: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, the State will multiply the unit cost

by the estimated usage to arrive at an extended price for each line item. If the estimated usage is unknown, then one (1) will be used as the

estimated usage, for calculation purposes only.

Award

No Bid No Bid Withdrew

Award

PRODUCT/SERVICE: Flu Vaccines

H.D. Smith, LLC

1

PER ITB

BID NO.:  Influenza Vaccine 2016-2017 OPENING DATE: 1/15/16

3

PER ITB

Smith Kline Beecham

4

1 Withdrew

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult Formulation, IIV4, 

licensed for administration to ages 6 

months and over

Award

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult No Preservative 

Formulation, IIV4, licensed for 

administration to ages 36 months and over

Award

No Bid

22,410

1

EA

EA

EA

EA

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Pediatric No Preservative 

Formulation, IIV4, licensed for 

administration to ages 6 – 35 months

5,000EA

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult Formulation, IIV4, 

licensed for administration to ages 18 

years and over

1

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult No Preservative 

Formulation, IIV4, licensed for 

administration to ages 18 years and over

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Trivalent, Adult High-Dose Preservative 

Free Formulation, IIV3, licensed for 

administration to ages 65 years and over

80

5,060

Award

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Live Attenuated, 

Quadrivalent, Intranasal Spray, LAIV4, 

licensed for administration to ages 2-49 

years

Award

EA

EA Withdrew Withdrew

EA 1

Withdrew Withdrew

Withdrew Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult Preservative Free 

Formulation, IIV4, licensed for 

administration to ages 4 years and over

Award

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, 

Quadrivalent, Adult Intradermal 

Preservative Free Formulation, IIV4, 

licensed for administration to ages 18-64 

years

EA 30 AwardNo Bid

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

No Bid

No Bid Withdrew

Award

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew Withdrew Withdrew

Withdrew

Withdrew Withdrew

Withdrew

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________


