' Index No. MACO052N
O I(DA Contract No. 0T913605
Rev. Date 08/05/08

STATE OF OHIO
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
4200 SURFACE ROAD, COLUMBUS, OH 43228-1395

AMENDMENT FOR CHANGE
AMENDMENT NO. 15

TO: ALL STATE AGENCIES, STATE INSTITUTIONS OF HIGHER EDUCATION AND PROPERLY REGISTERED
COOPERATIVE PURCHASING MEMBERS.
FROM: HUGH QUILL, DIRECTOR, DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES

SUBJECT: TERM CONTRACT - AMMUNITION FOR PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN AND LESS
LETHAL TACTICAL MUNITIONS AND CHEMICAL MUNITIONS FOR CROWD AND RIOT CONTROL

Attached are pages 82-88, and 91 to this contract. Remove these pages from the existing contract and replace with the
attached pages on the effective and/or revision date.

This amendment is issued to advise all users of a price increase to all products supplied by the Zero Ammunition Company,
Inc. This price increase applies to all orders placed on or after 08/05/08.

All other prices, terms and conditions remain unchanged.
Questions regarding this Amendment and/or the Requirements Contract may be directed to:

Michael S. Shaw, CPPB
<michael.shaw@das.state.oh.us>

This Amendment, the main Requirements Contract and any additional amendments thereto are available from the DAS
website at the following address:

ROTRIeME
e 8

http://www.ohio.gov/procure

Affected Contractor(s):

0000105098

Zero Ammunition Company, Inc

1601 22nd Street S.E., P.O. Box 1188
Cullman, AL 35056-1188

CONTRACTOR'S CONTACT: Margaret Stallings E-mail address: zerobulletco@aol.com
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PRICE SCHEDULE

PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN
AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.
Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)

All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case or box as indicated herein. Quantity breaks
are for orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

For lead free primer in ammo, add $10.00 per 1,000 rounds.

STATE YOUR SINGLE DISCOUNT OFFERED FROM PUBLISHED CATALOG PRICE LIST, F.O.B. PREPAID DESTINATION:

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT FROM CATALOG PRICE LIST
%L:ja:gﬂ:g/sgf PISTOL AMMUNITION RIFLE AMMUNITION SHOTGUN AMMUNITION
Less Than
Five Cases NET NO BID NO BID
Five To Ten
Cases 2% NO BID NO BID
Eleven To
Forty-nine
Cases 3% NO BID NO BID
Fifty To
Ninety-nine
Cases 5% NO BID NO BID
One Hundred
Cases
And Above 10% NO BID NO BID

IDENTIFY THE MINIMUM PUBLISHED FACTORY DIRECT CASE QUANTITY REQUIREMENT TO QUALIFY FOR FOB
DESTINATION FREIGHT SHIPMENT: 1,000 ROUNDS. REFERENCE SPECIAL CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS:
TRANSPORTATION CHARGES AND MINIMUM ORDER.

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT IF ORDERING AGENCY PICKS-UP: 0 %

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC
FACTORY RELOAD
LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

RELOADED PRICE PER 1,000 | PRICE PER 1,000
MFG. SKU. DESCRIPTION CASES 15,000 AND UP | LESS THAN 15,000
38 SUPER CALIBER
403 | 115 GR JHP | EXCHANGE | 173.79 | 176.79
38 SPECIAL
602 110GR JHP+P RELOAD 195.50 204.46
603 110GR JHP+P EXCHANGE 154.70 163.66
605 125GR JHP+P RELOAD 197.90 206.85
606 125GR JHP+P EXCHANGE 154.70 163.66
605NP 125GR JHPNOT+P RELOAD 197.90 206.85
606NP 125GR JHPNOT+P EXCHANGE 154.70 163.66
626 125GR JSP+P RELOAD 197.90 206.85
627 125GR JSP+P EXCHANGE 154.70 163.66
620 158GR JHP+P RELOAD 210.12 218.83
621 158GR JHP+P EXCHANGE 166.92 175.62

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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PRICE SCHEDULE

PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN
AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.
Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)

All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case or box as indicated herein. Quantity breaks
are for orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

For lead free primer in ammo, add $10.00 per 1,000 rounds.
ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC

FACTORY RELOAD
LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

RELOADED PRICE PER 1,000 PRICE PER 1,000
MFG. SKU. DESCRIPTION CASES 15,000 AND UP LESS THAN 15,000

38 SPECIAL CALIBER

620NP 158GR JHPNOT+P RELOAD 210.12 218.83
621NP 158GR JHPNOT+P EXCHANGE 166.92 175.62
623 158GR JSP+P RELOAD 210.12 218.83
624 158GR JSP+P EXCHANGE 166.92 175.62
629 158GR TMFP RELOAD 216.62 225.60
629NP 158GR TMFPNP RELOAD 216.62 225.60
630NP 158GR TMFPNP EXCHANGE 173.42 182.40
611 148GR WCDE RELOAD 154.16 164.46
612 148GR WCDE EXCHANGE 110.98 121.26
608 148GR WCHB RELOAD 154.16 164.46
609 148GR WCHB EXCHANGE 110.96 121.26
614 158GR SWC RELOAD 164.83 168.11
615 158GR SWC EXCHANGE 121.63 124.91
644 158GR SWC+P RELOAD 167.82 177.09
645 158GR SWC+P EXCHANGE 124.62 133.89
647 158GR RN+P RELOAD 167.82 177.09
648 158GR RN+P EXCHANGE 124.62 133.89
638 158GR SWCHP+P RELOAD 167.82 177.09
639 158GR SWCHP+P EXCHANGE 124.62 133.89
632 158GR SWCHV RELOAD 167.82 177.09
633 158GR SWCHV EXCHANGE 124.82 133.89
617 158GR RNL RELOAD 164.83 168.11
618 158GR RNL EXCHANGE 121.63 124.91
635 158GR RNHV RELOAD 167.82 177.09
636 158GR RNHV EXCHANGE 124.62 133.89
357 CALIBER

502 110GR JHP RELOAD 215.90 219.98
503 110 GR JHP EXCHANGE 168.30 172.38
505 125GR JHP RELOAD 216.88 221.73
506 125GR JHP EXCHANGE 169.28 174.13
514 125GR JSP RELOAD 216.88 221.73
515 125GR JSP EXCHANGE 169.28 174.13
517 158GR JSP RELOAD 222.86 231.85
518 158GR JSP EXCHANGE 175.26 184.24
508 158GR JHP RELOAD 222.86 231.85
509 158GR JHP EXCHANGE 175.26 184.24

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN

AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)

All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case or box as indicated herein. Quantity breaks
are for orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.
For lead free primer in ammo, add $10.00 per 1,000 rounds.

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC
FACTORY RELOAD

LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

RELOADED PRICE PER 1,000 | PRICE PER 1,000
MFG. SKU. DESCRIPTION CASES 15,000 AND UP LESS THAN 15,000
357 CALIBER
520 158GR SWC RELOAD 181.49 189.42
521 158GR SWC EXCHANGE 133.89 141.82
511 158GR RNL RELOAD 181.49 189.42
512 158GR RNL EXCHANGE 133.89 141.82
45 ACP CALIBER
701 185GR SWC RELOAD 244.78 253.76
702 185GR SWC EXCHANGE 186.31 195.29
703 200GR SWC RELOAD 246.71 255.69
704 200GR SWC EXCHANGE 188.23 197.21
705 230GR RNL RELOAD 246.71 255.69
706 230GR RNL EXCHANGE 188.23 197.21
707TC 230GR TMJ RELOAD 309.68 318.64
708TC 230GR TMJ EXCHANGE 251.17 260.15
707 230GR FMJ RELOAD 287.96 296.94
708 230GR FMJ EXCHANGE 229.48 238.46
718 230GR JHP RELOAD 304.28 313.25
719 230GR JHP EXCHANGE 245.78 254.77
721 185GR JHP RELOAD 301.43 310.40
722 185GR JHP EXCHANGE 242.95 251.92
9MM CALIBER
902 115GR JHP RELOAD 198.70 210.65
903 115GR JHP EXCHANGE 174.21 188.18
905 115GR FMJ RELOAD 193.03 203.18
906 115GR FMJ EXCHANGE 168.47 178.89
908 115GR JSP RELOAD 192.60 201.57
909 115GR JSP EXCHANGE 168.11 177.08
912 125GR JSP RELOAD 194.80 203.26
913 125GR JSP EXCHANGE 170.13 178.77
922 125GR JHP RELOAD 200.86 212.81
923 125GR JHP EXCHANGE 176.37 188.34
925 124GR FMJ RELOAD 194.60 203.57
926 124GR FMJ EXCHANGE 170.13 179.09
931C 125GR RNC RELOAD 178.89 187.87
932C 125GR RNC EXCHANGE 154.41 163.39
948 147GR JHP RELOAD 211.08 220.06
949 147GR JHP EXCHANGE 186.60 195.58
951 147GR FMJ RELOAD 208.75 217.73
952 147GR FMJ EXCHANGE 184.27 193.25

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN

AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)

All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case or box as indicated herein. Quantity breaks
are for orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

For lead free primer in ammo, add $10.00 per 1,000 rounds.

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC

FACTORY RELOAD

LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

RELOADED PRICE PER 1,000 | PRICE PER 1,000

MFG. SKU. DESCRIPTION CASES 15,000 AND UP | LESS THAN 15,000
10MM CALIBER
881 180GR JHP RELOAD 295.25 304.22
882 180GR JHP EXCHANGE 227.25 239.72
884 180GR TCFM RELOAD 295.25 304.22
885 180GR TCFM EXCHANGE 227.25 239.72
40 S&W CALIBER
802 180GR JHP RELOAD 231.67 237.12
803 180GR JHP EXCHANGE 207.19 214.97
805 180GR TCFM RELOAD 228.52 236.37
806 180GR TCFM EXCHANGE 204.04 211.89
863 165GR JHP RELOAD 231.67 239.45
864 165GR JHP EXCHANGE 207.19 214.97
866 165GR TCFM RELOAD 228.52 236.37
867 165GR TCFM EXCHANGE 204.04 211.89
357 SIG
864 125GR FPFM RELOAD 215.33 227.30
865 125GR FPFM EXCHANGE 188.13 200.10

FACTORY NEW AMMUNITION
38 SUPER CALIBER
401 | 115 GR JHP | FACTORY NEW | 309.43 316.43
38 SPECIAL CALIBER
601 110GR JHP+P FACTORY NEW 275.73 282.72
604 125GR JHP+P FACTORY NEW 275.73 282.72
604NP 125GR JHPNOT+P FACTORY NEW 275.73 282.72
625 125GR JSP+P FACTORY NEW 275.73 282.72
619 158GR JHP+P FACTORY NEW 286.78 294.95
622 158GR JSP+P FACTORY NEW 286.78 294.95
628 158GR TMFP FACTORY NEW 292.53 300.70
607 148GR WCHB FACTORY NEW 241.70 249.28
613 158GR SWC FACTORY NEW 245.94 252.93
643 158GR SWC+P FACTORY NEW 252.64 261.92
646 158GR RN+P FACTORY NEW 252.64 261.92
637 158GR SWCHP+P FACTORY NEW 252.64 261.92
631 158GR SWCHV FACTORY NEW 245.94 252.93
616 158GR RNL FACTORY NEW 245.94 252.93
634 158GR RNHV FACTORY NEW 245.94 252.93

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08




Index No. MACO52N
Rev. 08/05/08
Page 86

PRICE SCHEDULE

PISTOL, REVOLVER, RIFLE, AND SHOTGUN
AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.
Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)

All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case as indicated herein. Quantity breaks are for
orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC
FACTORY NEW AMMUNITION
LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

FACTORY NEW PRICE PER 1,000 PRICE PER 1,000 LESS
MFG. SKU. DESCRIPTION CASES 15,000 AND UP THAN 15,000
357 CALIBER

501 110GR JHP FACTORY NEW 301.28 308.28
504 125GR JHP FACTORY NEW 302.25 308.08
513 125GR JSP FACTORY NEW 302.25 308.08
516 158GR JSP FACTORY NEW 308.22 315.80
507 158GR JHP FACTORY NEW 308.22 315.80
519 158GR SWC FACTORY NEW 266.87 271.10
45 ACP CALIBER

710 185GR SWC FACTORY NEW 337.32 345.49
711 200GR SWC FACTORY NEW 339.27 347.44
712 230GR RN FACTORY NEW 339.27 347.44
713TC 230GR TMJ FACTORY NEW 402.21 410.37
713 230GR FMJ FACTORY NEW 380.51 388.88
717 230GR JHP FACTORY NEW 396.82 404.99
720 185GR JHP FACTORY NEW 393.99 400.98
9MM CALIBER

901 115GR JHP FACTORY NEW 302.45 309.45
921 124GR JHP FACTORY NEW 303.61 310.61
904 115GR FMJ FACTORY NEW 296.71 303.71
907 115GR JSP FACTORY NEW 296.71 303.71
911 125GR JSP FACTORY NEW 298.41 305.41
924 124GR FMJ FACTORY NEW 298.41 305.41
930C 125GR RNLC FACTORY NEW 282.64 305.97
947 147GR JHP FACTORY NEW 314.83 321.83
950 147GR FMJ FACTORY NEW 312.50 319.50
10MM CALIBER

880 | 180GR JHP | FACTORY NEW | 376.00 383.00
40 S&W CALIBER

801 180GR JHP FACTORY NEW 374.05 381.05
804 180GR TCFM FACTORY NEW 373.13 380.13
862 165GR JHP FACTORY NEW 374.05 381.05
357 SIG

853 | 125GR FPFM | FACTORY NEW | 340.78 347.77

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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PRICE SCHEDULE

AMMUNITION

CONTRACTOR: : ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Catalog of: ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC.

Price List No.: LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST dated: September 04, 2007 (1)
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All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case as indicated herein. Quantity breaks are for
orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC

FACTORY NEW AMMUNITION

LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

PISTOL AMMO
ROUNDS PRICE PER
MFG SKU CALIBER GRAINS CASE/BOX CASE PRICE PER BOX
X38WCP .38 SPL 158 SWC+P 500/50 238.45
Q4171 .38 SPL 130 FMJ 500/50 140.21
Q4205 .38 SUP 130 FMJ 500/50 213.04
Q4206 .380 AUTO 95 FMJ 500/50 152.28
Q4240 44 MAG 240 JSP 500/50 326.66
L40SW3 40 S&W 180 FMJ 500/50 162.85
L45AP4 45 ACP 230 FMJ 500/50 416.96
45LC A45LC 225 STHP 500/25 188.31
AE40T3 40 S&W 165 FMJ 500/50 167.71
L380AP .380 AUTO 95 MC 500/50 285.04
38SBLP .38 SPL BLANK 2,000/50 859.09 22.78
RIFLE AMMO
Q3174 W7.62 X 39 123 FMJ 200/20 136.77
Q3131 W5.56 MM 55 FMJ 1,000/20 440.91
Q3132 30 110 FMJ 500/50 220.91
X3085 308 150 PP 200/20 252.75
X30061 30-06 SPGFLD 150 PP 200/20 252.75
X2704 270 150 PP 200/20 256.93
X25061 25-06 90 PXP 200/20 265.17
X222501 22/250 55 PSP 200/20 189.24
X22H2X 22 HORNET 46 HP 500/50 407.38
WX22LRH 22 LONG RIFLE 37 LD HP 5,000/50 273.24
WX22LR 22 LONG RIFLE 40 LD HP 5,000/50 273.24
SHOTGUN AMMO
XUl2 -6 W12 GA 2 3" #6 250/25 70.32
XU12 - 71/2 W12 GA 2 %" #7Y% 250/25 70.32
XU12 -8 W12 GA2 %" #8 250/25 70.32
XB1200 W12 GA2 %" 00 -9 PEL 250/5 204.93
X12XC085 W12 GA 2 3" 00-12 PEL 250/5 329.90
X12XCO385 W12 GA 3" 00 - 15 PEL 250/5 379.58
X12RS15 W12 GA2 %" 1 0Z SLUG 250/5 204.93
XB1200LR W12 GA 2 34" 00 LOW RECOIL 250/25 224.80
XP12 (10) W12 GA 2 3" BLANK 250/25 132.38 13.25

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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All ammunition is sold in case lots. Price list is per thousand rounds or per case as indicated herein. Quantity breaks are for
orders less than 15,000 rounds and orders more than 15,000 rounds. All ammunition packed 1,000/case unless noted.

ZERO AMMUNITION COMPANY, INC

FACTORY NEW AMMUNITION
LAW ENFORCEMENT PRICE LIST

PISTOL AMMO
ROUNDS PRICE PER

MFG SKU CALIBER GRAINS CASE/BOX CASE PRICE PER BOX
FIOCCHI
12HVOOBK W12 GA 2 %" #9 250/10 154.47
12GT8 W12 GA 2 %" #8 250/25 71.73
1278078 W12 GA 2 %" #8 LO RECOIL 250/25 77.31
12TSLUG W12 GA 2 %’ 10Z SLUG 250/5 196.77
12FLD9 W12 GA 2 %’ #9 FIELD 250/25 86.01
12FLDS8 W12 GA 2 %’ # 8 FIELD 250/25 86.06
25 AP 25 AUTO PISTOL 50 1,000/50 264.24
32 LA 32 S&W LONG 100 - LEAD 1,000/50 396.82
12LESLUG W12 GA 2 %’ 1 0Z SLUG LR 250/10 207.66
12HV9 W12 GA 2 % # 9 HI VELOCITY 250/25 117.37
12LE00BK W12 GA 2 %’ 00 -9 PEL LIR 250/10 154.47
TARGETS PRICED EACH
B27 SILHOUETTE — BLACK 0.66
B27C CENTER ONLY 0.22
B27E BLACK TARGET 0.44
B21 SILHOUETTE — BLACK — 50 YARD 0.66
B21E SILHOUETTE — BLACK — 25 YARD 0.50
FB1Q Q TARGETS 0.44
TQ15 TRAINING TARGET 0.61
B21EBL 25 YARD SILHOUETTE - BLUE 0.55
MISCELLANEOUS PRICED EACH
ZBC ZERO SHOOTERS CAP 6.30
ZBCT ZERO T-SHIRT - LARGE WH/RED/BLK 8.50
ZBCTXL ZERO T-SHIRT — X LARGE WH/RED/BLK 8.50
ZBCTXXL ZERO T-SHIRT — XX LARGE WHITE 10.70
ZBGS ZERO GOLF SHIRT — LARGE WHITE 16.20
ZBGSXL ZERO GOLF SHIRT — X LARGE WHITE 17.30
ZTS ZERO LONG SLEEVE — LARGE WHITE/BLACK 12.90
ZTSXL ZERO LONG SLEEVE — X LARGE WHITE/BLACK 12.90
ZTZXXL ZERO LONG SLEEVE — XX LARGE WHITE 15.65
ZBP ZERO PATCH 1.35

(1) Price list dated 09/04/07 is effective for all orders placed on or after 08/05/08
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SUMMARY OF AMENDMENTS

Amendment Revision Description
Number Date
15 08/05/08 Zero Ammunition: price increase for all products
14 07/05/08 Vance Outdoors: price increases for ASP, Hornady, Simunition, & Winchester
13 05/01/08 Standard Law: replace DEFTEC with ALS Technologies on 05/01/08
Price increases: Grindel, Standard Law, and Vance. Catalog manufacturer changes:
12 04/01/08 Grindel and notice of pending change for Standard Law: DEFTEC to ALS on 05/01
11 05/01/08 23 month renewal 05/01/08 thru 03/31/10 plus new e-mail address for Grindel
Grindel and Kiesler: (1) price increases, (2) Grindel: discontinuation of manufacturer
lines and/or individual line items, and (3) rectify a previous price entry error for the
10 02/01/08 Remington RA40T and RA40TA on the Vance price schedule
Standard Law: price increase for Remington — number of items increased —
9 09/15/07 repaginated pages 34-90 with eight additional pages to the contract
Vance Outdoors: Price increases for ASP, CTS, Hornady, Simunition, Winchester.
8 07/04/07 Plus NIGP Codes for product and freight are removed from the Contractor Index Pg.
7 06/08/07 Grindel Sales: price increase for Grindel manufactured ammunition
6 02/19/07 Grindel Sales: new 2007 catalog and price lists
Standard Law: (1) price increase for Defense Technologies, (2) new hazmat shipping
regulations for munitions, (3) new Federal tax exemption form for state & local, (4)
5 01/10/07 new mailing address for Standard Law
4 12/05/06 Kiesler Police Supply: new address
3 08/14/06 Kiesler Police Supply: price increase for Federal, Hornaday, and Winchester
2 06/01/06 Grindel Sales: new catalog and price lists
1 08/16/05 Standard Law: price increase for Remington and Defense Technologies




