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STATE OF OHIO
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
4200 SURFACE ROAD, COLUMBUS, OH 43228-1395

AMENDMENT FOR CHANGE
AMENDMENT NO. 4
TO: LIMITED DISTRIBUTION - OHIO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY
FROM: ROBERT BLAIR, DIRECTOR, DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
SUBJECT: COMPETITIVE SEALED PROPOSAL - SCRAP TIRE REMEDIATION
Attached are pages 1, and 6 - 23 to this contract. Remove these pages from the existing contract and replace with the
attached pages on the effective and/or revision date.

As a result of mutual agreement between the state of Ohio and the contractor, this amendment is issued to renew the
subject contract an additional year, effective 03/01/11 through 02/28/12.

Additionally, it will reflect a change of the contact name, telephone, fax and e-mail address for Rumpke of Ohio and is
issued to reflect a reassignment of contract to Geraldine Berry, CPPB, and the repagination of the Contract.

All other prices, terms and conditions remain unchanged.

Geraldine Berry, CPPB
geraldine.berry@das.state.oh.us

This Amendment, the Contract and any additional Amendments thereto are available from the DAS Web site at the
following address:

http://www.ohio.gov/procure

Affected Contractor(s):

OAKS ID #0000001975 OAKS ID #0000064450
Liberty Tire Services of Ohio Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.
3041 Jackson Pike P.O. Box 538708
Grove City, OH 43123 Cincinnati, OH

tlanders@libertytire.com ken.stidham@rumpke.com


http://www.ohio.gov/procure
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Rev.: 02/04/11
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STATE OF OHIO
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES
GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES
4200 SURFACE ROAD, COLUMBUS, OH 43228-1395

MANDATORY USE CONTRACT FOR: Scrap Tire Remediation Services

CONTRACT NUMBER: CSP900709 EFFECTIVE DATES: 07/24/08 TO 06/30/20
Renewal through 02/28/12 *

The Department of Administrative Services has accepted Proposals submitted in response to Request for Proposal (RFP) No.
CSP900709 that opened on June 27, 2008. The evaluation of the Proposal responses has been completed. The Offeror
listed herein has been determined to be the highest ranking Offeror and has been awarded a Contract for the services listed.
The respective Proposal response including, Contract Terms & Conditions, any Proposal amendment, special Contract Terms
& Conditions, specifications, pricing schedules and any attachments incorporated by reference and accepted by DAS become
a part of this Services Contract.

The agency listed herein is eligible to make purchases of the contracted services in any amount and at any time as determined
by the agency. The State makes no representation or guarantee that department will purchase the volume of services as
advertised in the Request for Proposal.

This Requirements Contract is effective beginning and ending on the dates noted above unless, prior to the expiration date,
the Contract is renewed, terminated, or cancelled in accordance with the Contract Terms and Conditions.

This Requirements Contract is available to the Ohio Environmental Protection Agency as applicable.

Questions regarding this and/or the Services Contract may be directed to:

Geraldine Berry, CPPB *
geraldine.berry@das.state.oh.us

This Requirements Contract and any Amendments thereto are available from the DAS Web site at the following address:

http://www.ohio.gov/procure

*To reflect a reassignment of contract to a new analyst and to extend the Contract through 02/28/12.


http://www.ohio.gov/procure

ATTACHMENT TEN

PART ONE: COMPENSATION RATE TABLE

Index No: EPA008
Rev. 02/04/11
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COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE

The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall

be as follows:

Rumpke of Ohio

Cincinnati Market Area 100 to 2,000 PTEs 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 | Over 100,001 PTEs

OAKS Item No: 18091 PTEs PTEs

A. | Price for site setup and $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization

B. | Price per ton to remove $221.23 $204.53 $ 155.22 $139.25
and process scrap tires

C. | Price per ton to remove $283.57 $ 266.87 $217.55 $ 201.58
and dispose of scrap tires

D. | Price per ton to remove $73.72 $73.72 $73.72 $73.72
and dispose of solid waste

E. | Price per acre to re- $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
seed/mulch areas

Must be U.S. Dollars

Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror
must provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range,
they must mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.

The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.

Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in
the work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other
counties may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0.

Additional Contingency Prices
Only When Authorized

Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off $300.00
container Weekly Rental $ 25.00 Per ton $ 100.00
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer $ No Bid

Weekly Rental $ no bid Per ton $ No Bid
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
feet in depth same as B, C, or D above
Removal of submerged tires in water Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
up to six (6) feet deep same as B, C, or D above
Excavation of buried fire residuals up Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
to a depth of six (6) feet same as B, C, or D above

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Adams

Allen

Ashland

Ashtabula

Athens

Auglaize

Belmont

Brown

Butler

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Carroll

Clermont

Champaign

Clark

Clinton

Columbiana

Coshocton

Crawford

Cuyahoga

Darke

Defiance

Delaware

Erie

Fairfield

Fayette

Franklin

Fulton

Gallia

Geauga

Greene

Guernsey

Hamilton

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Hancock

Hardin

Harrison

Henry

Highland

Hocking

Holmes

Huron

Jackson

Jefferson

Knox

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Lake

Lawrence

Licking

Logan

Lorain

Lucas

Madison

Mahoning

Marion

Medina

Meigs

Mercer

Miami

Monroe

Montgomery

Morgan

Morrow

Muskingum

Noble

Ottawa

Paulding

Perry

Pickaway

Pike

Portage

Preble

Putnam

Richland

Ross

Sandusky

Scioto

Seneca

Shelby

Stark

Summit

Trumbull

Tuscarawas

Union

Van Wert

Vinton

Warren

1.05

1.03

1.04

1.04

Washington

Wayne

Williams

Wood

Wyandot

* Repagination




Contractor Name

ATTACHMENT ELEVEN
COST SUMMARY TABLES FOR COMPUTING PRICE FOR PROPOSAL COMPARISON

Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.

Index No: EPAO08K
Rev. 02/04/11
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100 to 2,000 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 Over 100,001
PTEs PTEs PTEs PTEs

PTEs 2,000 4,000 12,000 125,000
A. Cost = Price for site setup/ $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
demobilization
Total tons of tires to process 19 38 114 1,184
Price per ton to remove and $221.23 $204.53 $ 155.22 $139.25
process scrap tires
B. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 4,203.37 $7,772.14 $ 17,695.08 $ 164,872.00
(tires recycled)
Total tons of tires disposed 1 2 6 16
Price per ton to remove and $ 283.57 $266.87 $217.55 $201.58
dispose of scrap tires
C. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 283.57 $ 533.74 $ 1,305.30 $ 3,225.28
(tires disposed)
Total tons of solid waste 5 5 50 125
Price per ton to remove and $73.72 $73.72 $73.72 $73.72
dispose of solid waste
D. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 368.60 $ 368.60 $ 6,686.00 $9,215.00
(solid waste)
Total acre at each site 1 1 5 10
Price per acre to re-seed/muich $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
areas
E. Cost = acres x Price per acre $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 20,000.00
F. SITE COST = A+B+C+D+E $ 8,855.54 $12,674.48 $ 34,686.38 $199,312.28
G. Number of Sites 28 22 17 1
H. TOTAL COST = F*G $247,955.12 $ 278,838.56 $ 589,668.46 $199,312.28

GRAND TOTAL = SUM OF ALL SITES (Row H)

$1,315,774.42

* Repagination
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COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE

The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall

be as follows:

Rumpke of Ohio

Northwest Market Area 100 to 2,000 PTEs 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 | Over 100,001 PTEs

OAKS Item No: 18092 PTEs PTEs

A. | Price for site setup and $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization

B. | Price per ton to remove $221.23 $204.53 $155.22 $139.25
and process scrap tires

C. | Price per ton to remove $ 283.57 $ 266.87 $217.55 $201.58
and dispose of scrap tires

D. | Price per ton to remove $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00
and dispose of solid waste

E. Price per acre to re- $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
seed/mulch areas

Must be U.S. Dollars

Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror
must provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range,
they must mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.

The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.

Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in
the work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other
counties may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0.

Additional Contingency Prices
Only When Authorized

Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off $ 550.00
container Weekly Rental $21.00 Per ton $ 100.00
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer $ No Bid

Weekly Rental $ no bid Per ton $ No Bid
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
feet in depth same as B, C, or D above
Removal of submerged tires in water Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
up to six (6) feet deep same as B, C, or D above
Excavation of buried fire residuals up Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
to a depth of six (6) feet same as B, C, or D above

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Adams

Allen

Ashland

Ashtabula

Athens

Auglaize

Belmont

Brown

Butler

Carroll

Clermont

Champaign

1.16

1.18

1.26

1.16

Clark

1.15

1.17

1.25

1.14

Clinton

Columbiana

Coshocton

Crawford

Cuyahoga

Darke

1.08

1.15

1.22

1.10

Defiance

Delaware

Erie

Fairfield

Fayette

Franklin

Fulton

Gallia

Geauga

Greene

1.11

1.16

1.23

1.12

Guernsey

Hamilton

Hancock

Hardin

Harrison

Henry

Highland

Hocking

Holmes

Huron

Jackson

Jefferson

Knox

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Lake

Lawrence

Licking

Logan

Lorain

Lucas

Madison

Mahoning

Marion

Medina

Meigs

Mercer

Miami

1.08

1.15

1.22

1.10

Monroe

Montgomery

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Morgan

Morrow

Muskingum

Noble

Ottawa

Paulding

Perry

Pickaway

Pike

Portage

Preble

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Putnam

Richland

Ross

Sandusky

Scioto

Seneca

Shelby

1.11

1.16

1.23

1.12

Stark

Summit

Trumbull

Tuscarawas

Union

Van Wert

Vinton

Warren

Washington

Wayne

Williams

Wood

Wyandot

* Repagination
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Contractor Name

ATTACHMENT ELEVEN
COST SUMMARY TABLES FOR COMPUTING PRICE FOR PROPOSAL COMPARISON

Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.

100 to 2,000 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 Over 100,001
PTEs PTEs PTEs PTEs

PTEs 2,000 4,000 12,000 125,000
A. Cost = Price for site setup/ $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization
Total tons of tires to process 19 38 114 1,184
Price per ton to remove and $221.23 $204.53 $ 155.22 $139.25
process scrap tires
B. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 4,203.37 $7,772.14 $ 17,695.08 $ 164,872.00
(tires recycled)
Total tons of tires disposed 1 2 6 16
Price per ton to remove and $ 283.57 $266.87 $217.55 $201.58
dispose of scrap tires
C. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 283.57 $ 533.74 $ 1,305.30 $ 3,225.28
(tires disposed)
Total tons of solid waste 5 5 50 125
Price per ton to remove and $96.00 $96.00 $96.00 $96.00
dispose of solid waste
D. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 480.00 $ 480.00 $ 4,800.00 $ 12,000.00
(solid waste)
Total acre at each site 1 1 5 10
Price per acre to re-seed/muilch $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
areas
E. Cost = acres x Price per acre $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 20,000.00
F. SITE COST = A+B+C+D+E $ 8,966.94 $ 15,785.88 $ 43,800.38 $215,097.28
G. Number of Sites 28 22 17 1
H. TOTAL COST = F*G $ 251,074.32 $ 347,289.36 $ 744,606.46 $ 215,097.28
GRAND TOTAL = SUM OF ALL SITES (Row H) $ 1,558,067.42

* Repagination
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COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE

The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall

be as follows:

Rumpke of Ohio

Central Market Area 100 to 2,000 PTEs 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 | Over 100,001 PTEs

OAKS Item No: 18093 PTEs PTEs

A. | Price for site setup and $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization

B. | Price per ton to remove $ 280.55 $ 240.67 $195.59 $160.32
and process scrap tires

C. | Price per ton to remove $ 339.05 $ 306.91 $261.83 $ 226.55
and dispose of scrap tires

D. | Price per ton to remove $101.54 $101.54 $101.54 $101.54
and dispose of solid waste

E. Price per acre to re- $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
seed/mulch areas

Must be U.S. Dollars

Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror
must provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range,
they must mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.

The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.

Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in
the work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other
counties may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0.

Additional Contingency Prices
Only When Authorized

Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off $ 400.00
container Weekly Rental $ 25.00 Per ton $ 120.00
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer $ No Bid

Weekly Rental $ no bid Per ton $ No Bid
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
feet in depth same as B, C, or D above
Removal of submerged tires in water Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
up to six (6) feet deep same as B, C, or D above
Excavation of buried fire residuals up Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
to a depth of six (6) feet same as B, C, or D above

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Adams

Allen

Ashland

Ashtabula

Athens

Auglaize

Belmont

Brown

Butler

Carroll

Clermont

Champaign

Clark

Clinton

Columbiana

Coshocton

Crawford

Cuyahoga

Darke

Defiance

Delaware

1.30

1.42

1.56

1.35

Erie

Fairfield

1.30

1.42

1.56

1.35

Fayette

1.35

1.17

1.25

1.14

Franklin

1.00

1.00

1.00

1.00

Fulton

Gallia

Geauga

Greene

Guernsey

Hamilton

Hancock

Hardin

Harrison

Henry

Highland

Hocking

Holmes

Huron

Jackson

Jefferson

Knox

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Lake

Lawrence

Licking

1.35

1.44

1.60

1.39

Logan

Lorain

Lucas

Madison

1.30

1.17

1.25

1.14

Mahoning

Marion

Medina

Meigs

Mercer

Miami

Monroe

Montgomery

Morgan

Morrow

Muskingum

Noble

Ottawa

Paulding

Perry

Pickaway

1.30

1.17

1.25

1.14

Pike

Portage

Preble

Putnam

Richland

Ross

Sandusky

Scioto

Seneca

Shelby

Stark

Summit

Trumbull

Tuscarawas

Union

1.35

1.42

1.56

1.35

Van Wert

Vinton

Warren

Washington

Wayne

Williams

Wood

Wyandot

* Repagination
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ATTACHMENT ELEVEN
COST SUMMARY TABLES FOR COMPUTING PRICE FOR PROPOSAL COMPARISON

Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.

Index No: EPAO08K
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100 to 2,000 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 Over 100,001
PTEs PTEs PTEs PTEs

PTEs 2,000 4,000 12,000 125,000
A. Cost = Price for site setup/ $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization
Total tons of tires to process 19 38 114 1,184
Price per ton to remove and $ 280.55 $ 240.67 $ 195.59 $ 160.32
process scrap tires
B. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 5,330.45 $9,145.46 $22,297.26 $ 189,818.88
(tires recycled)
Total tons of tires disposed 1 2 6 16
Price per ton to remove and $ 339.05 $306.91 $261.83 $ 226.55
dispose of scrap tires
C. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 339.05 $613.82 $1,570.98 $ 3,624.80
(tires disposed)
Total tons of solid waste 5 5 50 125
Price per ton to remove and $101.54 $101.54 $101.54 $101.54
dispose of solid waste
D. Cost = tons x Price per ton $507.70 $507.70 $5,077.00 $12,692.50
(solid waste)
Total acre at each site 1 1 5 10
Price per acre to re-seed/muich $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
areas
E. Cost = acres x Price per acre $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 20,000.00
F. SITE COST = A+B+C+D+E $10,177.20 $17,266.98 $ 48,945.24 $241,136.18
G. Number of Sites 28 22 17 1
H. TOTAL COST = F*G $ 284,961.60 $ 379,873.56 $ 832,069.08 $241,136.18

GRAND TOTAL = SUM OF ALL SITES (Row H)

$1,738,040.42

* Repagination
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COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE

The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall

be as follows:

Rumpke of Ohio

Southeast Market Area 100 to 2,000 PTEs 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 | Over 100,001 PTEs

OAKS Item No: 18094 PTEs PTEs

A. Price for site setup and $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization

B. | Price per ton to remove $243.98 $235.32 $190.24 $ 154.96
and process scrap tires

C. | Price per ton to remove $289.87 $295.05 $249.97 $214.70
and dispose of scrap tires

D. | Price per ton to remove $65.50 $65.50 $65.50 $ 65.50
and dispose of solid waste

E. | Price per acre to re- $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00
seed/mulch areas

Must be U.S. Dollars

Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror
must provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range,
they must mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.

The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.

Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in
the work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other
counties may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0.

Additional Contingency Prices
Only When Authorized

Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off $475.00
container Weekly Rental $ 15.00 Per ton $ 100.00
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer $ No Bid

Weekly Rental $ no bid Per ton $ No Bid
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
feet in depth same as B, C, or D above
Removal of submerged tires in water Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
up to six (6) feet deep same as B, C, or D above
Excavation of buried fire residuals up Per ton $ No Bid Processing and disposal costs
to a depth of six (6) feet same as B, C, or D above

* Repagination
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Adams

1.21

1.44

1.58

1.37

Allen

Ashland

Ashtabula

Athens

Auglaize

Belmont

Brown

1.11

1.16

1.23

1.12

Butler

Carroll

Clermont

1.05

1.03

1.04

1.04

Champaign

Clark

Clinton

1.08

1.03

1.07

1.04

Columbiana

Coshocton

Crawford

Cuyahoga

Darke

Defiance

Delaware

Erie

Fairfield

Fayette

Franklin

Fulton

Gallia

Geauga

Greene

Guernsey

Hamilton

Hancock

Hardin

Harrison

Henry

Highland

1.16

1.18

1.26

1.16

Hocking

Holmes

Huron

Jackson

Jefferson

Knox
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ATTACHMENT TEN: COST SUMMARY
PART TWO: COST FACTORS TO APPLY TO PART ONE FOR VARIOUS COUNTIES — Continued
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County

100 to 2,000
PTEs

2,001 to 10,000
PTEs

10,001 to 100,000
PTEs

Over 100,001
PTEs

Lake

Lawrence

Licking

Logan

Lorain

Lucas

Madison

Mahoning

Marion

Medina

Meigs

Mercer

Miami

Monroe

Montgomery

Morgan

Morrow

Muskingum

Noble

Ottawa

Paulding

Perry

Pickaway

Pike

Portage

Preble

Putnam

Richland

Ross

Sandusky

Scioto

Seneca

Shelby

Stark

Summit

Trumbull

Tuscarawas

Union

Van Wert

Vinton

Warren

Washington

Wayne

Williams

Wood

Wyandot
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Contractor Name

ATTACHMENT ELEVEN
COST SUMMARY TABLES FOR COMPUTING PRICE FOR PROPOSAL COMPARISON

Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.
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100 to 2,000 2,001 to 10,000 10,001 to 100,000 Over 100,001
PTEs PTEs PTEs PTEs

PTEs 2,000 4,000 12,000 125,000
A. Cost = Price for site setup/ $ 2,000.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 15,000.00
demobilization
Total tons of tires to process 19 38 114 1,184
Price per ton to remove and $243.98 $ 235.32 $190.24 $ 154.96
process scrap tires
B. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 4,635.62 $8,942.16 $21,687.36 $ 183,472.64
(tires recycled)
Total tons of tires disposed 1 2 6 16
Price per ton to remove and $ 289.87 $ 295.05 $ 249.97 $214.70
dispose of scrap tires
C. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 289.87 $590.10 $1,499.82 $ 3,435.20
(tires disposed)
Total tons of solid waste 5 5 50 125
Price per ton to remove and $ 65.50 $ 65.50 $ 65.50 $65.50
dispose of solid waste
D. Cost = tons x Price per ton $ 327.50 $ 327.50 $ 3,275.00 $ 8,187.50
(solid waste)
Total acre at each site 1 1 5 10
Price per acre to re-seed/muich $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00
areas
E. Cost = acres x Price per acre $ 2,000.00 $ 2,000.00 $ 10,000.00 $ 20,000.00
F. SITE COST = A+B+C+D+E $9,252.99 $ 16,859.76 $46,462.18 $ 230,095.34
G. Number of Sites 28 22 17 1
H. TOTAL COST = F*G $ 259,083.72 $370,914.72 $ 789,857.06 $ 230,095.34

GRAND TOTAL = SUM OF ALL SITES (Row H)

$1,649,950.84
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CONTRACTOR INDEX

CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: *  BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-1 (02/28/12)
OAKS ID # 0000001975
Liberty Tire Services of Ohio, LLC TERMS: Net 30 Days
3041 Jackson Pike
Grove City, OH 43123
Remit To Address
OAKS ID # 0000001975
Liberty Tire Services of Ohio, LLC
3041 Jackson Pike
Grove City, OH 43123
CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Tim Landers Telephone: (614)-732-95387500

Fax: (866)-759-7538

E-Mail: tlanders@libertytire.com
CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: *  BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-6 (02/28/12)
OAKS ID # 0000064450
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. TERMS: Net 30 Days
10795 Hughes Road
Cincinnati, OH 45251
Remit To Address
OAKS ID # 0000064450
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.
P.O. Box 538708
Cincinnati, OH 45253

*  CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Ken Stidham Telephone: (513) 851-0122 Ext 7156
Fax: (513) 851-2057
E-Mail: Ken.Stidham@rumpke.com

*  Repagination, indicate a renewal of the Contract for an additional year by mutual agreement between Contractor and the
state of Ohio, and reflect a change of the Contractor’'s contact name, telephone, fax and e-mail address.


mailto:tlanders@libertytire.com
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SUMMARY OF AMENDMENTS

Amendment
Number

Revision
Date

Description

02/04/11

* This amendment is issued to indicate repagination and renewal of this contract for
the period between 03/01/10 through 02/28/11 by mutual agreement between the
State and its Contractors - Liberty Tire Recycling and Rumpke of Ohio.
Additionally, it will reflect a change of the contractor, Rumpke of Ohio, contact
name, telephone, fax and e-mail address. In addition, this amendment is issued to
reflect a reassignment of contract to a new analyst.

08/30/10

To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number, the Contractor’s ID number
and the OAKS item number for Rumpke of Ohio, effective with all orders issued on
or after August 30, 2010.

07/01/10

To indicate a mutually agreed upon extension to the Contract July 1, 2010 through
February 28, 2011; with Liberty Tire Recycling and with Rumpke of Ohio effective
with all orders issued on or after July 1, 2010.

10/30/09

Add a category and cost for professional surveying for Liberty Tire.




