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STATE OF OHIO 
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES 

GENERAL SERVICES DIVISION 
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT SERVICES 

4200 SURFACE ROAD, COLUMBUS, OH  43228-1395 
 
 

AMENDMENT FOR CHANGE 
AMENDMENT NO.  3 

 
 
TO: LIMITED DISTRIBUTION - OHIO ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION AGENCY 
 
FROM: HUGH QUILL, DIRECTOR, DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES 
 
SUBJECT: TERM CONTRACT -  SCRAP TIRE REMEDIATION 
 
 
Attached are pages 7, 11, 12, 16, 17, 21, 22, 26 and 27 to this contract.  Remove these  pages  from the existing contract and 
replace with the attached pages  on the effective and/or revision date. 
 
This amendment is issued to indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number, the Contractor’s ID Number, and the OAKS 
item Number effective with all orders issued on or after August 30, 2010. 
 
All other prices, terms and conditions remain unchanged. 
 
Questions regarding this Amendment and/or the Requirements Contract may be directed to: 

 
Janice Fitzpatrick, CPPB 

janice.fitzpatrick@das.state.oh.us 
 
This Amendment, the main Requirements Contract and any additional amendments thereto are available from the DAS Web 
site at the following address: 
 

 
 
 

http://www.ohio.gov/procure 
 
 
 
 

 
Affected Contractor(s): 
 
0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. 
10795 Hughes Road      
Cincinnati, OH 45251 
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ATTACHMENT TEN 
PART ONE:  COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 

COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 
 
The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall be 
as follows: 

Rumpke of Ohio 
Cincinnati Market Area 
*OAKS Item No: 18091 

 
100 to 2,000 PTEs 

 
2,001 to 10,000 

PTEs 

 
10,001 to 100,000 

PTEs 

 
Over 100,001 PTEs  

 
A. 

 
Price for site setup and 
demobilization   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 5,000.00 

 

 
$ 10,000.00 

 

 
$ 15,000.00 

 
B. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and process scrap tires   
 

 
$221.23 

 

 
$ 204.53 

 

 
$ 155.22 

 

 
$ 139.25 

 
C. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of scrap tires   
 

 
$283.57 

 

 
$ 266.87 

 

 
$ 217.55 

 

 
$ 201.58 

 
D. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of solid waste   
 

 
$73.72 

 

 
$ 73.72 

 

 
$ 73.72 

 

 
$ 73.72 

 
E. 

 
Price per acre to re-
seed/mulch areas   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

Must be U.S. Dollars 
Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror must 
provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range, they must 
mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.  
 
The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.  
 
Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in the 
work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation 
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other counties 
may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0. 

 

Additional Contingency Prices 
Only When Authorized 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off 
container 

 
$ 300.00 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ 25.00 

 
 
Per ton $ 100.00 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer 

 
$ No Bid 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ no bid 

 
 
Per ton $ No Bid 

 
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) 
feet in depth 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Removal of submerged tires in water 
up to six (6) feet deep 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Excavation of buried fire residuals up 
to a depth of six (6) feet 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
* To indicate a correction to the OAKS Item Number, effective with all orders issued on or after August 30, 2010. 
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CONTRACTOR INDEX 
 
 

CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: *BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-6 (02/28/11) 
 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.   TERMS:    Net 30 Days 
10795 Hughes Road 
Cincinnati, OH 45251 
 
Remit To Address 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. 
P.O. Box 538708 
Cincinnati, OH 45253 
 
CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Steven J. Sargent Telephone:       (740)-474-8833 
 Fax:            (740)-474-9218 
                                                                           E-Mail:            steve.sargent@rumpke.com 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

* To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number and the Contractor’s ID Number effective with all orders issued on or after 
August 30, 2010. 

mailto:steve.sargent@rumpke.com
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ATTACHMENT TEN 

PART ONE:  COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 
COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 

 
The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall be 
as follows: 

Rumpke of Ohio 
Northwest Market Area 
*OAKS Item No: 18092 

 
100 to 2,000 PTEs 

 
2,001 to 10,000 

PTEs 

 
10,001 to 100,000 

PTEs 

 
Over 100,001 PTEs  

 
A. 

 
Price for site setup and 
demobilization   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 5,000.00 

 

 
$ 10,000.00 

 

 
$ 15,000.00 

 
B. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and process scrap tires   
 

 
$ 221.23 

 

 
$ 204.53 

 

 
$ 155.22 

 

 
$ 139.25 

 
C. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of scrap tires   
 

 
$ 283.57 

 

 
$ 266.87 

 

 
$ 217.55 

 

 
$ 201.58 

 
D. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of solid waste   
 

 
$ 96.00 

 

 
$ 96.00 

 

 
$ 96.00 

 

 
$ 96.00 

 
E. 

 
Price per acre to re-
seed/mulch areas   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

Must be U.S. Dollars 
Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror must 
provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range, they must 
mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.  
 
The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.  
 
Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in the 
work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation 
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other counties 
may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0. 

 

Additional Contingency Prices 
Only When Authorized 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off 
container 

 
$ 550.00 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ 21.00 

 
 
Per ton $ 100.00 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer 

 
$ No Bid 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ no bid 

 
 
Per ton $ No Bid 

 
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) 
feet in depth 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Removal of submerged tires in water 
up to six (6) feet deep 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Excavation of buried fire residuals up 
to a depth of six (6) feet 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
* To indicate a correction to the OAKS Item Number, effective with all orders issued on or after August 30, 2010. 
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CONTRACTOR INDEX 
 
 

CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: *BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-6 (02/28/11) 
 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.   TERMS:    Net 30 Days 
10795 Hughes Road 
Cincinnati, OH 45251 
 
Remit To Address 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. 
P.O. Box 538708 
Cincinnati, OH 45253 
 
CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Steven J. Sargent Telephone:       (740)-474-8833 
 Fax:            (740)-474-9218 
                                                                           E-Mail:            steve.sargent@rumpke.com 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

* To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number and the Contractor’s ID Number effective with all orders issued on or after 
August 30, 2010. 

 

mailto:steve.sargent@rumpke.com
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ATTACHMENT TEN 
PART ONE:  COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 

COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 
 
The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall be 
as follows: 

Rumpke of Ohio 
Central Market Area 
*OAKS Item No: 18093 

 
100 to 2,000 PTEs 

 
2,001 to 10,000 

PTEs 

 
10,001 to 100,000 

PTEs 

 
Over 100,001 PTEs  

 
A. 

 
Price for site setup and 
demobilization   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 5,000.00 

 

 
$ 10,000.00 

 

 
$ 15,000.00 

 
B. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and process scrap tires   
 

 
$ 280.55 

 

 
$ 240.67 

 

 
$ 195.59 

 

 
$ 160.32 

 
C. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of scrap tires   
 

 
$ 339.05 

 

 
$ 306.91 

 

 
$ 261.83 

 

 
$ 226.55 

 
D. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of solid waste   
 

 
$ 101.54 

 

 
$ 101.54 

 

 
$ 101.54 

 

 
$ 101.54 

 
E. 

 
Price per acre to re-
seed/mulch areas   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

Must be U.S. Dollars 
Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror must 
provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range, they must 
mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.  
 
The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.  
 
Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in the 
work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation 
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other counties 
may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0. 

 

Additional Contingency Prices 
Only When Authorized 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off 
container 

 
$ 400.00 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ 25.00 

 
 
Per ton $ 120.00 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer 

 
$ No Bid 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ no bid 

 
 
Per ton $ No Bid 

 
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) 
feet in depth 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Removal of submerged tires in water 
up to six (6) feet deep 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Excavation of buried fire residuals up 
to a depth of six (6) feet 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
* To indicate a correction to the OAKS Item Number, effective with all orders issued on or after August 30, 2010. 
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CONTRACTOR INDEX 
 
 

CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-6 (02/28/11) 
 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.   TERMS:    Net 30 Days 
10795 Hughes Road 
Cincinnati, OH 45251 
 
Remit To Address 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. 
P.O. Box 538708 
Cincinnati, OH 45253 
 
CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Steven J. Sargent Telephone:       (740)-474-8833 
 Fax:            (740)-474-9218 
                                                                           E-Mail:            steve.sargent@rumpke.com 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

* To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number and the Contractor’s ID Number effective with all orders issued on or after 
August 30, 2010. 
 
 

mailto:steve.sargent@rumpke.com
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ATTACHMENT TEN 
PART ONE:  COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 

COST SUMMARY - COMPENSATION RATE TABLE 
 
The terms upon which the Contractor shall be compensated under this Contract for the Scrap Tire Site Assignments shall be 
as follows: 

Rumpke of Ohio 
Southeast Market Area 
*OAKS Item No: 18094 

 
100 to 2,000 PTEs 

 
2,001 to 10,000 

PTEs 

 
10,001 to 100,000 

PTEs 

 
Over 100,001 PTEs  

 
A. 

 
Price for site setup and 
demobilization   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 5,000.00 

 

 
$ 10,000.00 

 

 
$ 15,000.00 

 
B. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and process scrap tires   
 

 
$ 243.98 

 

 
$ 235.32 

 

 
$ 190.24 

 

 
$ 154.96 

 
C. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of scrap tires   
 

 
$ 289.87 

 

 
$ 295.05 

 

 
$ 249.97 

 

 
$ 214.70 

 
D. 

 
Price per ton to remove 
and dispose of solid waste   
 

 
$ 65.50 

 

 
$ 65.50 

 

 
$ 65.50 

 

 
$ 65.50 

 
E. 

 
Price per acre to re-
seed/mulch areas   
 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

 

 
$ 2,000.00 

Must be U.S. Dollars 
Dollar amounts must be filled in for the column for each size range bid. In order to evaluate this information, the Offeror must 
provide pricing in all rows for the size range they are proposing. If the Offeror is unable to bid a specific size range, they must 
mark “NO BID” in each row of that column.  
 
The State intends to award Multiple Contracts to provide the State options for timely removal of scrap tires.  
 
Sites may be at locations with either short or long transportation distances. The bid prices should reflect the difference in the 
work to be performed to remove the scrap tires. Use Part Two of Attachment Ten to account for different transportation 
distances. The cost factor for the county or counties of your business location should be 1.0. The cost factor for other counties 
may be less than, equal to, or more than 1.0. 

 

Additional Contingency Prices 
Only When Authorized 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a roll-off 
container 

 
$ 475.00 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ 15.00 

 
 
Per ton $ 100.00 

 
Drop-off and pick-up of a semi-trailer 

 
$ No Bid 

 
 
Weekly Rental  $ no bid 

 
 
Per ton $ No Bid 

 
Excavation of buried tires up to six (6) 
feet in depth 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Removal of submerged tires in water 
up to six (6) feet deep 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
Excavation of buried fire residuals up 
to a depth of six (6) feet 

 
Per ton 

 
$ No Bid 

 
Processing and disposal costs 
same as B, C, or D above 

 
* To indicate a correction to the OAKS Item Number, effective with all orders issued on or after August 30, 2010. 
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CONTRACTOR INDEX 
 
 

CONTRACTOR AND TERMS: *BID CONTRACT NO.: CSP900709-6 (02/28/11) 
 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc.   TERMS:    Net 30 Days 
10795 Hughes Road 
Cincinnati, OH 45251 
 
Remit To Address 

* 0000064450 
Rumpke of Ohio, Inc. 
P.O. Box 538708 
Cincinnati, OH 45253 
 
CONTRACTOR’S CONTACT: Mr. Steven J. Sargent Telephone:       (740)-474-8833 
 Fax:            (740)-474-9218 
                                                                           E-Mail:            steve.sargent@rumpke.com 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

* To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number and the Contractor’s ID Number effective with all orders issued on or after 
August 30, 2010. 
 
 

mailto:steve.sargent@rumpke.com
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SUMMARY OF AMENDMENTS 
 

Amendment 

Number 

Revision 

Date 
Description 

3 08/30/10 

To indicate a correction to the Bid Contract Number, the Contractor’s ID number and 
the OAKS Item Number for Rumpke of Ohio, effective with all orders issued on or 
after August 30, 2010. 

To  

2 07/01/10 
To indicate a mutually agreed upon extension to the Contract July 1, 2010 through 
February 28, 2011; with Liberty Tire Recycling and with Rumpke of Ohio effective with 
all orders issued on or after July 1, 2010. 

1 10/30/09 Add a category and cost for professional surveying for Liberty Tire. 

 
 
 
 


