STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING
VENDOR NO. - 1 2 | ] 4
VENDOR NAME ALTIVIA CORP. AQUA SCIENCE, INC ECOLAB, INC. 'QUES INDUSTRIES, INC.
DEL. OFFERED EST. - ]
LOC. BY STATE USAGE > OH MI OH
[ |
#1 - Hydrofluosilicic Acid 55gal | 24,750 NOBID I | 6100 | 150,975.000 NO BID
Drum Deposit AWARD
Alternate Packaging
1_#2 - Potassium Permanganate @# . 5,000 | NoBID o b - __NO BID __ J ) iNO BID
Alternate Packaging | i I
S | : _ ‘
o I |
#3 - Sodium Hydroxide Solution bulk 165,000] 0.149 24,585.000] | NO BID NO BID
~ Minimum Shipment AWARD | perwet b. | B
Comment perdrylb. | B Plus freight -
B | | oz of prod. Price Price Cost per
- | . per 100 Ibs. | per pound| peroz | 100# Laundry
#4 - Laundry Sour w/Blue Color 50# 570 NO BID 1 1.200 0.07500,  0.09000 NO BID
Alternate Packaging AWARD
#5 - Fabric Softener B 100 # 4,800 'NO BID 0.05 1.150 0.07188  0.00359 NO BID
| | AwarD -
#6 - Fabric Softener w/Bacteriostat 100 # 200 NO BID ‘ 5 10208 ~ 0.64363  3.21813 B ~ |INOBID
Comment \ AWARD
' T !
#7 - Sodium Hexametaphosphate 100# | 1| NO BID NOBID L NO BID NO BID
Alfemnate Packaging -
#8 - Aluminum Sulfate (Ground) 50 # 800] NO BID NO BID NO BID :NO BID
| = ——— = |
#9 - Aluminum Sulfate (Liquid) 55 gal 1 [NO BID NO BID _|[NO BID NO BID
Drum Deposit \ i
TR B [
#10 - Scale & Corrosion Inhibitor | -
15 gallon drum 1 |NO BID i $19.130 ~19.130 NOBID  |AWARD $10.600 10.600
30 gallon drum| 600 ENO BID $17.240 $10,344.000 B I NO BID AWARD $9.350  $5,610.000
65 gallo drum 1 [NO BID $16.193 $16.193 [NO BID AWARD $8.100 $8.100
_Average |
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STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

VENDOR NO. 1] 2 3 N 1 4
VENDOR NAME ALTIVIA CORP. AQUA SCIENCE, INC | ECOLAB, INC. QUES INDUSTRIES, INC.
DEL. OFFERED EST. -
LOC. BY STATE USAGE TX OH MI OH
| 1 1
#11 - Biocide A ' |
15 gallon drum 1 INO BID $18.240  $18.240 | NO BID AWARD $13.300 $13.300
30 gallon drum 1 INO BID $16.427 $16.427 NO BID AWARD  $12.050 $12.050
- 55 gallon drum 1 !NO BID $15.177| $15.177 NO BID AWARD $10.800 $10.800
Average : - I
#12 - Biocide B (Liquid) , i - I
30 gallon drum 1 [NO BID $20.734 - $20.734 NO BID AWARD $15.050 $15.050
o 55 gallon drum 1 [NO BID $19.405 $19.405 NO BID AWARD $13.800 $13.800
Average ) N | |
L Alternate Packaging - - 1
#13 - Biocide B (Pellets) 50 # 400 NO BID $4.792; $1,916.800 NO BID AWARD $4.750 | $1,900.000
#14 - Closed Recirc.Sys.Treat (Dry) | (. |
25 pound drum 750 'NO BID $2.729  $2,046.750| IR NO BID AWARD |  $1.550 | $1,162.500
50 pound drum B 1 'NO BID $2.042 $2.042 NOBID  |AwARD |  $1.350 $1.350
100 pound drum 1000 iNO BID $1.729 $1,729.000 INO BID AWARD $1.150 | $1,150.000
Average } I
Altemate Packaging B I B o
#15 - Closed Recirc.Sys. Treat (Liq) I 7 |
30 pound drum 250 NO BID $6.589  $1,647.250 NO BID | $7.500 | $1,875.000
Altemate Packaging B B Bid Withdrawal AWARD |
|
#16 - Sodium Hypochlorite-Soln 15 gal 225 NO BID NO BID NO BID 75 B NO BID
Drum Deposit o |
Minimum Shipment - | |
B Altemnate Packaging | | '
|
#17 - Calcium Hypochlorite-Gran. 100 # 1,500 NO BID NO BID ~____INOBID | NO BID
Drum Deposit| B B | B o
Minimum Shjpment l
|

/ )
[Z4 2
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STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

VENDOR NO. 1 2 , 3| 4
VENDOR NAME ~ ALTIVIA CORP. AQUA SCIENCE, INC ECOLAB, INC. i QUES INDUSTRIES, INC.
DEL. OFFERED EST. ) o )
LOC. BY STATE USAGE > OH MI OH
|
#18 - Ferric Chloride 55 gal 250 ~ INOBID NO BID NnoBD | _|[NOBID
Comment | |

Drum Deposit |
Minimum Shipment

#19 - Hydrated Lime

| 50 pound bag I INOBD NO BID , B NnoBD | NO BID
- bulk 640 B - o
#20 - Quick Lime bulk 1000 NO BID _ NO BID ~ [NoBID
#21 - CDM Neutralizing Amine 30 gal 1,800 ~ |[NOBID $11.954]  $11,954.000 : ~ |NoBID AWARD $10.850| $10,850.000
Alternate Packaging - | o B
|
#22 - Boiler Water Sludge Cond. 30 gal 28600l  NOBID | $5687 | $162,648.200 ' NO BID AWARD | $1.540| $44,044.000
Alternate Packaging
Minimum Shipment B | o
— — |
#23 - Neutralizing Amine 30 gal 1,500 NO BID $2.025 $3,037.500 * - NO BID AWARD $1.000| $1,500.000
L Altemate Packaging| B B ‘ i N
#24 - Catalyzed Sodium Sulfite 50 # 950 NOBID 0.992 942.400 NO BID AWARD $0.690 $655.500
Alternate Packaging
TOTAL AWARD $93,417.05 $24,585.000 68,832.050
AWARD: There will be one (1) award per line item to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed herein.

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, the state will: award one (1) award per line item to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder.
Line item award will be determined by multiplying the Unit Price which will include FOB Dest. Freight Prepaid by the estimated usage listed in the bid unless otherwise noted. Although there will be separate line item
awards made, bidders are eligible to receive awards of multiple line items providing he/she is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed within the line items.
Iltems that have dilution rates or more than one container size to be quoted will be evaluated as follows:

Items #4, #5 and #6: The bid will be evaluated by line item based on dilution rate price per one hundred (100) pounds of laundry. Where concentration level ranges are listed by a bidder for a product the evaluation
will be based on the maximum high range amount price per one hundred (100) pounds of laundry.

Items #3, #10, #11, #12, #14 and #19: The bid will be evaluated by line item based the average price quoted per gallon or pound. To determine the average price, the sum of the prices of all container sizes quoted
for a line item will be divided by the number of container sizes quoted.

P | | | | | | | ' | | |
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STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

VENDOR NO. 1] 2 3 _ 4
VENDOR NAME . ALTIVIA CORP. AQUA SCIENCE, INC ECOLAB, INC. o QUES INDUSTRIES, INC.
DEL. OFFERED EST. ] o N
LOC. BY STATE USAGE TX OH Mi OH
- | |
#18 - Ferric Chloride 55gal | 250 NO BID NO BID NOBID h B ”"NO BID
| Comment e o
Drum Deposit
Minimum Shipment -
[ | .
#19 - Hydrated Lime B | ] |
50 pound bag| 1 INO BID NO BID NO BID [ INO BID
bulk 640 l N | B
|
#20 - Quick Lime bulk 1000 INO BID . nosb | NO BID
#21 - CDM Neutralizing Amine 30 gal 1,800 NO BID $11.954  $11,954.000 NO BID AWARD $10.850 $10,850.000
Altemnate Packaging ] B |
#22 - Boiler Water Sludge Cond. 30 gal 28,600 NO BID $5.687 | $162,648.200 NO BID AWARD $1.540 $44,044.000
Altemate Packaging [ i
P Minimum Shipment i
#23 - Neutralizing Amine 30 gal 1,500 NO BID $2.025 $3,037.500 NO BID AWARD $1.000| $1,500.000
Altemale Packaging|
#24 - Catalyzed Sodium Sulfite |50 # 950 NO BID 0.992 942.400 ~ |NoBID AWARD $0.690|  $655.500
Alternate Packaging ‘ ‘
TOTAL AWARD $93,417.05 $24,585.00T) 1 1‘ 68,832.050
AWARD: There will be one (1) award per line item to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed herein. \
EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, the state will: award one (1) award per line item to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder.
Line item award will be determined by multiplying the Unit Price which will include FOB Dest. Freight Prepaid by the estimated usage listed in the bid unless otherwise noted. Although there will be separate line item
awards made, bidders are eligible to receive awards of multiple line items providing he/she is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed within the line items.
Items that have dilution rates or more than one container size to be quoted will be evaluated as follows:
Items #4, #5 and #6: The bid will be evaluated by line item based on dilution rate price per one hundred (100) pounds of laundry. Where concentration level ranges are listed by a bidder for a product the evaluation
will be based on the maximum high range amount price per one hundred (100) pounds of laundry.
Iltems #3, #10, #11, #12, #14 and #19: The bid will be evaluated by line item based the average price quoted per gallon or pound. To determine the average price, the sum of the prices of all container sizes quoted
for a line item will be divided py the number of container sizes quoted.
| \ | \ | | I \ |
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