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INDEX NO.: LDCO006

BID NO.: OT906315

VENDOR NO.

ANNUAL

1

2

3

4

VENDOR NAME

EST.

GlaxoSmithKline, LLC

H.D. Smith, LLC

Henry Schein, Inc.

Sanofi Pasteur

DEL. OFFERED

USAGE/

Per ITB

Per ITB

Per ITB

Per ITB

LOC. BY STATE

UOM

EA

PA

OH

NY

PA

ITEM #

Description

Buy
Bid Price | America | Extended Price

Bid Price

Extended
Price

Buy
America

Extended

Bid Price Price

Bid Price

Extended
Price

25713

Influenza virus vaccine, inactivated, quadrivalent, Adult Formulation, V4, licensed for
administration to ages 6 months and over, to include the antigens as formulated with the
Centers for Disease Control and Prevention, prevention and control of influenza,
recommendations of the advisory committee on immunization practices (ACIP) for the 2015
2016 year,including federal excise tax (FET)

5 ml vial
containing 10
total doses.
Each dose is
5ml

No Bid

No Bid

$14.60 $14.60

$15.69

$15.69

Award

25714

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Quadrivalent, Adult Formulation, IIV4, licensed for
administration to ages 6 months and over, to include the Antigens as formulated in
accordance with the Centers or Disease Control and Prevention (CDC), prevention and
control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory Committee on Immunization
Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal Excise Tax (FET).

Single Dose
0.5ml

5,000

$155.90 | $165.25 $826,270.00|

$15.30

$16.22 $81,090.00

$15.40 $77,000.00|

$16.66

$83,300.00

$15.59/dose

Buy America

Award

25715

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Quadrivalent, Adult No Preservative Formulation, 1IV4,
licensed for administration to ages 18 years and over, to include the Antigens as formulated
in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control and
Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory
Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal
Excise Tax (FET).

Single Dose
0.5ml

280

$155.90 | $165.25 $43,652.00|

$15.30

$16.22 $4,541.04

$15.40 $4,312.00

$15.59/dose

Buy America

Award

No Bid

25716

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Quadrivalent, Adult Formulation, IIV4, licensed for
administration to ages 18 years and over, to include the Antigens as formulated in
accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention
(CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory Committee
on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal Excise Tax
(FET).

5 ml vial
containing 10
total doses.
Each dose is
5ml

1,970

$146.20 | $154.97 $305,294.84

$14.30

$15.16 $29,861.26]

$14.60 $28,762.00

$14.62/dose

Buy America

Award

No Bid

25717

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Quadrivalent, Pediatric No Preservative Formulation,
14, licensed for administration to ages 6 — 35 months, to include the Antigens as
formulated in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control
and Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the
Advisory Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including
Federal Excise Tax (FET).

Single Dose
0.25 ml

5,000

No Bid

No Bid

$20.25 | $101,250.00

$21.70

$108,500.00

Award

25719

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Live Attenuated, Quadrivalent, Intranasal Spray, LAIV4, licensed
for administration to ages 2-49 years, to include the Antigens as formulated in accordance
with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC),
prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory Committee on
Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal Excise Tax (FET).

Single use
spray .2 ml

10,010

No Bid

$23.79

$238,137.90

Award

No Bid

No Bid

17902

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Trivalent, Adult High-Dose Preservative Free
Formulation, 1IV3, licensed for administration to ages 65 years and over, to include the
Antigens as formulated in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for
Disease Control and Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza,
Recommendations of the Advisory Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the
2015-2016 year, including Federal Excise Tax (FET). (Example: SanofiPasteur Fluzone
High-Dose, or equivalent).

Single Dose
0.5ml

No Bid

No Bid

$30.90 $92.70

$31.98

$95.94|

Award

21043

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Trivalent, Adult Intradermal Preservative Free
Formulation, 1IV3, licensed for administration to ages 18-64 years, to include the Antigens
as formulated in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control
and Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the
Advisory Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including
Federal Excise Tax (FET). (Example: Sanofi Pasteur Fluzone Intradermal, or equivalent).
Note: This utilizes a very small needle, not a jet injector.

Single Dose
0.1ml

No Bid

No Bid

$17.70 $17.70

$19.31

$19.31]

Award

25711

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Recombinant, Trivalent, Adult Formulation, RIV3, licensed for
administration to ages 18 — 49 years, to include the Antigens as formulated in accordance
with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control and Prevention (CDC),
prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory Committee on
Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal Excise Tax (FET).
(Example: Protein Sciences Flublok, or equivalent). The expiration date shown on the label
shall be no less than 14 weeks after the delivery receipt date.

Single Dose
0.5ml

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

25712

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Trivalent, Adult Formulation, Cell-Based ccllV3,
licensed for administration to ages 18 years and over, to include the Antigens as formulated
in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control and
Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the Advisory
Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including Federal
Excise Tax (FET). (Example: Novartis Flucelvax, or equivalent).

Single Dose
0.5 ml

No Bid

$9.25

$9.25|

$9.50 $9.50]

Award

No Bid

25718

Influenza Virus Vaccine, Inactivated, Quadrivalent, Adult Preservative Free Formulation,
1IV4, licensed for administration to ages 4 years and over, to include the Antigens as
formulated in accordance with the recommendations of the Centers for Disease Control
and Prevention (CDC), prevention and control of Influenza, Recommendations of the
Advisory Committee on Immunization Practices (ACIP) for the 2015-2016 year, including
Federal Excise Tax (FET).

Single Dose
0.5ml

$155.90 | $165.25 $165.254]

$15.30

$16.22 $16.22]

$15.40 $15.40

$15.59/dose

Buy America

Award

No Bid

Award: The contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by line item.

Evaluation: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders". In
addition, the State will multiply the unit cost by the estimated usage to arrive at an extended price for
each line item. If the estimated usage is unknown, then one (1) will be used as the estimated usage,

for calculation purposes only.
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