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INDEX NO.:   OPI019 BID NO.:   OT905813 - CATTLE FEED SUPPLEMENTS AND RATIONS

VENDOR NO. 6 MONTH

VENDOR NAME EST.

DEL. OFFERED USAGE/

LOC. BY STATE UOM PER UoM

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price

ITEM/Description &/or NIGP #

Item 1 Sodium Bicarbonate - 50 Lb. Bag

Item 1a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb. 1,900 $0.223 $423.700 $0.216 $410.400 $0.256 $486.400 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1b. Lancaster, Ohio (SCI) Lb. 5,100 $0.220 $1,122.000 $0.214 $1,091.400 $0.256 $1,305.600 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1c. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb. 500 $0.230 $115.000 $0.218 $109.000 $0.256 $128.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1d. Lima, Ohio (ACI) Lb. 500 $0.230 $115.000 $0.228 $114.000 $0.256 $128.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1e. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb. 1,800 $0.223 $401.400 $0.220 $396.000 $0.256 $460.800 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1f. Mansfield, Ohio (ManCI Lb. 500 $0.230 $115.000 $0.211 $105.500 $0.256 $128.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1g. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb. 3,300 $0.224 $739.200 $0.212 $699.600 $0.256 $844.800 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 1h. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb. 2,200 $0.223 $490.600 $0.213 $468.600 $0.256 $563.200 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2. Salt 97% to 99% Pure 50 Lb Block

Item 2a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb. 13,500 $0.115 $1,552.500 $0.121 $1,633.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2b. Lancaster, Ohio (SCI) Lb. 10,000 $0.120 $1,200.000 $0.119 $1,190.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2c. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb. 13,500 $0.120 $1,620.000 $0.123 $1,660.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2d. Lima, Ohio (ACI) Lb. 10,000 $0.140 $1,400.000 $0.131 $1,310.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2e. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb. 27,000 $0.120 $3,240.000 $0.125 $3,375.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2f. Mansfield, Ohio (ManCI Lb. 15,000 $0.140 $2,100.000 $0.116 $1,740.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2g. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb. 13,500 $0.125 $1,687.500 $0.117 $1,579.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 2h. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb. 27,000 $0.125 $3,375.000 $0.118 $3,186.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 3. Dried Molasses Supplement - 50 Lb. Bag

Item 3a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb, 2,500 $0.291 $727.500 $0.287 $717.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 3b. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb, 2,500 $0.296 $740.000 $0.289 $722.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 3c.. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb, 5,400 $0.291 $1,571.400 $0.292 $1,576.800 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 3d. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb, 2,500 $0.291 $727.500 $0.283 $707.500 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 3e. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb, 5,400 $0.291 $1,571.400 $0.285 $1,539.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

 

Item 4.  Milk Replacer - 50 Lb. Bag

Item 4a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb, 4,500 No Bid $0.000 $1.178 $5,301.000 $1.257 $5,656.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD
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AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

Austin Agri Services, LLC

1

5 Days ARO

3

AWARD

AWARD

 

 

 

Vigortone Ag Products, Inc.  

Ohio

5 Days ARO

Ohio

7

   

 

62

Kalmbach Feeds, Inc.

5 Days ARO

Ohio  

54
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Austin Agri Services, LLC

1

5 Days ARO

3

 

 

 

Vigortone Ag Products, Inc.  

Ohio

5 Days ARO

Ohio

7

   

 

62

Kalmbach Feeds, Inc.

5 Days ARO

Ohio  

54

Item 4b. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb, 4,500 No Bid $0.000 $1.174 $5,283.000 $1.257 $5,656.500 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 4c. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb, 9,000 No Bid $0.000 $1.176 $10,584.000 $1.257 $11,313.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 5. OPI/ODRC London Complete Calf Ration Premix Pellets - 50 Lb. Bags

Item 5a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb. 37,500 No Bid $0.000 $0.256 $9,600.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 5b. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb. 37,500 No Bid $0.000 $0.258 $9,675.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 5c.. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb. 75,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.260 $19,500.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 5d. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb. 37,500 No Bid $0.000 $0.252 $9,450.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 5e. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb. 75,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.253 $18,975.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 6. OPI/ODRC London Protein Blend #2 Bulk Delivery

Item 6a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Ton 50 No Bid $0.000 $10.000 $500.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 6b. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Ton 50 No Bid $0.000 $14.000 $700.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 6c.. London, Ohio (LoCI) Ton 100 No Bid $0.000 $19.000 $1,900.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 6d. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Ton 50 No Bid $0.000 $2.000 $100.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 6e. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Ton 100 No Bid $0.000 $5.000 $500.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 7. OPI/ODRC London Heifer Mineral 011913 - 50 lb. Bags

Item 7a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb. 4,400 No Bid $0.000 $0.376 $1,654.400 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 7b. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb. 4,400 No Bid $0.000 $0.378 $1,663.200 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 7c.. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb. 8,800 No Bid $0.000 $0.380 $3,344.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 7d. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb. 4,400 No Bid $0.000 $0.372 $1,636.800 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 7e. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb. 8,800 No Bid $0.000 $0.373 $3,282.400 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 8. OPI/ODRC London Dry 011813 - 50 Lb. Bags

Item 8a. Chillicothe, Ohio (CCI) Lb. 7,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.365 $2,555.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 8b. Lebanon, Ohio (LeCI) Lb. 7,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.367 $2,569.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 8c.. London, Ohio (LoCI) Lb. 14,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.370 $5,180.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 8d. Marion, Ohio (MCI) Lb. 7,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.361 $2,527.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

Item 8e. Orient, Ohio (PCI) Lb. 14,000 No Bid $0.000 $0.363 $5,082.000 No Bid $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000 $0.000

 

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD ALL

AWARD ALL

AWARD ALL

CONTRACT AWARD:  A Contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by 

individual Bid line item.  Bidders may bid on as many individual Bid line items desired across all farm 

locations. The same Bidder may be awarded a contract for more than one individual Bid line item. 

AWARD ALL

EVALUATION:  Each individual Bid line item will be evaluated using the estimated six month use per 

UoM provided, multiplied by Bid Markup Price per ton or Bid Price per pound as applicable to the 

individual Bid line item to determine the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for each individual 

Bid line item.  Additional prices are requested for delivery of bulk items in bottom hopper and auger 

delivery equipment and for pick-up at the Bidder’s location however such prices will not be part of the 

bid evaluation.  Nonetheless Bidders are encouraged to offer bids on all non-evaluated items. 

Allowance prices are requested for customer pick-up of individual items however such allowances will 

not be a part of the bid evaluation.  Bidders are encouraged to offer pricing on all non-evaluated 

allowances. 
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