STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

INDEX NO.: LDC023 BID NO.: 0T903214 PREVENTIVE ELEVATOR MAINTENANCE-DAS OWNED OFFICE TOWERS \ \
VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3 4
VENDOR NAME EST. Fujitec America Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Thyssen Krupp Elevator
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOoM EA
Bid Price |Extended Price] Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price
ITEM/Description &/or NIGP #
Rhodes Scheduled Service Cost
1 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
2 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
3 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
4 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
5 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
6 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
7 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $370.00 $4,440.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
8 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
9 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
10 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
11 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
12 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
13 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
14 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
15 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
16 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
17 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
18 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
19 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
20 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
21 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $650.00 $7,800.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
22 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 $650.00 $7,800.00 $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
24 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 $125.00 $1,500.00 $113.00 $1,356.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
25 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 $125.00 $1,500.00 $113.00 $1,356.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
DW26 MO 12 $100.00 $1,200.00 $40.00 $480.00 $83.00 $996.00 $51.62 $619.44
DOWN MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $774.00 $9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
upP MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 $1,000.00 $12,000.00 $774.00 $9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
Rhodes Straight Time HR 10 $155.00 $1,550.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $175.00 $1,750.00 $140.00 $1,400.00
Rhodes Overtime HR 10 $235.00 $2,350.00 $155.00 $1,550.00 $297.00 $2,970.00 $280.00 $2,800.00
Rhodes Five Year Full Load Test EA 1 $975.00 $975.00 $350.00 $350.00 | $1,632.00 $1,632.00 $0.00 $0.00
Rhodes Replacement $1,000 x % of Mark Up EA 1,000 15% $1,150.00 25% $1,250.00 10% $1,100.00 20% $1,200.00
SubTotal $103,345.00 $156,310.00 $144,840.00) $99,182.64
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3 4
VENDOR NAME EST. Fujitec America Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Thyssen Krupp Elevator
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOoM EA
Riffe Scheduled Services Cost
1 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
2 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
3 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
4 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
5 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
6 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
7 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
8 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
9 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
10 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
11 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
12 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $436.00 $5,232.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
13 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $478.00 5,736.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
14 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $478.00 5,736.00 $289.07 $3,468.84
15 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $301.00 3,612.00 $247.77 $2,973.24
16 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $113.00 1,356.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
17 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $600.00 7,200.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
18 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $301.00 3,612.00 $247.77 $2,973.24
19 MO 12 $300.00 $3,600.00 NO BID $301.00 3,612.00 $247.77 $2,973.24
20 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $113.00 1,356.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
21 MO 12 $100.00 $1,200.00 NO BID $301.00 3,612.00 $247.77 $2,973.24
22 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
23 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
24 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
25 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
26 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
27 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
28 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
29 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
30 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
31 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
32 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
33 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
34 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
35 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
36 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
37 MO 12 $555.00 $6,660.00 NO BID $774.00 9,288.00 $598.79 $7,185.48
38 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $996.00 11,952.00 $103.24 $1,238.88
39 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $406.00 4,872.00 $34.41 $412.92
40 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $397.00 4,764.00 $34.41 $412.92
41 MO 12 $150.00 $1,800.00 NO BID $397.00 4,764.00 $34.41 $412.92
Riffe Straight Time HR 10 $155.00 $1,550.00 NO BID $175.00 1,750.00 $140.00 $1,400.00
Riffe Overtime HR 10 $235.00 $2,350.00 NO BID $297.00 2,970.00 $280.00 $2,800.00
Riffe Five Year Full Load Test EA 1 $975.00 $975.00 NO BID $1,632.00 1,632.00 $0.00 $0.00
Riffe Replacement $1,000 x % of Mark Up EA 1,000 15% $1,150.00 NO BID 10% $1,100.00 20% $1,200.00
SubTotal $189,385.000 $0.00 $281,028.000 $187,018.680
Grand Total Award| $292,730.000 $156,310.000 $425,868.000 $286,201.320
BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY: REC. FOR APPROVAL BY: APPROVED BY:
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STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING

VENDOR NO. ANNUAL 1 2 3 4
VENDOR NAME EST. Fujitec America Oracle Elevator Schindler Elevator Thyssen Krupp Elevator
DEL. OFFERED USAGE/
LOC. BY STATE UOoM EA
\ \ DQ DQ

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article |-17 of the “Instructions to Bidders”. In addition, the state will add the following:

@ The product of the monthly, annual and quarterly cost for scheduled service for each unit times the number of months needed to arrive at an

@ the costs of 10 hours of Straight-Time and

© the costs of 10 hours of Overtime, plus

@ the Five Year Full Load Test, and

that to the $1000.00.

® the State will calculate the product of $1000.00 for Replacement Parts and Components Mark-Up Percentage times the percentage bid, and add

5)The sum of these five totals will arrive at the total to be evaluated for this Bid.

Failure to bid all items for a facility may result in the bidder being deemed not responsive for that facility.

BIDS TABULATED BY: REVIEWED BY:

REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:

APPROVED BY:
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