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INDEX NO.:   OPI109

VENDOR NO.
VENDOR NAME EST.
DEL. OFFERED 6 MONTHS
LOC. BY STATE UoM USAGE/

Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price Bid Price Extended Price
ITEM/Description &/or NIGP #

Soybean Meal Chillicothe, OH  Bulk (CCI) Ton 125 $38.000 $4,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $64.000 $8,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Lancaster, OH Bulk (SCI) Ton 50 $40.000 $2,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $61.000 $3,050.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Lebanon, OH Bulk (LeCI) Ton 100 $38.000 $3,800.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $68.000 $6,800.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Lima, OH Bulk (ACI) Ton 150 $38.000 $5,700.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $84.000 $12,600.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal London, OH Bulk (LoCI) Ton 190 $37.000 $7,030.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $73.000 $13,870.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Mansfield, OH Bulk (ManCI) Ton 125 $37.000 $4,625.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $54.000 $6,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Marion, OH Bulk (MCI) Ton 125 $37.000 $4,625.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $56.000 $7,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Soybean Meal Orient, OH Bulk (PCI) Ton 125 $36.000 $4,500.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $59.000 $7,375.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000

Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Ton 150 $80.000 $12,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Lancaster, OH (SCI) Ton 100 $80.000 $8,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Ton 100 $80.000 $8,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Lima, OH (ACI) Ton 150 $80.000 $12,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk London, OH (LoCI) Ton 175 $80.000 $14,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Mansfield, OH (ManCI) Ton 125 $80.000 $10,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Marion, OH (MCI) Ton 125 $80.000 $10,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
Corn Gluten Feed Pelleted Bulk Orient, OH (PCI) Ton 125 $80.000 $10,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000

OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags, Chilicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.220 $11,000.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags, Lancaster, OH (SCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.219 $10,950.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 10,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.222 $2,220.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $2,620.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Lima, OH (ACI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.230 $11,500.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 60,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.225 $13,500.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $15,720.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Mansfield, OH (ManCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.215 $10,750.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.216 $2,700.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $3,275.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 25 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.218 $2,725.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $3,275.000

OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags, Chilicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $15,600.000 $0.397 $19,850.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.213 $10,650.000 $0.280 $14,000.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags, Lancaster, OH (SCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $15,600.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.211 $10,550.000 $0.283 $14,150.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 10,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $3,120.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.215 $2,150.000 $0.284 $2,840.000 $0.262 $2,620.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Lima, OH (ACI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $15,600.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.223 $11,150.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 60,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $18,720.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.217 $13,020.000 $0.280 $16,800.000 $0.262 $15,720.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Mansfield, OH (ManCI) Lb. 50,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $15,600.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.208 $10,400.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.262 $13,100.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $3,900.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.209 $2,612.500 $0.290 $3,625.000 $0.262 $3,275.000
OPI/ODRC Beef Feed Base R1000 50 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.312 $3,900.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.210 $2,625.000 $0.280 $3,500.000 $0.262 $3,275.000

OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags, Lancaster, OH (SCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.470 $11,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.360 $9,000.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.370 $9,250.000
OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags, Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.470 $11,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.363 $9,075.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.370 $9,250.000
OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 25 Lb. Bags, Mansfield, OH (ManCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.470 $11,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.356 $8,900.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.370 $9,250.000

OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags, Lancaster, OH (SCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.450 $11,250.000 $0.427 $10,675.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.347 $8,675.000 $0.458 $11,450.000 $0.370 $9,250.000
OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags, Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.450 $11,250.000 $0.427 $10,675.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.351 $8,775.000 $0.459 $11,475.000 $0.370 $9,250.000
OPI/ODRC Brood Cow Mineral 50 Lb. Bags, Mansfield, OH (ManCI) Lb. 25,000 $0.450 $11,250.000 $0.427 $10,675.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.344 $8,600.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.370 $9,250.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags, Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.556 $13,900.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.425 $10,625.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $9,750.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags, Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 37,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.427 $16,012.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $14,625.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags, Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 37,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.421 $15,787.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $14,625.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags, London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 62,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.429 $26,812.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $24,375.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 25 Lb. Bags, Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 62,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.422 $26,375.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $24,375.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags, Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $11,550.000 $0.531 $13,275.000 $0.510 $12,750.000 $0.412 $10,300.000 $0.444 $11,100.000 $0.390 $9,750.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags, Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 37,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $17,325.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.510 $19,125.000 $0.414 $15,525.000 $0.449 $16,837.500 $0.390 $14,625.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags, Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 37,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $17,325.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.510 $19,125.000 $0.408 $15,300.000 $0.454 $17,025.000 $0.390 $14,625.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags, London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 62,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $28,875.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.490 $30,625.000 $0.417 $26,062.500 $0.440 $27,500.000 $0.390 $24,375.000
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AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

BID NO.:  OT902713 - MATERIALS FOR MIXING CATTLE FEED RATIONS

Agri Services, LLC
1

5 Working Days ARO

3

OH
5 Working Days ARO

OH

Cherry Fork Farm Supply Heritage Cooperative
7

Vigortone Ag Products
5 Working Days ARO

Trupointe Cooperative
5 Working Days ARO5 Working Days ARO

5
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5 Working Days ARO
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5 Working Days ARO
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Agri Services, LLC
1

5 Working Days ARO

3

OH
5 Working Days ARO

OH

Cherry Fork Farm Supply Heritage Cooperative
7

Vigortone Ag Products
5 Working Days ARO

Trupointe Cooperative
5 Working Days ARO5 Working Days ARO

5
Kalmbach Feeds, Inc.

62
Cargill

5 Working Days ARO
New York State OH

5 Working Days ARO
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4

OHOH
OPI/ODRC Dairy Lactation Base R428 50 Lb. Bags, Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 62,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.462 $28,875.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.490 $30,625.000 $0.410 $25,625.000 $0.444 $27,750.000 $0.390 $24,375.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.592 $7,400.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.390 $4,875.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.392 $4,900.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.386 $4,825.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.395 $7,900.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.417 $8,340.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 25 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.388 $7,760.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.417 $8,340.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.459 $5,737.500 $0.567 $7,087.500 $0.515 $6,437.500 $0.378 $4,725.000 $0.468 $5,850.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.459 $5,737.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.515 $6,437.500 $0.380 $4,750.000 $0.474 $5,925.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.459 $5,737.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.515 $6,437.500 $0.374 $4,675.000 $0.478 $5,975.000 $0.417 $5,212.500
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.459 $9,180.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.495 $9,900.000 $0.382 $7,640.000 $0.468 $9,360.000 $0.417 $8,340.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Heifer Base R1600 50 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.459 $9,180.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.495 $9,900.000 $0.375 $7,500.000 $0.468 $9,360.000 $0.417 $8,340.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.760 $9,500.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.518 $6,475.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.520 $6,500.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.514 $6,425.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.522 $10,440.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.558 $11,160.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 25 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.515 $10,300.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.558 $11,160.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.597 $7,462.500 $0.734 $9,175.000 $0.680 $8,500.000 $0.505 $6,312.500 $0.628 $7,850.000 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.597 $7,462.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.680 $8,500.000 $0.507 $6,337.500 $0.633 $7,912.500 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 12,500 NO BID $0.000 $0.597 $7,462.500 NO BID $0.000 $0.680 $8,500.000 $0.501 $6,262.500 $0.638 $7,975.000 $0.558 $6,975.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.597 $11,940.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.660 $13,200.000 $0.510 $10,200.000 $0.628 $12,560.000 $0.558 $11,160.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Base R2160 50 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 20,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.597 $11,940.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.660 $13,200.000 $0.503 $10,060.000 $0.628 $12,560.000 $0.558 $11,160.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mix Bulk Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Ton 50 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $730.000 $36,500.000 $107.000 $5,350.000 $55.000 $2,750.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mix Bulk Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Ton 50 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $107.000 $5,350.000 $59.000 $2,950.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mix Bulk Marion, OH (MCI) Ton 100 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $107.000 $10,700.000 $64.000 $6,400.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mix Bulk London, OH (LoCI) Ton 50 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $107.000 $5,350.000 $47.000 $2,350.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mix Bulk Orient, OH (PCI) Ton 100 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000 $107.000 $10,700.000 $50.000 $5,000.000 NO BID $0.000 NO BID $0.000

OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 $0.424 $10,600.000 $0.539 $13,475.000 $0.491 $12,275.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 $0.426 $10,650.000 $0.543 $13,575.000 $0.491 $12,275.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 25,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $14,750.000 $0.420 $10,500.000 $0.549 $13,725.000 $0.491 $12,275.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 45,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $26,550.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $26,550.000 $0.429 $19,305.000 $0.539 $24,255.000 $0.491 $22,095.000
OPI/ODRC Dairy Cow Lactating Mineral 50 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 45,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $26,550.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.590 $26,550.000 $0.422 $18,990.000 $0.539 $24,255.000 $0.491 $22,095.000

OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 by-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Chillicothe, OH (CCI) Lb. 5,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.768 $3,840.000 NO BID $0.000 $1.010 $5,050.000 $0.740 $3,700.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.860 $4,300.000
OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 by-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Lebanon, OH (LeCII) Lb. 5,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.768 $3,840.000 NO BID $0.000 $1.010 $5,050.000 $0.742 $3,710.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.860 $4,300.000
OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 by-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Marion, OH (MCI) Lb. 5,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.768 $3,840.000 NO BID $0.000 $1.010 $5,050.000 $0.736 $3,680.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.860 $4,300.000
OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 by-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags London, OH (LoCI) Lb. 9,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.768 $6,912.000 NO BID $0.000 $1.010 $9,090.000 $0.745 $6,705.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.860 $7,740.000
OPI/ODRC Energy Booster 100 by-Pass Fat 50 Lb. Bags Orient, OH (PCI) Lb. 9,000 NO BID $0.000 $0.768 $6,912.000 NO BID $0.000 $1.010 $9,090.000 $0.738 $6,642.000 NO BID $0.000 $0.860 $7,740.000

AWARD

DISQUALIFY

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

AWARD

CONTRACT AWARD:  A Contract will be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by individual Bid line item.  Bidders may 
bid on as many individual Bid line items desired across all farm locations. The same Bidder may be awarded a contract for more than one 
individual Bid line item. 

EVALUATION:  Each individual Bid line item will be evaluated using the annual usage provided, multiplied by Bid Markup Price per ton or Bid 
Price per pound as applicable to the individual Bid line item.  Additional prices are requested for delivery of bulk items in bottom hopper and 
auger delivery equipment however such prices will not be part of the bid evaluation. Allowance prices are requested for customer pick-up of 
individual items however such allowances will not be a part of the bid evaluation.
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