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BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

Vendor No.
Vendor Name
Location by State University Heights, OH Delaware, OH

Category 1 of 4
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Temp Probe Data Logger - LCD Each 1,000 $222.00 $222,000.00 Each 1,000 $129.36 $129,360.00
Temp Probe Data Logger Each 1,000 $328.25 $328,250.00 Each 1,000 $245.70 $245,700.00
Data Pad Each 10 $199.00 $1,990.00 Each 10 $159.00 $1,590.00
Lithium Battery – 3.6 volt 1/2AA 
Lithium battery with custom collar 
seal on positive end.

Each 2,000 $3.83 $7,660.00 Each 2,000 $3.28 $6,560.00

Category 1 of 4 Awards $559,900.00 $383,210.00

AWARD

BID NO.:  OT901715       Bid No.: OT901715       Opening Date: 11/19/14    Immunization Program Equipment, Service and Supplies              
Vendor No. Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Vendor Name Cair Imports, LLC Supply Link, Inc. 
Location by State University Heights, Delaware, OH

Category 2 of 4
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Data Logger Thermometer Each 2000 No bid No bid Each 2000 $27.50 $55,000.00
Laser Configuration Each 5 No bid No bid Each 5 $243.60 $1,218.00
NIST Calibration Each 20 No bid No bid Each 20 $164.00 $3,280.00

Category 2 of 4 Awards No bid $59,498.00

AWARD

BID NO.:  OT901715       Bid No.: OT901715       Opening Date: 11/19/14    Immunization Program Equipment, Service and Supplies              
Vendor No. Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Vendor Name Cair Imports, LLC Supply Link, Inc. 
Location by State University Heights, Delaware, OH

Category 3 of 4
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Data Logger Thermometer YR 1 No bid No bid Each $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

Category 3 of 4 Awards No bid $1,500.00

AWARD

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the estimated annual usage of each 
item by its corresponding unit price and then add these totals together for each category. Although there will be separate category awards made, bidders are eligible to 
receive awards of mutliple categories providing he/she is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed within the  
categories. Failure to bid all items in a category may result in the bidder being deemed as not-responsive.

CONTRACT AWARD: The Contract wil be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by categoty. Each category total will be determined by multiplying the  
unit price by the estimated usage listd in the bid and then adding each of the totals together to arrive at a total for each category. Failure to bid all items in a category may 
result in the bidder being deemed not responsive.

BID NO.:  OT901715       Bid No.: OT901715       Opening Date: 11/19/14    Immunization Program Equipment, Service and Supplies              
Bidder 1
Cair Imports, LLC

Bidder 2
Supply Link, Inc. 



STATE OF OHIO, DAS, OFFICE OF STATE PURCHASING Page 2

BIDS TABULATED BY:_____________________    REVIEWED BY:_____________________    REC. FOR APPROVAL BY:_____________________    APPROVED BY:_____________________

Vendor No.
Vendor Name
Location by State University Heights, OH Delaware, OH

Bidder 1
Cair Imports, LLC

Bidder 2
Supply Link, Inc. 

BID NO.:  OT901715       Bid No.: OT901715       Opening Date: 11/19/14    Immunization Program Equipment, Service and Supplies              
Vendor No. Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Vendor Name Cair Imports, LLC Supply Link, Inc. 
Location by State University Heights, OH Delaware, OH

Category 4 of 4
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price
Unit of 

Measure
Estimated Qty 

Per Year Bid Price Per Unit Extended Price

8” LG x 6” W x 4” D Each 500 No bid No bid Each 500 $4.56 $2,280.00
13” L x 13” W x 12” D Each 100 No bid No bid Each 100 $9.87 $987.00
19” L x 12” W x 16” D Each 100 No bid No bid Each 100 $16.86 $1,686.00
8” L x 6” W x 9” D Each 500 No bid No bid Each 500 $2.66 $1,330.00
17” L x 10” W x 12” D Each 100 No bid No bid Each 100 $8.16 $816.00
22” L x 16” W x 16” D Each 50 No bid No bid Each 50 $9.17 $458.50
12” L x 10” W x 7” D Each 500 No bid No bid Each 500 $8.59 $4,295.00
19” L  x 12” W x 12” D Each 50 No bid No bid Each 50 $8.77 $438.50
25” L x 16” W x 12” D Each 50 No bid No bid Each 50 $22.76 $1,138.00
Mylar Gel Refrigerants – 5 Mil Package Thickness. Polar Tech or equal.
6 ounce Box/96 10 No bid No bid Box/96 10 $29.87 $298.70
12 ounce Box/48 20 No bid No bid Box/48 20 $27.58 $551.60
24 ounce Box/24 40 No bid No bid Box/24 40 $14.84 $593.60

Category 4 of 4 Awards No bid $14,872.90

AWARD

EVALUATION: Bids will be evaluated in accordance with Article I-17 of the "Instructions to Bidders". In addition, the state will multiply the estimated annual usage of each 
item by its corresponding unit price and then add these totals together for each category. Although there will be separate category awards made, bidders are eligible to 
receive awards of mutliple categories providing he/she is the lowest responsive and responsible bidder meeting all bid specifications and requirements listed within the  

CONTRACT AWARD: The Contract wil be awarded to the lowest responsive and responsible bidder by categoty. Each category total will be determined by multiplying the  
unit price by the estimated usage listd in the bid and then adding each of the totals together to arrive at a total for each category. Failure to bid all items in a category may  
result in the bidder being deemed not responsive.

Styrene Shipping Containers with Lids for Vaccines – 1 ½” Wall Thickness  -  Polar Tech or equal. Storage capacity of interior space cannot be less than that specified. However, sizes 
offered may be larger by no more than one (1) inch in any direction. Sizes Required:

categories. Failure to bid all items in a category may result in the bidder being deemed as not-responsive.


	TAB

